
THE 
ANDHRA PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSLMBLlf 

DEBATES 

OFFICIAL REPCHf 

? ' — ' —— 

Pra&yA ^t^w&^y. 

ANDHRA PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLE 
Saturday, the 6th M y , 1968. 

The House met a! Half-P<*st Eight of the Ctock. 

( Mr. Speaker m the Chair) 

ORAL ANSWERS TO QUESTIONS. 

SCARCITY 0? SUGAR 

2490— 

* 3650 Q — Sarvasn S Vemayya and Ahmed Hussam (Put by 
Sr iK. GovmdaRao) (Anakapalli).—Will the hon R%mts$er for 
Revenue and Civil Supplies be pleased to state -

(a) whether the Government have taken notice of the serious 
sugar supply position m the State and if so, action contemplated to 
relieve it, 

(b) the number of hotels, sweetmeat shops, bakerips and 
pepperment factories which are closed aRer partial de-control of sugar 
m the twin cities of Hyderabad and Secunderabad, 

(c) how far the partial decontrol of sugar to the extent of 60% 
is useful to the public m the State now, and 

(d) whether it is a fact that this Government is pressing th 
Government of India to decontrol sugar completely, and if so, the 
reasons therefor ? 

The Minuter for Revenue and Civil supphes Sri V B. Raju) '— 
(a) Yes, Sir, The matter was taken up with the Government of 
India for enhancing the monthly quota of sugar but, they have not 
agreed to it on the ground that other States may seek similar enhance-

^ meat which is equally diai<nlt to meet the situation* , . 

J, No. 1§ 3i9 ' * ^ ' 



226 6th July, 196S, Oral \nswers to Qujstioi^. 

(b) Hotels 26 
Sweetmeat shops I 
Bakeries 1 
Confectionaries . . 4 
(Peppermint factories). 

(c) During the short period of implementation of the partial 
do-control of sugar, experience has shown that it has created more 
difRculties. 

(d) No, Sir. 

a. Rja^cRg -—"a" axr*a 

TJ* ^^T- OM^ ^ ^ U ^ ! 

^ a. a. T3-*en . — Q^^Sb 12,870 
^R^ea partial de-control g-Rjg ^ ^ 4.771 o^b 

^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ market 

t ^ a S J ' g j o ^ a State Government ^ooA 

^ ^e^-ob) : Full de-control 

D Trap . — Tr̂ a g)o-a*§ full control 

^CT* o3j J"TV- ^ h o ^ 

a. g), i r -a* :—Q^oa *3<MXb "g^b 

^ o ^ o ^ s ^ ^ ^ o O * 

003 l3oxn3r*U-* ? 



Oral Answers to QuesHons. 6th Ju'y, 1968. 22t 

^^g^orr^ ^ e m ^ ^ c j 3T5r*gea, ^ e r * ^ ^ ^ ^ 

^ o 333 ^ d j 

^ ^ S T ^ ^ r ^ ^ ^ ^^ rr- ^ ^ R j o , ^ 

ratio ^^o^O ^ 3 

^ ^ ^ a^agjgboa. vo^^ocy^ Mack 
market 6^35 

^ D. vay qa^g? 

43. 0)5". 3^3^ :—"So 0 
sH^RiD 433 ^3 6 "8 3 hst 
^ t r - ? ci co ^ 

^ D. §). ir*^ 8)6 - 3 ^ 3Ro3&o. 

^b-nr^^. gebTT-g 
go&bo, g3b-sr*$ d). 100 dn^o^eo ^ ^ o y 

? 

339b ^ ^ ^ r r * ^ o ^ ) R ^ 3 ^ 3 ^ 

36<R<3̂ o6** A 38A3 



222 6 h July, 1968 Oral Answers to Quest oa$, 

^n^cA control ig^RiX) 

monthly result $ absb ^ copy ir-33 3^pbgesb 

low income group 
^a^eo open market 

f ^ o ^ ^ ^ ^ a Government of India 

(J ĵ "§ ^ D o ^ m ^ — & 3 o5j-* ^ o 

^ a. * — n r - S b s;^^) Bt?o 

. . — s u g a r low income 

group-^85 Mcab 
"s39o ooo^^&x) ^ ^ o ^ d r * 8b*"or* open market 

sugar 3b a r ^ o ? 

Individual famines § rationing card holder 5 

es^^b^oa s^D industries a <2M3g<%o ^eSb. 3bC JSb^.g 
3"§ <sr>e§ oooXb 

nr^&u ^ ooo nr*^ ^ ^g 3 # ex), 
3 o (f tp e lb 3 -B d̂b ej open market 



Anawsrs to Ques^ons 6ta J my, 

Black maaket free 

^ ^ -u-*3) — e 3 e o Governments 

percent ^ 3 y 3 sugar {jr*3bo l 

97 ^ 3eo 3o3j-*db Mack market ^ 

^ 3d9b MS^a i&R^D partial 

^ 3 3 ma^ —u"*33 ? partial 
decontrol 3o ^^od^sD ^ n r ^ s b ? 

. CO co 

^o^o^ 3J*Gr* area 
^3-s^dorr*, H W * ^r^^&D ^^jir*, 

S&^B. ^3^-3 s^or^ free rr*3 avadabie rn* 

shortage 3 ^ ) crop 3tfsj 38M 

33 3v*g3o ^oa . 

control 12 ^ State sb 
de-control g5)3 ^Ob-sy^ 4 ^ State 

consumption gb ^ State ^ g ^ ^ 

3^ 3bo8 purchese i g ^ o b purchese ^ 3 3&& Jo^ ? ^^ 
^ ^ States purchese 3ta& ? 

^ 3. 3, Tr*M* 3^3 According to the new 
policy of the Govenment of India, they would take 60 percent of the 
sugar from the factory- #§^.3 40 percent ^ g g S o ir^S free marker 

Sb 300 60 percent g^Rr* factory 3b3sb 

oea3y6t ^ 3 central pool a 4 ,771 



224 ^th Juiy, 1968. Ora! Answers to Questions, 

-cr^^o distribution ^ gj^y^ ^ ^ 

"3oojg ^Sb^Rrr* *BotR) 

8 ^eo ^^ 4 ^ gj^ Tcwns 

g^go cities comparative rr* 

-era ^o^o f^o^o Sj^cr^ 

^ distribution a*B * o o 
^ Ty-^o —# co (3 

distribute ^^s&oAr'g). Tr-^o licence holder 

t9o6jT3b. ^ distribute 
^ d ) ^p ô ^Rd ^ distribution 

^^^ ? 
^ a. -cep , — urban areas 

o ^ h ) partiality-ar^d). vO ^^-sr^^j 

43, -ST& -sr -^o^o^d) ) o o o ^ ^ oi )o# 

urban areas ^Ri-g sugar consume ^^cb . c r^o^ rural 

areas ^a, urban area M& ^rr^iy^ R&o 

licence holders ^nr^O'* -s^a^oA, Rc=tj-*oa3& 

licence .33*5 "g -^8 c^g-o^^ ooo5 

CONFISCATION OF FOODGRA1NS 
2491— 

^ 56 U Q.—Sri Ahmed Hussain (Sitarambagh) :—Will the hon. 
Minister for Revenue and Civil Supplies be pleased to state : 

(a) the number of lorries conRscated during 1966-67 for 
smuggling of fbod&rains to Karnataka, Maharashtra and Madras 
States; 

(b) the action taken agarnst them, and 

(c) the names of persons involved m these cases ? 

Sri V B. Raju —(a), (b) & (c) A statement is placed on the 
Table the of House. 



Written Answers to Questions^ 6th July, 1968. 225 

STATEMENE PLACED ON THE TABLE OF THE HOUSE fVIDE ANSWER TO 
L A . Q . No 3641 (^2491) 

(a) the number of lorries confiscated during*) 
1966-67 for smuggling of foodgrains to ) 
Karnataka, Maharastra and Madras 5 
States. j 

(bj the action taken against them, and The accused were 
j prosecuted 

(c) the names of persons involved in thesel The particulars 
cases are furnished 

J belbw 
S N o NAME OF THE DISTRICT. NAMES OF THE PERSONS INVOLVED. 

(1) Mahabubnagar Sri Koteswar Reddy 
(2) Chittoor . . i) Sri Pullakara Balaiah, 

S/o Lakshmaiah, Proddatur, 
Cuddapah district 

11) Sri L. Dastagin, S/o Md. 
Sahtb, Proddatur, Cuddapah 
distnct. 

iii) Sri N Basha, S/o KanmSaheb, 
Jammalamadugu, Cuddapah 
Dist. 

(3) Adilabad. . . i ) Sri Mahabeer Prasad 
11) Sri Abdul Qader 
in) Sri Radha Kishan. 

SUPPLY OF RICE TO CENTRAL POOL 
2492-

* 5067 Q - S r i C V K Rao*—Will the hon. Minister for 
Revenue and Civil Supplies be pleased to state. 

(a) whether it is not a fact t at Government proposed to 
send 6 lakh tonnes of rice outside State for Central Pool in 1967 68, 

(b) whether it is not a fact that (he Central Government 
promised to supply 2 lakh tonnes of wheat and milo m 1967-68 , and 

, (c) if so, whether Central Government kep( up its promise? 
Sri V. B Raju —(a) It is proposed to send only 4 lakh 

tonnes of rice outside the State for central pojl 
(b) Yes, Sir. 
(c) The Government of India have so far allotted a quantity 

of 1 26 lakh tonnes of wheat and nulo They will, no 
doubt, allot the balance: m due course. 

^ 3. 3. <9%g3E?, Central Pool a 4 lakhs of tons 
of rice a quality rice cau l s ' * * ? 

Sri V B, Raju Both fine and coarse rice. 
^ 3. "§. ? Fine .)o%?Coarse rice 2 

t^j 3. §) -tr*tp : ts breakup "ggoA. 33 4 lakhs oMoir* 

oooRg*gRo&. 90-5-* o o ^ R ^ a . 93̂ 43$ oMo33%g) 
43 2 lakhs $1 thousand 733 tons 3oao3iy*aM, StiH 



226 gthJuly, 19ti8. O i AU.V3PS to Questions* 

have got the period upto the end o? October 3!st and we will be able 
to export 4 lakhs tons* This consists of both 6ne and coarse. 

(^J a. ( ^eae ) ' — 'B' whether 
it is not a fact that the Central Go\ ernment promised to supply m 
2 lakh tonnes of wheat and milo 196^-68^ 

SriV B Raju:—They are giving liberally 15,030 tonnes of 
wheat every month. They have promissed to arrange to send us 
some 4 000 tonnes of wheat from Hariana also and with thanks I had 
to say no* because 1 hold 2*,000 tonnes of State stock and a few lakhs 
tons of Central stock here In the State there is not much demand 
for wheat and some varieties of wheat products also are lying idle 
with us. We have to start giving more wheat to Bour sales so that 
the products may have a market There is no problem for wheat 
as such 

^ X). a. *S. t — 0 0 0 3 3 9 ^ ° G T * aiaynr* 

Sri V. B. Raju <— We are taking care to see that nothing 
deteriorates 

tJSj "S. -c-tgo^po (Ruaiggg)) : — Central Pool a State 3bo3 
1988-67 g"* 3o3o 3o^3^o3o^l )d3ogo ^ o ^ 

Sri V. B. Raju *— I can give you the 6gurcs. In 1964-63, we 
have exported 5,24,000 tonnes which is the maximum Then we came 
dovn to 2.39,000 tons 1965-f6 Then we exported 3,58,000 tonnes m 
3966-67 Now this year upto July 4th we have exported 2,51,753 
tons as I just now said. We have to send 4 Lakhs tonnes more. 

^ 3 b 8 — aUfgesy. ooogjygb Minister 
7?*%) wheat sb ^o^ 3*3 
wheat y f̂ 3b5 

per quintal tb^ ^eoxbun! wheat ^ ^ tegRtfo 

(J^ D, g) i^ay — 

:—Quintal #tf ^o^ ! 

^ 3. a. v*** : — Q u e & t i o n 
answer gl6j3y<R) 

^ 3. a, tyre? —6}3y<R) Wheat products 033)$^ 
Ex-Food Corporation gadowns 17^6.65 pdeo revise 
tp<xM3a Fx-Mil! price after 17-6.68 per Quintal 5 gr*&*c&<Kt 
gjcr* Resultant g&r* 72 di^w 60 33?. ^ 



Written Answers to Questions^ 6th July, 1968. 227 

3eS<3§sr=cS . — W h e a t ptf ^o^ ? 

^ 3 v a p :—^^ex^ Wheat gram, as such, imported wheat 
m * ) ^ ? Just now, I do not have this wheat price. 

^ g o a ^%jg§Er*ox) — r a t i o n ]j3-E-°6o per quintal 

^ D. a. -trw :—Subsidy, Wheat ^ ^ 

aaRgo M central pool 

^e j ^ o ^ r - v 3bo-& 

outside the purview of the pool a>o& ? t*a "5o<%a'sSa>6jo'3) 
Bengal gram shortage ^ g b s§oas'?3r° 90-y" JSb-^^ 

^ 3. g). -û an — e t S b ^ - R j ^Sb^^rr 
gr*!S&) boiled rice g g n y g 

second crop rice ^gb^^yv* &*3bo%& 

^o-a-xr^bj. ration 
stocks ejgL^ 76 crop <gr*;3go ^ o 
consume 33y(3b godowns ^ ^ *r*3§ 

boiled rice gg second crop a 9S^<% 
consume rice 3o&o-R<%o es^jb^b^b^a. ^ 
rice Mggtfo ^^b* Bengal gram 

v o ^ R^tf stock Bengal gram, Bengal gram dhal 

S b g ^ ^ ^ ^ g o a & V ^ T T * ? 

=a-rg-° ^ g g o e o o R ^ ^^y^b iy^^ , ^ ^ ^ 4 e ^ o 

open market <g"* av^&M 

stocks *B ^ ^ o ^ q a 



228 6th July, 1968. ilrai Answers to Questions. 

<a (Pg-ST^O ^ ^ aoR6j i r ' ^ e ) ^ ^O^^ir^ ^e 4 
export go&sr'M ^ ^ i r * ? 

-s^a free trade aoR6j?&o-a 

^ ^ ^ policy ^ sSr*^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ Wholesale trade gj 

beo tsooo*̂  ^o^^^bo. 

RSh'bo'a, B ^ wagons ^ 

Ae^^ojj*^, 90-ST 

^ a — Central 
Government subsidy 
tr^-o-* v ^ e S o Subsidy r r ^m 

CentrafGovernment. sbg i r - ^og j 
subsidy 

^ a a *—<g ^ g o *crr^e9j subsidy 

subsidy pcf 

Bc&go s^cr^ bod subsidy .. 
for instance imported ^r*^ 
r o ^ n r ^ e b . U^a bo^ subsidy 
T r * ^ bod ^ ^ o ^ c b . s}Sfan)& & subsidy 

S^, -tyrRgRx! ^ e proportion^ RRjoB, 
rice sb, ^a ^ g ^ d ^ o o 38 IMi 

^ ^ -sr*<a, ^ d b ^ ^ o . 

^ ^aer^e) — &H3&M pool gb 

$3 ̂ ^ -cr^aa compensate ^ ^ ^ a § 
free market ^ ^ ^ i^aa 2b 9&RM 

^ M o bod 



Oral Answers to Questions. 6th July, 1568. 229 

s^o^o-a ^ ar* ^ a^ggb 

bo^ pool gb ^ ^ d ^ ^ o ^ o os Food Cor-
poration g^o&juu-^Bb. Food Corporation g ^ o ^ u ^ ^ ^ u,a ^sb^g 

Millers L ^ o ^ i o ^ C f o ^ , -u^^oM 

3r*3b bod) market -g^^oMo^ 

^ a ir̂ ap Bto^) "Bot̂ b 

Food Corporation -^^b market g"* 
millers ao3bg^jj ^ tJeb^R That is 
exactly the contention . . 

a. a. —ir*^Sb ^ o d ^ instructions 

^ i^^^b agd^o opocj^ocooa. 
-ŝ TT^O, millers 3bo-3 DoCbgon^ 

SbeotS^ e?l3a 
^ooos^ocooa. Food Corporation gbo-R sb^cr" ^o^ Rtft^ 

market d^g aD53jr?fT3-*<Sb9b, ago^oo 
^ccogr^ocooa. "gooRdj^ 87 ^ ^ e g ) aoo^Sbocy^ 
coarse rice, 105 "=a;3e)Sb ao&^oo-^ 6ne rice Food Corporaiion 

acabgaM retail sale consumer sb ^oir '^a 
millers M ^ a market ^ ^ ^ demand and supply 
&o&jooa. u^a&o^ control Da"^. ^ o ^ 

- ^ ^ ^ ago&o&^c^ millers T ^ g ^ ^ e ^ 
ao&g^oo ^axgg j * ^^L^ooo^, ^a 

^(jb^Sbocr' )j3813e 37 ^e^&oO 40 ^eo ^ ^ g ^ . 
market ^ lelease igoaogeaoan-* instructions ^ ^ 
^ millers ^ ^ ^ dealers 9*3 

v ^ ^ o aaodjo'^ "B ^bo millers millers 0— n 

Food Corporation aar*^ ^ o a . 

^ e a customers is D#on** 

direct?^ ^ S ^ o ^ ^ 



230 6th July, 1968. ilrai Answers to Questions. 

§) ^ ^ : Direct rr° 

^a godowns ^ mills sb aoCbg^jj 
godowns g"* ^ ^ ^ ^e r * s'Xk) ^ ^ 0 8 ^ 

^ ^ charges g ^ s ^ o x ) . 

^ -B Towns ^ir^&D 

5ag&x)3o63 shops ^ ad3bgo 

miH^a aod)go 

g g ^ g ^ a . eCb defference ^ a 

T^^gb restrictions sales tax-sr^^a, b^a, es restric-

tions g^eRo^a T^^Sb e free market 

^ a. -—bot$b ^ ^ b 

^odb^b -yr<3b ! v a cna^e^ aodb^o^) 
aoBbĝ boSb̂ c?̂  5 percent Huller §)cHbgo 

cs^ag, restrictions Rh) ^ ^ ^ sales tax aao&o 
^a Civil Supplies Department gb 3oao3o-a38 v^db. 

g j ^ g o R : — C e n t r a l pool gb supply 
Food Corporation irg-cr^^o^ ! Pood Corporation ^ ^ 

, g^^xSy^rr-a, Food Corporation States eb 
supply 

charges sa'̂ g'o ^a^grr* middle men 
proRts -sr^^gb ^ r ^ supply 

^ - c r^^^^ coy er̂ ^^bo T^^jSb 
&o&Ro8. -cr̂ a a^oSbo ^^b^^jo ed^-ao-0 a v t ^ ^ ^ - t r * ? 

^ a. -prep — 9 8 s^ agency 

capital is-*-s-*a. 983^0^ Food Corporation 

X3bsf ooŷ  second crops q g ^ g oocr- ao^g^) 3Y+7T* 

y f̂ Sgo&ot3a, systematic n^ economy tpdj^aeaAoa. 

^^ agency Tr*-a-*9. Either a wholesale dealer or an exporter 

or Food Corporation, somebody must be necessary as a link between 
the importer and %he exporter. 



(jral Answers to Questions. 6th July, 1963. 231 

AMBULANCE CARS TO TEACHING HOSPITALS 

2493— 
* 5368 Q —Dr. T V* S. Chalapathi Rao(Vijayawada East), .Will 

the hon. Minister for Health and Medical be pleased to state : 

(a) the number of teaching Hospitals m the State, 

(b) how many of them are provided with ambulance cars for 
the use of the patient, and 

(c) how many of them are m working condition ? 

The Minister for Health and Medical (Sri P, V Narasimha 
Rao) —(a) 21 

(b) 18. 

(c) 11. 

AMBULANCE CARS TO DISTRICT & TALUK HOSPITALS 

2494— 

* 5364Q—Dr. T V. S Chalapathi Fao —Will tlx hon. 
Minister for Health and Medical be pleased to state 

(a) number of District and Taluk Hospitals m the State 

(b) how many of them are provided with ambulance cars for 
the use of the patients, and 

(c) how many of them are m working condition ? 

Sn P. V. Narasimha Rao*—(a) District Headquarters 
Hospitals. 15 

Taluk Headquarters Hospitals 188 

203 

(b) Eight. 

(c) All. 

^ „l§*. -pT>;&53*5<a :—^evroigtp'* ambulance ^gbonr* 

iRa ger* g ^ d j ^ e b ambulance T^r^u-*? L ** —a 
/ 

a. —tr*a$ ad6&r*a) 
call for ^oln^o, MRo-BT* ^ ^ a . 



232 6th July, 1968. ilrai Answers to Questions. 

C ^ O R J ^ ^ 25 a 

gp^-trgeo ^ ^ ^ c&oajstR^ ^ ^ ^ i g ^ T ^ ? 

^ a D. : ^ o teox^ ^Co-^^ ^ ^ 

gTSf ^ a. cCb?. ^938-0-*$) :-Teachmg Hospitals gj ambu^ 

lances—?8 Teaching Hospital a a , ^ ^ ambu-

lance ^ ^ ^ ^ a^PooI 

teaching hospitals M<3̂ o43§ 

^ a. a. gRRo l^vg ) .—^PoolgM ^ ^ R & ^ o ^ e j ^ T y * 

Requisition^^ -srr^ 

availability ^ o ^ ^ Mo&o pool — 

^ ^o. (Recca) -—Ambulance cars 

cco^^o^^^S^XSo^^ Rog^tfo eo^go ^ o o o ^ 

^ a. a. ^ o ^ x r * ^ 
Ambulance s^ooo ^cb^ 

-c^a^dgj -u -̂y^O. ^o^go ^^^gbocr* 
e^go^Ra^aj. 

Smt: B* Jayaprada:—There is a proposal to abolish the D M. 
& S. Course m Vijayawada Teaching Hospital. Is it a fact ? The 
second thing is a proposal also to make that hospital a taluk hospital 
when that is of an important town Is that also a fact ? 

Sri P. V, Narasimha Rao '-—We are m ambulances at the mom-
ent Sir. (Laughter) 

Smt. B. JayapradaBut teaching Hospitals are also there. 

Sri P. V. Narasimha Rao - I t is a fact Sir that D. M. & S. 
Course was wound up with eSect this year at Vijayawada. 

^ a. a. g^aybtfsb 
ambulance supply g ^ E ^ a s ^ T y ^ o R ^ be^igs g ^ ^ o ^ o & j o ^ c o . 
&>e)&j§ -sn&R -5;§rr* oM^y^ab. tsag^a ambulance 
vans ft* convey :goRsr*a§ ? ^ 



Ota! Answers to Questbm. gth July, 1968. 233 

^ S), a. 233aG3-6-o-*3& — c h a s s i s gj 

I T , cr^^a ^ 

X-RAYS TO T^LUK HEADQUARTERS HOSPITALS 

2495-
5757 Q - S n G. Bhupathi (Nerella):-Will the hon. 

Minister for Health and Medical be pleased to state * 

(a) whether Government propose to provide an X-Ray 
Department and Pathological Laboratory to each Taluk Headquarters 
Hospital, 

(b) if so, when, and 
(c) if not, reasons therefor ? 
Sri P V, Narasimha Rao .—(a) & (b) It is hoped that pro-

posals may be made m the IV Five Year Plan 
(c) Does not arise* 

REHABILITATION OF Ex-CONVICTS ^ 
2196— 

* 5680 Q —Sri P' O Satyacarayana Raju (Yemmiganur) *— 
Will the hon/ Minister for Pnsons be pleased to state: 

(a) the No. of Centres existing in our State for rehabilitating 
the Ex-convicts, 

(b) the total number of Ex-convicts rehabilitated during 
1967-68 m each of the Centres, and 

(c) the amount sanctioned for maintenance of the Centres 
during the year 1967-68 ? 

The Minister for Prisons (Sri Mohd Ibrahim All Ansari) -(a) At 
the begming of the year 1967-68 there were two State After Care 
Homes^for Men at Rajahmundry and the other at Hyderabad function-
ing onsequent on the abolition of the State After Care Home*at Rajah-
mundry with effect from 31-8-67, the State After Care Home a% 
Hyderabad only is functioning 

(b) State After Care Home State After Care Home 
Rajahmundry (upto 31-8-67) Hyderabad. 

(1) No. admitted-10 10 
(11) No rehabilitated-Nil Nil 

(c) Amount sanctioned during the year 1967^68-

(1) State After Care, Home, Hyderabad Rs. 24,410 
(2) State After Care, Home, Rajahmundry Rs. 7,950 

ENHANCEMENT OP BOARDING GRANT 

2497— 
*5296 Q.—Sri V. Kurmayva (Tiruvur) —Will the hoa Minis-

ter for Social Welfare be pleased to state. 
(a) whether the Government is going to enhance the rate of 

twrdmg grant per boarder per month from Rs< 20 to Rs* SO 93 & W33 



234 6th July, 1968. ilrai Answers to Questions. 

enhanced m Maharashtra, Gujarat, Madhja Pradesh, Rajasthan, 
Kerala, etc States m v*ew of the soaring prices of food and essentia! 
commodities, and 

(b) whether the Government is going to enhance the rate of 
residentia! scholarships to be sanctioned to the Scheduled Caste stu-
dents studying m aH the Colleges. Arts and Professional and also 
post-graduate couises to meet the growing food and other charges m 
the hostels attached to the Colleges and Universities ? 

The Minister for Social Welfare (Sri A Ramaswamy):— (a) 
and (b) No, Sir. 

l^j * —qR^R) !^ S^o-R^nr* 

oMaao8rr* 3e — S o , 

(Jt̂  ir'^b^gXb :—Subsidised hostel g) e&. 2 0 go ^ ^ T ^ ^ r 

Additional^ ojoi^eo '^) sbo^o 

^Crr̂  e ^ e o ^iSbon^ Number of 
boarders v^^o^Doa amount oral practice t a g ^ o 

es^ljo&oa (nr* ^^o^g ^^ogeo oooo^ 

^ ^ r R . ^ ^ ^ 

^ — ^ ^ ^ 
T^M ^ e ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ a* 20<Mca)3)<J* 

complaints ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ <Ro)Rn9"g cco^) 
^e t )^ 3Rg ^ ^ ^ 

Insiteadof giving the boarding grant of that Rs, 20/-per boarder 
per month, why don't you give that to the parents itself? Why can-
not you do this ? 

^ .3. -u^a^a ) :—/fssc^o&x ) ^ o cm a aa. 
Schalorships subsidised hostels. 

Dp^^). ^ ^ ^ e ^ S ^ ^ ocoXryR) ^ cb. 20 
^ ^ A o ^ e ^ ) d). MR30 ? Tif&n, lunch, 
dinner, o ^ ^ e i r ^ ? q3 ocoo-ŝ  eSg' ^C^eM 



Written Answers to Questions^ 6th July, 1968. 235 

tj^t <3. - c^oa^ao :—ep&r^ subsidised hostels g^o-a . . 

ooj8 bosb private conversation -y^ujb. 

opposition-^(fo^d) Sbd gfoRo. ^od) 

g^^sb ^^g^or r " tpRr^ ^a address q̂ -ŷ b̂ ^a subsidised 
hostels ^a -cr^a^ -^cb ^ 8 

hostels oco-sŷ gO 
btb ^ o ^ g)6 

t^t " g^o^g — ^ (a) ^ o ^ 
3b3g)j3^f T ^ o a ^ ^ SJ^^ MAR 

t y r a ^ ^a eaobonr^OJ tt3*2r<g Jo^^ 
rate ? Er-a§ ^ 8 b 

Sri A . Ramaswamy —The information is placed OA the Table 
of the House 

BALA GRIHAS 
2498— 

^2750 Q —Sarvasri Badnvishal Pitti (Maharajgunj), Ahmed 
Hussam and B V. Ramanayya (Allavaram):—Will the hon Minister 
for Social Welfare be pleased to state * 

(a) the places where "Bala Grihas" intended for destitute chil-
dren are functioning and the strength m each, and 

(b) the number of children admitted into each of these houses 
during 1966-67 ? 

Sri A . Ramaswamy :—The Information is placed 'on the Table 
of the House. 

Information placed on the Table of the House Vide L. A . Q. 
No 27S0 (Starred) (*2498) 

S. N o . The places where Strength of the The No of 
Balagriha * home as on Cmldren 

(Children Home) * 1-12 1967. admitted 
is functioning during 66 67. 

jtjr r ). , ' ' —— * 
1* Rajamundry 34 5 
2. Nuzvid . 50 3 
8. A t Sangareddy (Medak) 45 12 
4. Bapatla , 45 2 
5. Machilipatnam 46 3 
6. Jagtial 42 25 
7 Siddipet 37 12 

i 8 - 3 



286 6th July, 1968. Oral Answers to Questions 

( ! ) (2) (3) (4) 

8 *Adilabad S3 33 

9 Dharmavaram 89 27 

10 Bheemunipatnam 83 14 

11. Warangal 84 30 

12 *Bobbili 22 22 

13 Vikar ibad 41 l 

14 *Anakapalli 80 82 

15. Madanapalli 45 45 

16. *Kalahasti 43 52 

17 Peddapadu 82 39 

18. Gudur 44 19 

19 Bhadrachalam 38 6 

20. Nalgonda 44 12 

31. *ianuku 49 49 

22 Srikakulam 42 80 

23. Nellore 47 26 

24. Hyderabad 50 11 

25 *Kamareddy 45 55 

26. Karimnagar 41 87 
27 Siddhou^ (Cuddapah 

50 District) 44 50 
28. Hindupur 42 12 
29 Alwal 40 49 
80. Addathigala 48 81 
81 Cuddapah 89 9 
32 Khammam 33 16 
8$ Atmakur (Manabub-

nagar) 47 17 
34. Jangoan 50 50 
35 Bhongir 45 18 
86. Nizamabad 4a 6 
37 Guntur 49 5 

1587 822 

Note :—The sanctioned strength for all the Children's Home is, 
50 except Peddapadu of Kurnool District, where it is 
100 

* The Childrens Homes at these places were started m the 
year 1966-67 in the plan schemes Hence all are new admissions-



Written Answers to Questions^ 6th July, 1968. 237 

NON-SUPPLY OF MAIDA ETC. BY FOOD CORPORATION OF INDIA 
2499— 

* 5 6 4 0 Q . - S r i Ahmed Hussam:—Will thehon Minister for 
Revenue and Civil Supplies be pleased to state 

(a) whether the Civil Supplies Department is aware of the 
fach that the Food Corporation of India has stopped the supply of 
Maida, Flour and Rawa direct from the Flour Mills and entrusted 
the supply work to the Central Warehouse, due to which the price 
per quital has increased by Rs 8.22, 

(b) whether it is also a fact that due to thair supply through 
another agency via., the whole-sale godowns at begumbazar. Abid 
Road and Masub tank, Hyderabad, the price has been mrreased bv 
Rs 28 00 per quintal and that consequentlythe rate of Rawa, Maida 
and Flour supplied by the Flour Mills at Rs 86 62 P is being sold 
at Rs 107 46 P. per quintal m retail, and 

(c) the steps proposed to be taken by the Government to 
restore the prices prevailing previously ? 

Sri V. B Raju —(a) No, Sir, The Food Corporation of India 
never contracted the work relating to supply of wheat products to the 
Central Warehouse. 

(b) & (c) The answer is placed on the Table of the House. 

ANSWER PLACED ON THE TABLE OF THE HOUSE 
VlDB ANSWER TO CAUSES (B) AND ( c ) OF L . A . Q . N o 5640 

STARRED ( * 2499 ) 

ANSWER 
(b) Wholesalers have been appointed to cater to the needs of 

the special permit holders. The Ex. mill prices of wheat products 
Bxed by the Government of India Ex, Food Corporation of India 
Depot, adjacent to mill prices, wholesale and retail prices prevailing 
during the period from 25-8-1968 to 16-6-1968 are as follows 

Commodity Ex. Mill Price Ex. FCI Whole Retail Diffe-Commodity 
&xed by GOI Depot sale +price rence 
(per quintal) Price price per per (per quintal) 

per qtl. per qtl. K.G. qtl 

Rs. p Rs. p. Rs p. Rs. p. Rs p. 
Maida 39-25 92-75 101 92 1-0JM 12-75 Maida 39-25 

1-03 C 13-75 
Rawa 93-62 97-12 101-32 1-01 M 87-38 Rawa 

1-02 C S-3S 
Resultant Atta 69-62 73-12 80-57 0-81 M* 11-88 

0-82 C* 12-88 

*M* for Municipal Area. 
*C. for Contonment Area. 

It will be seen that the diSerence m between the ex. mill ph<368 and 
retail prices of wheat products range from 7,38 p. to 13*75 p 
quintal and not Rs. per quintal. 



238 6th July. 1968. Orat Answers to Questions 

(c) Conaequtnt on the upward revision of prices of wheat, the 
Government of India have revised and enhanced the ex mill prices 
ol wheat products with effect from 17-6-1968 as follows , 

Commodity 
* 

Ex Mill Price 
prior to 
17 6-1968 
(per qtl.) 

Ex Mill price after 
17-6-1968 

(per quintal) 

Rs. p. Rs p 

Maida 89-25 93-00 

Rawa 9C-62 99-00 

Resultant Atta 69-62 7 -30 

In uiew of the above pos^ion the Government cannot take any 
action to restore the prices prevailing previously. 

PROCUREMENT PRICE PADDY 

250J-? 

* 3789 Q.— Sri A . Madhava Rao — Will the hon. Minister 
for Revenue and Civil Supplies be pleased to state 

(a) whether it is a fact that the procurement prices of paddy in 
our State are lower when comp ired to the prices in some other States 
m the country and if so, is it not discriminatory ; 

(b) whether the Government be pleased to place on f:he Table 
of the House (in so far as they are having information) a list showing 
the prices of procurement fixed by Government of India for various 
States; and 

(c) the basis or principles on which these priccs are fixed by the 
Government of India ? 

Sn V, B Raju (a) Procurement price of paddy differs from 
SjEatb to State, depending upon various factors such as production, 
cost of cultivation ctc. There is no discrimination ia the Rxation of 
prices. 

(b) A statspneat is placed on the Table of the House. 

(c) While Rxing^he procurement prices of paddy for the year -
1967-68 crop year %be Government of India is reported to have taken 
into consideration the decisions arrived at^the Chief Ministers' Con-
ference and also the recommendations of the Agricultural Prices 
Commission, teaidgs important factors like constant increase in the 
cost of agricultural mpmts and the need for giving incentive price to 
the farmers. 



Written Answers to Questions^ 6th July, 1968. 239 

STATEMENT PLACED ON THE TABLE OF THE HOUSE 
Vide Answei to clause (B) of L. A . Q. No 3789 (Starred) (*2300) 

STATEMENT SHOWING THE PROCUREMENT PRICES OF PADDY FlXED BY 
GOVERNMENT OF iNDIA FOR VARIOUSE STATES FOR 1967-68 

(Rs per quintal) 

s. Name of the State. Variety Procurement price 
No of paddy suggested 

to the State Gove-
rnment. 

1967-68 

(1) (3) (3) (4) 
1 Andhra Pradesh Akkullu 46-00 
2. Madras Kattaisamba 43-00 
3. Mysore Coarse 45-00 
4 Onssa Common 48-00 
5. Haryana Begmi 52-00 to 

33-00 
(notional) 

6. Madhya Pradesh Surmatia 32-00 to 
33-00 

(notional) 
7. Gujarat Sathe 35-00 
8. Bihar Coarse and medium 36-25 
9. Assam Wmtersah 36-25 

10. Kerala Palghatmatta 56-25 
H Punjab Begmi 52-00 to 

53-00 
(notional) 

12 Uttai Pradesh Coarse I I I 56-23 
13. West Bengal Common 56-23 

(^ j ,3. :—Prices Rxation cost ofproduc 

tion ^Oo-S) data A I M ^^b^jgo ^ o ^ ^ ^ T j ^ i ^ ? -cr*3§ 
principles laiy^ooo. ^ 

^ S). X). v a n * Agriculture Prices Commission ox*^^ 

^ M S ^ a Government of Indian recommend Chief 
Ministers & S^e )̂ as' conference ^ ^ j o a Prices Commission 

repo t , ^Sboo^ ŝb Standard ( f variety of rice 

^d^go price Rs. 43-30 p iar*a& Rx 

tt&y§r*ig(a). It was raised to Rs. 46 gg^R prices ^ ^ cnR bo^ 

oco^^^ State Government Rx gab08. 



340 6th July, 195S Oral Answers to QuestioR?. 

direct n- ^ ^ ^ o The question is "whether it is a 

fact that she procurement prices of prady in our State are lower when 
compared to the prices m some other states m the country 
tr*3§ R^RoTT- States^ prices 

ASb<g ! State puces ? 

l^ j x^ey : es statement -^^^^ooo*^ " g ^ ^ o a . 

Sri G Sivayya —I have seen the statement, Sir. 
Sri V B. Raju —The statement is self explanatory Sir. Table 

^ a . 3)8 T^-aRdjOM^ 
S^a^ ^ a . 

EXPORT OF FOOD-GRAINS 
2501— 

* 5941 Q.— Sri S Vemayya :— Will the hon. Minister for 
Revenue and Civil Supplies be pleased to state ; 

(a) quantity of Food-grams exported to other States for the 
year ending 31-3-1968 (1967-68), and 

(b) whether the quantity is more or less to that of the previous 
year ? 

Sri V B, Raju — (a) A quantity of 2,63,203 tonnes of rice and 
33,844 tonnes of maize was exported to other states during the year 
endmg 31-3-1968. 

(b) It was less m the case of rice and more m the case of maize, 

^ —Crop year latest figure 

^ a.g). Trap;—qoggbabJoR) 
Crop year 1964-65 R)8o3 siv-Ri. I am giving Sgures now 
fbr crop years. 

Quantity of food grains exported — 
In the year 1964 65 5.24,000 tonnes 
In the year 1065-66 ' 2,39,000 tonnes 
In the year 1966-67 8,58,000 tonnes 
From November to 4th July, 1968 2,59,753 tonnes. 

3. eays^ (&3cr&6j). —s^gaRMcd) 

export ^ T y - ^ t a , ^ o j ^ ^ ^ whole sale shop -sr>8§ ooo^g 
export ^o^ t^ST* ? 

^ -crap —State Government direct ^ export 
Food Corporation of Ind ian ooo^oa, ea ^ ^ e o ^ ^ r e o ^ ^ 

Food Corporation of India a ao&jgo Millar 



oral Answers to Questions. 6th July, 1968. 241 
* 

6 ipcfg) OM^jgO, ^ ^ g b West Bengal 9o c c j ^ e 

^ - g A ^ o ^ o S b o i g o^^ ) . Government of I n d i a n a * 
^go^bo ^XbSbo^Ob. 

^ g?. :—3>oa)"g F^od Corporation Tŷ cb 

^^fsb, export ^^sb, State Government 

local consumption sb o o o ^ ^ ŝb .̂55 ^X) "gj^jj ^^o 

3 3 ^ 3 ) . Food Corporation i^cjb & ^tfsb g)oHbgb Sbe ̂  d ^ d ^ o ^ 

6 (ya'sb -sr̂ db wholesaler sb issue retailer sb 

issue g o & g ^ , retailer consumer 8b issue go&g'g, Sx up 

Mooj^ccooe. wo<3bg'& Food Corporation miller RW&o-R 

^^ 72 Moa)!3&?oo)*g n^cb retailer gb ^o-^^o 
o ^ ^ j O — I t will be round about Rs 82 About Rs. 10 as 

overhead charge etc. are there. 

( j f j a. — 3 b o 3 Government of India v a b 
import ^ ^ v ydg), ^ ^ export 

Ag^ ^ procurement ^ 
bonus c a ^ - n ^ i y - ? bonus o o o ^ o ^ S sMS 

^ S), —-3-*3b ^_6j3bo-a ^ ^Nb ^ a ^ u ^ O ^ ^bggb 

y^S cco^d State ^ Bx Standard 
variety g <sr*9b ^ ^ 6x ^ ^ oco^a. gbg&n 
export ^o&^^jo ^^Sb. Food Corporation -crgir* ^ o - D 

^tsbTr*^ Government of India gb handover 
SS^ 93b)eo meet out v^v^Cb. 

TRANSFER OF GAZETTEERS WORK TO UNIVERSITIES 
2502— 

* 5618 Q.—Sn A. Eswara Reddy (Tirupathi) Will the hon. 
Minister for Revenue and Civil Supplies be pfeased to state : 

(a) whether there is any proposal with the Government to 
entrust the work of compiling of district Gazetteers to the concerned 
and respective universities, 

(b) if so, the decision taken thereon ? 

Sri V. B Raju . - ( a ) The proposal to entrust the comptMien 
of Gazetteers in respect of Hyderabad, Medak, Visakhap3taam $nd 
Sn^akulana Districts wholly to University personnel was 90Psid$r§d, 



242 6th July, 1968. Oral Answer to Quests as. 

(b) The proposal was placed before Editorial Advisory Board 
on 6-2-1968 fbr its consideration and as decided by the Editorial 
Board the State Editor was authorised to select suitable University 
personnel in consultation with the Vice Chancellors concerned fbr 
speciRcd chapters and entrust the work to them on mutually agreed 
terms 

^tj iBT3er°t) -XT'3b 
"3o<%b hRjy&nr^&a; 

3 8). ir̂ ep ooo^^o ^ 

n ^ 

^a^ ?3o33o$o-0 gcRWa 

^ ^ 

a. a. -Ô ap : - QR-EntP^g ^^^ ger*a oco&rg 

^ a. a. Tr*ep igj^ oDj^d). 

^ a. a. TP***: — sy-er̂  ^^oS 

^ sB, e^Rji. * — " W h e t h e r there is any proposal 
with the Government to entrust the work of comipilmg of District 
Gazetteers to the concerned and respective Universities" $y3^-cr*a§ 

a i o ^ a on-* "Y^s" w o ^ ^ ^ ^ 

^ a. ^ van t^-^a ^AT t^TT^ lS 



Oral Answers to Questions* 6th July, !9 j8. 243 

esS*. Mo^ 

(J^*^ "g. ^bo^do, oRjra 

TT-0 K ^ ^ ^ o a . t P ^ ^ ^ g " ^ g j g ^ 

^ — B K W g ccc^y^o 

& s^o^ cur* j jS^do t^o^d) 

HEALTH INSURANCE SCHEME 
3508-

* 5745 Q - S n A Eswara Reddy Will the hon Minister for 
Health and Medical be pleased to state . 

(a) whether the Government has started the Health Insurance 
Scheme m Andhra Pradesh; and 

(b) the progress of the scheme m 1967-68 ? 

Sri P. V. Narasimha Rao :—(a) No, Sir. 

(b) Does not arise. 

N o . OF WARDS IN R.UIA HOSPITAL 

2504— 
* 5200 Q.—Sri A . Eswara Reddy -—Will the hon Minister for 

Health and Medical be pleased to state + 

(a) the number of wards in the Ruia Hospital, Tirupathi m 
Chittoor District and the present strength of beds, 

(b) whether there is a separate Women's Hospital and if so, its 
bed strength at present 

(c) whether there are special wards in both Ruia Hospital and 
%he Maternity Ho pital, 

(d) the number of out-patients treated daily and its comparison 
with the last year's performance, 

(e) whether it is a fact that people posted to this ̂ Hospital 
from elsewhere avoid joining their pasts here Rrst dRe to the high 
tentp they have to pay for houses m Tirupathi and lesser chances of 
private practice, and 

1 8 - 4 



244 ftn July, 1968. Oral Answers to Questions 

( f ) whether there is any proposals for the construction of an 
out-patient consultation ward in the heart of the town so as to save 
thetio^bleofgomgovertotheRuiaHospita! which is situated at 
the foot of the Tirumalai Hills far away from the town ? 

Sri P. V Narasimha Rao '—(a) 23 words-200 beds 

(b) Yes, Sir 100 beds. 

(c) No, Sir 

(d) The average no of out-patients during 1936-67 ^as 657 
and during 1967-68 it is 750-U96 

(e) This is partly true, Sir 
( f ) No, Sir 

(Jtj H. a. TT* 3 S* (3oR)l§ab) :— aabRg Kr°oRr* R ^ a ^ f 
?63o3 O M ^ R aCRoS. 

ajTRorr* — o c C b ^ ^ ^ ^ C b BXb̂  
^a s^c^o ^Kb ooj-* ^ ^ ^ 

s r ^ f ^ ^ o ^ ^ ^ o ^ o o a . ^a^^F"^ ) a*gor*a§ 

aadRo "Bo^^a— 

^ a a . : — o o S b ^ ^ i r - d ) ^ ^ ^ b ^ 

^Rcr-ag ^ d ) tpoRs'OoTyBb. ocoa^ aS* 

^ovreb W&Mrr* gr^^go ^ ^ A o ^ ^ 

e3,y(&> Tr̂ Cb tsoRs'eo-a 

Qo^ cr^RR ^ u ^ ^ ^ o 

a ^ R g o ^ d b ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ -gcb "gabrr* ^ 



Ora! Ansv.6rs to Questions. 6th M y , 1%8. 24j 

Mr Speaker - Answers for all other questions will be placed 
on the table of the House except 2509, 2510, 2512 and 2514 

FlRE ACCIDENT AT NAGULAVARAM 

2509— 
*0352-(Y)Q—Sarvasn P Subbaiah and K Muniswamy.— 

Will the hon. Minister for Revenue and Jivil Supplies be pleased to 
state 

(a) whether Nagulavaram Village, Giddalur Taluk, Kurnool 
District gutted on 22-1-1968, 

(b) if so, has the timber permits been granted to the fire 
victims, and 

(c) if not, what are the leasons therefor ? 

Sri V B Rj ju —(a) Forty three huts were destroyed by 3re 
m Nagulavaram Village, on 22-1-1968 

(b) No Sir. 

(c) The 6re victims stated before the Revenue inspector 
Arthavedu that they did not require any building material for recon-
structing their huts as they were given to them freely by the villagers 
Hence the grant of timber permits to the Rre victims did not arise. 

^ I). Xbâ cC&g :—^p^r r^a Tyer* D-D^orr* 

g ^ R . cr*tr*2& 80 ar"3"o3jeu 'emr^tb 20 63oa§* 

^O^r* ccu^g^d). 80 i r^&r*, 

Unlesa it is said or proved otherwise, how can I say.... Any how, 
we will write to them again. 

MISAPPROPRIATION OF REVENUE COLLECTIONS 

2510— 
*53S3 Q —Sri A. Punna Reddy (A!air) —Will the hon. Minis-

ter for Revenue and Civil Supphes be pleased to state : 
(a) whether the Government are aware of the fact that the 

Putwari of Mutakodu village, Bhongir taluk, Nalgonda district has 
misappropriated the revenue collections made from the ryots during 
1966-67 without remitting the same in the Government Treasury, 

(b) if so, whether any enquiry was made by the Tahsildar or 
Revenue Divisional OfRcer to this effect; 



246 6tb M y , 1968. ^ Oia!Ahswers to Question;. 

(c) whether there are any other complaints pertaining" to 1963 
to 196t regarding revenue collections on the said patwari; and 

(d) :f sô  the action taken by the concerned officers so far? 

Sn V B. Raju - (a), (b) & (c ) .— No Sir The 

Patwrn of Mutakonda village did not misappropriate any 
collections m 1966-67. The son of the Assldar Malipatel collected 
an amount of Rs 6,557 35 paise from the ryots unauthonsedly in the 
year 1P64-65 and misappropriated it When a complaint was recei-
ved and investigation started, the amount thus" misused was credited 
to the Government. 

(d) Action is being taken against the son of Asaldar Mali-
patel 

^ — % t < S b t x > o ^ ^ o ^ 

^ a - u ^ ^ 8 , 5 5 7 85 eo. 64-68 

^o^cr*^ Morr* ^ T r * ^ 

^ a -—68 &oa 67 3cTsb h)^ 

qX) 

t9bd3o43 eQ^Xn^ a ^ ^ ? 

Sri V. B Raju . - The Collector of Nalgonda has reported that 
the mam allegation was the at the Patwari and Sri K.Butchi Reddy of 
Mutakodu village were collecting excess amount of iand revenue and 
did not deposit the excess amount That was the complaint, 
aar^a cur* aa^oK/gRb, oRif cr>33 64-65 

^dlc^as, ^v^^b ? 



Written Answers to Questions^ 6th July, 1968. 247 

^ D. a. <:c(g)R) ^ v ^ o ^ 

j g^b^o crRiboR 

ad&&?a<Soa. 6,657.85 Co. eo ^ e h ) ^ o x ) ^ ^ 

KELIO Ku^D HERB 

2 3 ) 2 -
^*5l09 Q -Sri C V K Rao WiH the hon Mmister for 

Health and Medical be pleased to state 

(a') whether the Government is aware ot the claim of Gujarat 
State Government authority on Medicinal Plants that a herb calic3 
'Kelio Kund' found in the iorests of Gujarat has medicinal effects if 
administered to man to withstand hunger for a week without any 
food whatsoever , ard 

(b) if so, whethei Andhra Pradesh Government has made any 
study on that and investigated of the availability of the said herb m 
the forests of Andhra Pradesh ? 

Sn P V Narasimha Rao —-(t) The answer is in the negative. 
The Government of Gujarat have however been addressed and aiso 
reminded for the necessary information Their reply is awaited. 

(b) Does not arise* 

l^ j a a *3 -cr*3) : — ^ s r * 

^ galas ' a"63*3 urge gag) 3o& 
[ J ^ ^ o ( g^e^ 

^go v & ^ ^ o c r * - s r g ) ^ ^ ^Xĵ -S* ^^ cur* gbj^e^ 

gig s^ogog** ^ ^ ^ o ^ o o ^ ^ a ^ o - j ^ a ^ {g^ogj T^^o 

t^j a 3. gcf^og^ir"^ — V S A ^ s r R g — 

tsgXKfo 

FiLARiA IN Nuzvrn 

2518— 
*3362-(M) Q —Sn M. R Appa Rao —Will the hon. Minis* 

ter for Health and Medical be pleased to state 

(a) whether any representation has been received about the 
wide spread prevalance of Filaria in Nuzvid town m February, and 

(b) if so, what action is taken ? 

Sn P. V Narasimha Rao - ( a ) Yes SiT 
The District Medical and Health OBicer, Krishna, was 

instructed to get the Anti4arval Scheme processed through the 
Paachayat along with the proposition statement etc , for sanctioning 
the Scheme on grant-in-aid basis The proposals from the Panchayat 
aleng with proposition statement etc. are awaited. The Director 



248 6th July, I96&. Ora: Answers ^o ^uestioni. 

of Medical and Health Services has meanwhile in stalletted 40,000 
tablets of Hetrazan have been 'supplied to the Medical OHlcer, 
Government Hospital, Nnzvid 

S n M R Appa Rao (Nuzvid) :—My request is that the 
matter should be expedited 

^ a. a 33*aoSHir-3) ' — ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ o j 

CONTROL OF P . 11 CENTRES 

2314-
*5354-(U) Q -Sr i A. Madhava Rao . - W i l l the i on Minister 

for Health and Medical be pleased to state : 

(a) whether the Government is aware that in as much 
Primary Health Centres are under the duel control of Block Develop-
ment OHicers and District Medical and Health CM&cer, by reasons of 
whnh they are suffering m connection with salaries, effective control 
of administration ' 

(b) if so, whether the Government piopose to separate the 
P H Centres from Panchayat Samithis and keep the same under 
the sole administration and technical control of the District Health 
OiRcers, and 

(c) whether the Government propose to confer the powers of 
makmg payment to the Medical OiBccrs working m P H. Ceptres, 
along with the powers of punishing his subordinates and also the 
power of purchasing medicines ? 

Sri P. V. Narasimha Rao -—(a) The Government are aware of 
the fact that the Primary Health Centres are under the duel contrel 
of Block Development O&cers and District Medical and Health 
OfBcers. 

(b) No, Sir. 

(c) No, Sir. 

^ a. a. —̂E§Tttr°tM -or̂ Sbocr̂  g^g^o^^b 
-cr* ^ a cr^aa 

f ) v CO 
"gsbec^^cjj, ge?Sr*9ga igsbocr- Rio-aa 

^ ^ i i ^ g b o . 

—RcnyoRa ^boa 



Written Answers to Questions 6th Juty, 1968. 249 

T ^ e ^ d j /^Oo^ g ^ c R r * ? ^e 

Sri P V. Narsimha Rao:—That specific point is being consi-
dered, Sir. 

63. <35". — ^ S'o^S'*^ go 

-*r*8& ^o. â  5 S'oRcooc&M 

t§o<5 g ^ ^ J * ^ g ^OCJV- -sr-8 ^ o ^ c o ^O^^J&D 

^ a 3. gdaog^m^) -—ge 3g,o3bo ge^OTyogjj. 

g^ag ^ g g d o s&^aa 

^ Ty^a^v — c a s e s ir-^^j emr^^jj* 

^ ^ ( b o ^ g ^ R ) boycot ^ ^ ^ ĥ Cb DR-cr*? 

^ a. 3 gdacg^-u^^) 33-^gb, go^oaoA-^a ' ^ ^ 

ej cj 
-sr̂ 8§ g ^ j g g g g ^ T ^ c j syce) J ^ g gd^g^f 

W R I T T E N ANSWERS TO QU STIONS 

SELECTION OF M . B S S CANDIDATES BY P S C 

2505— 
* 3418 Q — Sarvasn V. Kurmayya and E. Vadapalli: - Will the 

hon Minister for Health and Medical be pleased to state : 

(a) the number of the M B B S candidates selected for Medical 
posts (doctors) by the Public Service Commission. Andhra Pradesh 
m the recept selection, and 

(b) the number and names of the Scheduled Castes candidates 
, out of them ? 

A ; — 

(a) 601 MBBS graduates including 100 kept m the Reserve 
hst< were selected for appointment as Assistant Surgeons m Andhra 
Pradesh MedipaL Service. 

^ (b) A statment is placed pn the Ta^le of the Hoi;se. 



250 6th July, 1968. Written Answers to Questions 

STATEMENT PLACED ON THE TABLE OF THE HOUSE 
[ VIDE ANSWER TO CLAUSE (B) L A Q. No 5A18 (Starred) (*2305) ] 

Names of the MBBS graduates (Scheduled Castes candidates) 
selected by the Andhra Pradesh Pubhc Service Commission in <967 
fbr appointment by direct recruitment to the posts of Assistant 
Surgeonsr 

1 P. Narasimha Rao 
2 B. Lakshmmarayana 
3. P Sarojmi 
4 A Devaiah 
5 M Raja Rao 
6 M Viswanadham 
7. J. Karuna 
8 MS . Indira 
9. D Raja Rao 

10 R. Ramudu 
11 D BabuRao 
12 B. Bhaskara Rao 
13. N'M.Yellesham 
14. J. Chandramam 
13. B. Raja Rao 
16 B. Uma Devi 
17. D Chandraiah 
18. G Kotiswamy 
19. K. Naraiah 
20 N V Subbaiah 
21. B Satyanarayana Rao 
22. Dharmaratnam 
23. J Narayana Murthy 
24 B. Krishnavem 

VASECTOMY OPERATIONS 
2306— 

* 3651 Q — Sri S Vemayya .—Will the hon Minister for Health 
and Medical be pleased to state - < -, 

(a) the total No of Vasectomy operations conducted by t%bh 
PrmaryHealthCentreinthe State during 1963-66, 1966-67 and 
1967-68; and 

(b) whether any amount was paid to the persons who had 
undergone operations during the above period, if so, the amount 
speat on them? 
A : - ^ , 

(a) A statement showing the number of Vasectomy 
tions conducted by each Primary Health Centre m ihe Sta^dtMRg 
the years 1963-66,19a*-67and 1967-68 (upto the end of December, 
1967) is placed on the Table of %ie Hou$e/ ^ ^ 



Written Answers to Questions. 6th July, 1988 251 

(b) Yes Sir, The amount spent in each year on the operations 
s as unthr 

! 965-66 Rs 2,89,4Au 
1966-67 , Rs 6,69,424 and 
1967-68 . . Rs. 9,71,310 

PAPER LA ID ON 1HE TABLE OF THE HOUSE 
[VIDE ANSWER (a) TO LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY QUESTION 

No 3651 (STARRED) (*2506)J 

STATEMENT SHOWING NUMBER OF VASECTOMY OPERA-
TIONS PERFORMED IN EACH PRIMARY HEALTH CENTRE 

SI Name of the Primary 1965-66 1966-67 1967-6 
No. Health Centre 

* 

(1) (2) (3) (4) 

ADILABAD DISTRICT 

1. Talamadugu — 36 58 
2 Jamoor 2 13 — 

3 Bazarahatnoor — 7 
4 Laxmanchanda 62 80 12! 
5 Narsapur — — — 

6. Kubeer — — 53 
7. Kundaram — 7 — 

8 Kasipet 37 132 14! 
9. Warhidi 3 — 7 

10. Terrur — — 

11 Kowtala — — — 

12- Pembi — 42 33 
13. Kagaznagar — 5 — 

ANANTHAPUR DISTRICT 
1. Atmakur 17 115 180 
2. Beluguppa — 17 184 
3 Chcnpekothapalle 7 2!7 142 
4. Gorantla — 68 167 
5 Gudibanda — — , 393 
6. Kamakadur — 31 92 
7 Konakondla — . 25 96 
8 Kothacheruvu — 195 92 
9 Lepakshi — 283 237 

10 Mudigubba ' — 192 321 
11. Nagalapuram — 21 181 
12 Nambulapoolakunta — — 51 
18 Peddavadugur — 41 270 
14. Roddam — 93 144 
15. Rolla — 82 434 
16. Tadimarri 31 12 93 
17. Tanmala — 28 90 
18. Talapula — 284 136 
19. Thimmapalli — 35 77 
20. Yadiki — 16 115 
21 Yerragunta — 4 )22 

18—3 



233 6th July, 1968. Written Answers to Question 

( ! ) (2) (3) (4) (3) 

CHITTOOR DISTRICT 

1 Bammasamudram 96 24 
2 B KothaKota — — 

3 Chowdepalh 10 10 24 
4 Chiragottigallu — 44 209 
5. Chembedu 10 — 39 

Empedu 18 31 49 
7. Errakotapalli 13 — 68 
8 Ganmmitta — — 70 
9. Irala — — 183 

10. Kammapalli 4 16 18 
11 Karvetmagar 10 l 8 
12. Nagari 3 10 44 
13. Nimmapalli — 18 63 
14. P Kotha Kota 12 — 26 
15 Raipalem 12 — 

16 Puhcherla 5 17 98 
17 Renigunta 3 — 43 
18. Racherla — — 14 
19 Ramasamudram 26 80 
20. ThambalapaHi — — 152 
21. V. Kota 26 — 80 
22* Pichatur Block — — 4 

CUDDAPAH DISTRICT 

l . Khaj!pet 2 15 212 
2. Nandimandalam 20 14 163 
3. Payasampalh 5 2 145 
4 Surabhi 33 4 199 
5. Rly Kodura 5 94 274 
6. Kondapuram 49 37 337 
7, Vaddirala 17 147 
8. Kaliuru 4 

17 
119 

9 Duvvuru 16. 7 138 
10 Narasapuram 11 222 
11. Mtdmamcheda 21 191 
!2. Badve! Kodura 3 6 140 
18. SanthdkoyYuru 7 5 288 
14 Devapat!a 7 9 115 
15 Madhavaram 8 41 223 
16 Akepadu 

41 
140 

17. Rajupalem — — 306 
EAST GODAVARI DISTRICT 

1 Samalkota 105 92 816 
2 Panduru 54 149 152 
3 Dugguduru 32 78 245 
4. Karapa 198 301 983 
S Anaparty 348 578 547 
6 Mandapeta 166 142 485 
7 Pamarru 109 98 227 
8 Ku&duru 159 168* 159 i 



Written Answers to Que&tloas. 6th July, 1958- 2^3 

(1) (2) (S) (4) (3) 

(East Godavart district-contd ) 
9 Bhimanapalli 82 280 198 

10 Godilanka — 154 
11. T Kothapalh 107 227 288 

Nagaram 154 231 275 
13. Lakkavaram 152 194 300 
14. Ubalanka 122 92 202 
15. Vanapalli 81 120 168 
16. Rajanagaram 143 198 279 
17 Korukonda 252 181 411 
18 Kotikcsavaram 837 213 144 
19. Kandrakota 310 117 4^8 
20 Rangampeta 203 58 680 
21 Sankhavaram 66 143 204 
22̂  Yelcswaram 46 126 179 
28. Virava 186 180 330 
24 Rachapally 215 138 658 
25. Ravikampadu 96 41 634 
26. Kotananduru 56 55 833 
27. Addatccgala Block 47 — 197 
28 Rajavemmangi Block 42 — 360 
29 Marcdumilli Block — — 80 
30 Rampachodavaram Block — — 326 

G U N T U R DISTRICT 
Ethamukkala 11 — 110 

2. Vomulapadu 8 — 1 
3. Maddipadu ' 5 9 98 
4. Ammanabrolu 12 3 45 
5- Korsapadu 11 — 80 
6. Nadendla 23 8 59 
V. Rcddipalcm 21 37 342 
8. Santhamagulur 6 — 121 
9 Daggupadu 2 — 68 

10. Pittalavaripalem 3 14 19 
11. Vetapalem 36 11 2 A3 
12 Visweswaram 9 — 286 

-13 Nizampatam 86 2 85 
14 Kanagala 22 8 89 
15. Gadevaripalli 4 

40 
4 136 

16. Uppalapadu 
4 

40 59 513 
17. Machavaram 12 26 235 
IS. Chandrajupalem 9 22 183 
19. Nudurupadu 4 10 263 
20. Attalur 3 — 38 
21. Pamdam 5 1 64 
22. Nuzendla — — 188 
28. Ipur 4 — 41 
24. Amruthalur 20 2 126 
25. Emam 5 11 144 
26. Kollipara 4 11 101 
27. Sagamj aga rla m ud l 7 9 828 



2<54 6thJu!v, H)3S. Written Answers to Questions 

W (2) (3) (4) (3) 

(Guntur Distnct-contd) 
28 Nuthakki 19 23 178 
29 Mandapadu 57 
SO. Tbuilur — — 66 
81 Katrapadu — - — 333 
32 Pandrapadu — — 18 
H3 Mjrtur — 44 

HYDERABAD DISTRICT 
1. Hayathnagar 95 302 128 
2 Narsmghi 40 231 318 
2 Shankeipalh 183 368 621 
4 Sbannrpet 122 493 1,119 
5 Peddamul 249 112 84 
0 Poddur 181 2961 
7 Mommpet 60 1'37J 549 

*s. Ycharam 68 888 561 
Maheswaram 45 250 214 

10. Doma 40 264 211 
K H A M M A M DISTRICT 

1 Aswaraopet — 320 111 
Bamgandiapad 9 17 

3. Erragunta 59 — 867 
4. Kallur 8 145 48 
5 Kamepally 5^8 ' — 88 
b. Nalakondapally 1,118 — 32 
7. Nellipaka — — 25 
8 Pedagopaihi Not setup then — 26 
9 Pinapak* — — 4 

10, Satyanarayanapuram Not setup them — 

11. Sulhanagar — — 18 
12 Tirumalayapalem 376 262 138 
13 Warya 72 — 3 
14 Bhadrachalam — 342 
15. Khammam — 306 
16 Kothagudem — 405 
17. Kunauaram — 430 
18. Madhira — 191 
IP. Sudhimalla — 626 
20. V R. Puram 258 
21. Venkatapuram — 306 
22. Yellandu — 313 

K A R I M N A C A R DISTRICT 
L Kothapalh 2 182 15 
2 Thotapalh — 189 213 
8. Gundt 7 236 333 
4. Mailial 86 128 171 
5. Ra3kal — 130 287 
6. Dharamapurt 10' 90 104 
7 Ibrahimpatnam 95 239 
8. Ambaripet 93 3t) 389 



Written Answers to Questions. 6th July, !968, 

(1) (2) (3) (4) (3) 
(Kanmnagar D!strict)-conid. 

9 BHantakunta 39 71 245 
10 Pothgal 30 270 579 
11 Chendurthy 17 188 461 
12 Husnabad 80 235 207 
13 Vangara 75 311 52? 
14 Veldi — 41 
15 Kalalapur 282 425 584 
16. Kolanoor 53 64 187 
17. Madarata — 

187 

18 Kataram — 

19. Snrampur 48 108 138 
20. Muthram a 33 161 

KRLSHNA DISTRICT 
1. Buchavaram l 76 
2 Penugaachiprolu 18 5 48 
3 Chandrallapadu 33 48 73 
4. VeeruHapadu 19 38 88 
3. Gampalagudem 21 129 
6. Telladevarapalh l 131 
7 Sagguru — 156 130 
8. Musnur 2 2 6 45 
9. Veerava'li 24 15 426 

10. Peda Avutapalh 8 5 
426 

11. Katur 6 — 64 
12. Veerankjlock Not opened 59 
13 Thotlavallur Not opened 121 
14. Velagalaru JL0 — 205 
15. Moturu 27 123 80 
16. Venttapragada 16 52 61 
17. Malleswaram 47 120 108 
18. Guduru — 96 161 
19. Koduru 47 55 188 
20 Ghantasalapalem 23 34 64 
21 Seethanaapallt 27 130 339 
22 Rudrapaka 26 177 144 
23. Gudibanda. — 113 — 

KURNOOL DISTRICT 
1 ELalludevarakuata — 14 377 
2. Kostgt — 42 135 
3. Parumaachala 21 75 30o 
4. Gaju-apalh - 33 48 175 
5. Bandi Atmakur 12 28 31 
6. Maddur — 16 27 
7. Panyam 17 32 , 42 
8 Thimtnapuram — 16 Jt38 
9. Gadivemula 2 12 60* 

10. Jaladurgam — 151 242 
11, Peddathumbalam 37 SO 212 
12. Hardagett 46 20 ^01 



356 6ib July, t96§. Written Answers to Quests ^ 

(1) (2) (S) (4) (S) 

Kurnool District)-contd. 

13 Kammarchcdu 27 29 122 
14 Pagidiyala — 49 459 
15 GonegandlA 16 38 37 
16. Pcr!us0mula — 10 72 
17 Uyyalawada — — 30 
18 Polakal 7 — 157 
19. Thippayalpalem — — 54 
10 Hussamapuram 2 28 70 
2L Velpanur 3 110 109 
32. Palkur — 24 66 
23 Ardhaveedu 7 — 73 
24 Galazerugulla — 4 65 
23 Yerragondapalem — 10 54 
26 Rudravaram 29 19 93 
27. Yallur — 30 30 
2$, An^malaveedu 17 20 38 

MAHABOOBNAGAR DISTRICT 
1 Amangal 402 360 682 
2. Perur 79 $4 42 
3 ChnnmAchintakunta 75 73 33 
4 Kondurg 145 200 284 
5. Keshampet 125 157 145 
6. Nawabpct 207 358 94 

P*lcm 226 230 124 
8. Raghupatipet 809 171 811 
9. Manopad 127 127 59 

30. Dhanwada 105 116 27 
11 Pebbair 473 473 141 
12 Veepanandla 423 441 617 
13 Uppaiah , 121 121 119 
14 Jamapet — — gy 
15 Angadiraichur — 34 
16 Revallay — 40 
17 Kotababad — 1 
18 Utnoor — ^ 

M B D A K DISTRICT A T S A N G A R E D D Y 
1 Atmakur 14 3tg 
2 Mogdampally — 239 
8 Mirazapur 
4 Sirgupoor 
5 Sbivampet 
6 Kowdapalh 
7 Tekmal 
8 Narsmghi 
9 Yeldurthy 

10 Nagnoor 
11 Dubbak 
12 Pullur 
13 Jaggapur 
14 Vergal 
15 Pulkal ' 

— 17 172 
— — 10 
— 63 170 
15 — 140 
— 32 483 
— 127 3:0 
18 , 1 0 
27 100 748 
37 45 406 
— 52 184 

21 
18 744 

21 61 368 
— — 50 



Written Answers to Questions^ 6th July, 1968. 257 

(I) J(2) (S) (4)_ 
N A L G O N D A DISTRICT 

1 Suryapet 
2 Alair 
3 Muugodu 
4 PeddadevalpaHi 
5 Nagaram 
6 Motakudur 
7 Ramannapet 
8 Narekal 
9 Choutuppal 

10 Miryalaguda 
11 Gudipalli 
12 Nalgonda 

1 Podalkur 
2 Iskapalem 
3 Tallur 
4 Vargonda 
5 Vajjavaripalem 
6 Ananthasagaram 
7 Mypadu 
8 Kamcpalle 
$ Marripadu 

10 Nagircddipalli 
11 Anumasamudram 
!2 Mallam 
13 Chmtavtram 
14 Balircddipalem 
15 Thurimerla 
16 Tegaramudi 
17 Kurichedu 
18 Gattupalli 
19 Kovvurpalli 
20 Yellayapalem 
21 Dachur 
22 Konakamitla 
23 Kakarla 
24 Ulavapadu 
25 Xamgtri 
26 Podili 

130 

31 

24 

NELLORE DISTRICT 
14 
5 

25 
15 ^ 

11 
7 
2 
1 

3 
83 
27 

3 
3 

203 
174 

53 

2$0 

184 
109 

41 

125 

32 
73 

89 

6 
21 
20 
4 

10 

19 
78 
54 
13 

86 
5 
6 

11 

N I Z A M A B A D DISTRICT 

Navipet 
2 Dharapalli 

Varm 
Ranjal 
Madnoor 
Pitlam 
Brraphad 

8 Degaon 
9 Beemgal 

(5) 

496 

209 

595 

295 
295 

129 

53 
69 
50 

113 
42 
76 
59 
63 

117 
53 
60 
69 

50 
59 

46 
59 

189 
65 
57 

54 

15 34 156 
13 31 22 
45 48 267 
11 160 340 
32 50 175 
18 61 169 
46 250 301 
21 174 113 
24 124 150 



2<54 6thJu!v, H)3S. Written Answers to Questions 

(1) (2) (8) (4) (3) 

(Nizamabad district)-contd 

10 Mortad 46 213 112 
11 Bh&noor — 144 485 
?2 Yella Reddy Block 1 — 201 
13 Dhoomakunda 55 — 54 

V I S A K H A P A T N A M DISTRICT 
1 Payakaraopeta — 28 108 
2 Nakkapilh 11 21 108 
3 Kas mkota 5 27 235 
4 Kamthi 5 3 151 
5 RambilH 64 16^ 108 
6 Aganumpudi — 25 392 
7 Pendurtht 14 23 27 
8 Sabbavaram 5 5 663 
9 VAyyampeta 8 30 148 

10 Lankavampalem 11 13 396 
11 Pedama jipalem 2 7 71 
12̂  Mopada 10 32 109 
13 Kotaurla ^ 22 423 411 
14 Mathavaram 27 75 364 
15 Rolugunta 3 1 134 
16 Hukumpet 10 — 14 
17 Dumbnguda — 1 — 
18 Thurakalapudi — — 233 
19 Chowdrvada — — 157 
20 Alamanda — — 50 
21 Nelhmarala — — go 
22 K .J Puram — ^ — 517 
23 Lakkavarapukota — ' — 55 
24 Sarvasidhi 1 
25 Downnoor y Not yet started Family Planmng work as a routine* 
26 MunclnputJ 

SRIKAKULAM DISTRICT 
1 Kav^ty 
2 Mattamsaripalli 
3 Har:puram 
4 Akkupalh 
5 D G Puram 
6 Kothapalli 
7 Kothauru 
8 Budithi 
9 T^laru ^ 

:o Palah 
11 Dusi 
12 Sreekurmum 
13 GuttavilH 
14 Bitivada 
15 Pogm 
16 Badang^ 
17 Piridi 

2 32 519 . 
11 20 77 

ioo SI 411 
— 14 

1 2 6 532 
— 9 65 
— 4 924 
18 32 131 
12 23 802 
12 59 512 
17 54 1,126 
12 16 635 
— 35 155 

9 172 
12 48 105 
— 18 83 
30 ^ 36 ^ 639 

' ' 4 



Written Answers to Questions^ 6th July, 1968. 259 

( i ) (2) (3) (4) (5) 

Srikakulam Distr ct-Contd. 
18 Challapcta 7 835 
19 Garugubilli — 23 96 
20 MondcmkhaHu — ,— 114 
21 Garbham — 31 125 
22 Pathailapalli 22 19 570 
23 Kmtah 41 49 620 

W A R A N G A L DISTRICT 

l Sangam 181 373 478 
2 Damcra — — , 441 
3 Gagcrgadh 146 83 355 
4 Komerla 701 600 
5 Bachannapct 117 . 456 
6 Ladnoor — 483 
7 Palakurthy — 26 678 
8 Maripcda 187 254 97 
9 Baipal 258 386 

10 Duggonda — — 199 
11 Chclpur — 25 145 
12 Shayampct 23 23 164 
13 Chittiyal — — 68 
14 Mangapet — — 16 
15 Parwathagiri 994 50 130 
16 Ncllikudur — 130 
l7 Gudur 39 60 18 

WEST G O D A V A R I DISTRICT 

1 Bhimadole 104 80 358 
2 Denduluru — 118 322 
3 V. R Gudem 43 244 571 
4 Mudunuru 12 223 252 
5 Pedanmdrikolanu 44 107 249 
6 Kanuru 164 176 
7 Manchik 30 256 287 
8 A . Vemavaram — 51 153 
9 'Lankalakoderu 6$ 156 246 

10 Madcpadu 32 108 172 
11 Mogaltur 29 98 199 
12 Malakapalh 4 25 375 
13 Gopalapuram 29 65 387 
14 Yendagandi 50 109 260 
15 KaUa 67 109 260 
16 Tademalla 62 81 
17 Komthiwada 39 147 178 
18 Kamavarapukota 71 265 187 
19 Lmgapalem 51 236 323 
20 Bu^ayagudem — 68 284 
21 L. N . D. Peta 17 147 104 
22 
23 

Koyyalagudem 
Padapadu 42 

157 
64 

232 
132 

1 8 - 6 



MS 6th M y , M ' Written Answers to Quen on, 

AUXILIARY NURSING AND TEACHERS* TRAINING COURSES 

(A) Q-Sarvasn Mnvisha l Pitti, Ah^ied Hnssam and 
B, V, R m m y y a , -W i l l the hon. Minister for Social Welfare be 
pleased to stiite: 

(a) the number of persons irom the Service Homes who have 
been admitted to the Auxiliary Nursing and Teachers' Trunin; 
courses during 1966-67, 

(b) the mount spent during 1966-67 on each of (he service 
home;, 

* 

(c) whether these service homes Me proposed to be started in 
o&er districts aiso, and 

(d) if so districts in which they are proposed to be started and 
the time by which they are likely to be started! 
A ; -

The information is placed on the Table of the House, 



INFORMATION PLACED ON THE TABLE OF THE HOUSE 
Vide L A. Q No. 278S-A (Starred) (* 25*7) 

(a) the number of persons from the Service Homes who have been admitted to the Auxiliary Nursing and Teach-
eis Training Courses during 1966-37 

NUMBER OF PERSONS ADMITTED 

S. No. 

No of persons 
admitted from 
t h e Service 
Home. Hyde-
rabad. 

No of persons 
admitted 'Rom 
t h e Service 
Home Ananta-

pur. 

No of persons 
admitted from 
t h e Service 
Home Hanu-
makonda. 

No of persons 
admitted from 
t h e Service 
Home Kanna-
puram 

No oi Persons 
admitted from 

t h e Service 
Home, Vijaya-
wada 

Reasons for not 
admitting any in-

mates 

0* p 

c 
so 
o" a 

1. Auxiliary 
Nursing 
Course. 17 11 Nil Nil 

Teachers Tra-
ining Course. Nil Nil 

No candidates 
were forthcoming 

Nil to thezc courses 
from Service Ho-
mes at Hanuma-
konda and Vija-
yawada for the re-
ason that these 
Homes started 
functioning &om 
March 1967 only. 
As regards Service 

Nil Home Kannapu-
iam some inmates 
are not willing to 
take up these cou-
rses whilesome do 
nt ( possets the r c 
quired educatio 
nal quliRcation 

<3\ 

g 

33 <3) GO 



2<54 6thJu!v, H)3S. Written Answers to Questions 

(b) The amount spent during 1966-67 on each of the Service 
Home * 

Service Home Hyderabad Rs. 1,12,388-CO 
-do- Hanumakonda Rs 8,621-37 
-do- Anantapur Rs. 87,125-00 
-do- Vijayawada Rs. 10,155-25 
-do- Kannapuram R*. 48,049-44 

(b) Whether these Service Homes are proposed to be started 
m other Districts also. 
A.— No Sir. 

(d) if so the distncts in which they are pioposed to be staitel 
and the time by which they are likely to be started — 
A — 

Does not arise. 

ISSUE OP PATTAS TO HARIJANS AND POOR PEOPLE 

2508— 
*4185Q—Sri P Gunnayya —Will the hon. Minister for 

Revenue and Civil Supplies be pleased to state : 
(a) whether it is a fact that the Government has issued a G. O 

to issue pattas*to Harijana and peoi people fbr all the existing banjar 
land before the end of December. 1968, and 

(b) if so, whether a copy of the said G. O. will be laid on the 
Table of the House? 
A . — 

(a) Yes Sir. In fact the instructions were to complete the work 
by the end of December, 1967. 

(b) A c o p y o f G . O Ms^No 767 Revenue dated 4-8-1967 is 
placed on the Table of the House. * -

PAPERS LAID ON THE TABLE OF THE HOUSE 
(Vide)-Ciause (b) of the L. A Q No 4135 (Starred) (*2508) 

GOVERNMENT OF ANDHRA PRAD SH 
. A B S T R A C T 

ASSIGNMENT - Land - Distribution of Government Waste 
Lands and expeditious issue of pattas to the landless poor, political 
sufferers etc ,-Appointment of Special Revenue and Survey Staff-Pro-
posals - Orders - Issued 

REVENUE DLPARTMENT 
G. O. Ms No 767 , Dated the 4th August 1967 

Read.— 
i From the Board of Revenue reference No. Bi-6045/66 

dated 7-6-1967 
li. From the Board of Revenue reference No Bl-6045/66 

dated 26-6-1967. 
Hi. From the Board of Revenue reference No. Rc. 

Pl-21982/67, dated 7-7-1967. 
O R D E R 

In order to expedite the work of assignment of Government 
waste lands m the State and issue pattas in cases where lands have 
already been allotted to the landless poor, and Tribal people etc., the 
Collectors and the Board of Revenue were requested to send proposals 
for additional staff if they felt the need for it. The Board of Revenue 



Written Answers to Questions^ 6th July, 1968. 263 

has accordingly submitted consolidated proposals m this regard, both 
on the Revenue side and on the Survey side The Government have 
carefully examined the staff proposals of the Board of Revenue and 
accord sanction to the appointment of the additional revenue staff 
specified m Annexure-1 to this order 

2 As regards the Survey staff in Andhra Area there is already 
Special Staff sanctioned m G O Ms No 1531, Revenue daced 30-12-1966 
for the splitting up of joint pattas The Board of Revenue has repor-
ted that there will be sufficient number of Deputy Surveyors whose 
services can be utilised for the Sub-Division work and survey "conne-
cted with the Assignment of lands The Board has also instructed all 
the Collectors to utilise the services of Deputy Surveyors for assign-
ment work pending posting of the Supervisory staff The Board has 
requested that m order to supervise the work of Deputy Surveyors 
to be employed for assignment work permission may be accorded 
to 611 up the posts sanctioned m G O Ms. No. 1531 Revenue 
dated $0-12-1966 under the splitting up of joint pattas scheme. The 
Government accord permission to Rll up the posts specified in Annex-
ure-11 in this order. 

3 As regards the Survey staff in Telangana Area, the Govern* 
ment sanction the staff as noted m Annexure-111 to this order, 

4* The period of sanction for the staff specified m the Annexu-
res I to I I I shall be for a pe iod of five months from the date of appo-
intment or till the necessity ceases whichever is earlier The staff 
will be eligible to draw the dearness allowance and other allowances 
admissible to them under the rules The Government also direct that 
staff must be drawn from the surplus that i* available or to be availa-
ble m any Department and the staff must be able to function before 
the 13th August 1967 

5. The expenditure on the Revenue staff, shall be debited to 
the appropriate sub-heads under "19-Gcneral Administration District 
Administration etc and the expenditure on the Survey staff shall be 
debited to the appropriate sub-heads under "9-Land Revenue*' 

6 As there is no provision in the Budget for the above staff, 
this shall be treated as a New Service Scheme and orders will be iss-
ued from the Finance (BG) Department for meeting the expenditure 
from the contingency Fund pending supplementary grant The Board 
of Revenue is requested to submit proposals for supplementary grant 
at the appropriate time for the additional expenditure required during 
the current Financial Year and provide necessary funds m the Budget 
for 1967-68. 

7. The Board of Revenue is also Requested to obtain monthly 
progress reports about the progress of work done by the Revenue and 
Survey Staff and see that the assignment work is completed by the end 
e f this year* 

8. This ofder issues with concurrence of the Finance bepari-
ment vide their U.O* No 30893/A/Expr., dated 4-$-1967, 



364 6th July, 196$. Wntteh Answers to Questions. 

A M N E X U R E - I 

Name of the District No of posys sanctioned with scales of 
pay under each category of posts. 

Deputy Lower Revenue Peons 
Tahsildars Division Inspector* (Scale of 
(Scale of Clerks (Scale of payRs. 
piy (Scale of Rs. *0-4- 50-1-59-

Rs 220-10- payRs. 103*3-130) 2-65) 
820) 80 4-100-

3-130). 

Srtkakulam 1 1 4 3 

Visakhapatnam 2 2 8 10 

Bas{: Godavan 1 1 4 3 

Wett Godavari 3 3 13 13 

Krishna 4 4 16 20 

Guntur 8 3 13 

Neliore 13 * 18 32 63 

Chittoor 8 8 32 40 

Anantapur 3 3 12 13 

Cuddapah 3 3 12 13 

Kumool 2 2 8 10 

Mahaboobnagar 4 4 t6 20 

Ntzamabad 3 3 20 23 

AdiJabad 3 5 20 25 

Kartmnagar 6 6 24 30 

Warangal 7 7 28 83 

Khammam S S 32 40 

Nalgonda 10 10 40 30 

Hyderabad 3 2 8 U 
Medak 10 10 40 3 ) 

Total 100 lOo 400 3J0 



Written Answers to Questions 6 th July, 1968, 263 

A N N B X U R B - I I 

Name of District No. of posfs permitted to be Riled up with 
scales of pay for each category of posts 

Inspectors of 
Survey & Land 
Records Scale 
of p*y (Rs. 
180-10-290-

15-850). 

Deputy Ins-
pectors Scale 
of pay (Rt-
123-5-R0-7 
1/2-220). 

Surveyors 
Scale of 
pay Rs 
100-A-120-
3-130 

(1) (2) (8) W 

Srikakulam 3 
Visakhapatnam — 3 2 
Bast Godavari — 4 2 
West Godavari — 3 2 
Krishna — 4 
Guntur — 4 
Nellore i 4 i0 
Chittoor 3 4 
Anantapur — 3 2 
Cuddapah — 3 2 
Kurnool — 4 — 

Total : 2 38 24 

A N N B X U R B - I I I 

Name of the District No. of posts sanctioned with scales of pay 
under each cattgo y of post:. 

Inspectors 
of Survey 
& Land 
Records 
Scale of 

pay^ (Rs. 
180-10-
290-15-
350). 

Deputy Ins-
pectors of 
Survey & 
Land Reco-
rds Scale of 
pay (Rs. 123* 
5-160-7 1/2-
220) 

Surveyors 
Scale of 
pay (Rs. 
100-4-120 
5-150) 

Peons scale 
of pay (Rs 
50-1-39-2-
63). 

( i ) (2) (3) (4) (3) 

Mahaboobnagar — , 2 19 2 
Nizamabad — 1 6 1 
Adilabad l 25 4 
Karimnagar — 1 7 1 
Warangal 1 2 22 3 
Khammam l 8 36 4 
Medak 1 24 4 
Nalgonda 1 2 24 $ 
Hyderabad — 1 7 1 

Total : 5 18 174 23 



"68 6th July, 1968. Pavilege Motion given notice of by Sr* 
otn juiy, i ^ o . ^ Ratnasabhapathi against Sn M. 

Gopalachan B A ,BL., on behalf of 
his client Sn G. Venkiah Naidu 
(Refeired to the Privileges Commi-
ttee) 

UPGRADING OF KUPPAM DISPENSARY 

2511— 
^ 1880 Q.— Sri D. Venkatesam :— Will the hon. Minister for 

Heaith and Medical be pleased to state : 

(a) whether there is any proposal for upgrading the Kuppam 
Government Dispensary as a Hospital m Chittoor district, and 

(b) if so, when the same will be upgraded ? 

A :— 
(a) & (b) Orders have issued upgrading the Hospital at Kuppam 

and Shancial details aic under consideration. 

ANNOUNCEMENT 

DECISIONS OF THE BUSINEIS ADVISORY COMMITTEE 

Mr. Speaker *-1 am to announce to the House the following decisions^ 
of the Business Advisory Committee meeting held on 5th July, 1968— 

8-7-68 . 1. The Andhra Pradesh Objectionable Performances 
(Monday) Prohibition (Amendment) Bill, 1968. 

2, The Andhra Pradesh Lotteries Bill, 1968 
3. The Andhra Pradesh (Krishna and Godavari 

Delta Area) Drainage Cess Bill, 1968 (As repor-
ted by the Select Committee) 

9-7-68 .. The Andhra Pradesh (Krishna and Godavari Delta 
(Tuesday) Area Drainage Cess Bill, 1968 (As reported by the 

Select Committee) 
10-7-68 . . The Andhra Pradesh Excise Bill, 1968. 
(Wednesday) 
11-7-68 ., The Andhra Pradesh Excise Bill, 1968 
(Thursday) 
12-7-68 .. Non-oScial Day 
(Friday) 
13-7-68 The Andhra Pradesh Excise Bill, 1968. 
(Saturday) 
14-7-68 .. Holiday 
(Sunday) 
15-7-68 Discussion on White Paper on Language/' 
(Monday) 

PRIVILEGE MOTION GIVEN NOTICE OF SRI B RATNASABHAPATHI 
AGAINST SRI M . GOPALACHARI BA. BL., ON BEHALF OF HIS 

CLIENT SRI G ' VENKIAH NAIDU. 

Mr. Speaker :— There is a privilege motion given notice of by 
Sn B. Rataasabhapathi which reads as follows ; 



Privilege Motion g<ven notice of b̂  Sn 6th July, 1968. 267 
B Ratn s^bhapathi against Sri M 
Gop^lacha^i B ,B L , on behalf af 
hi^ client Sn G % ênki h N^id^-
(Referred to the Privileges Commi-
ttee) 

^ I propose to move the foHoivmg privilege motion m the 
Assembly on a day fixed by you. 

'One Sri M Gopala Cbari, B A B L on behalf of his client 
G Venkataah^Iadu and issued to mc a notice threatening legil 
action on me fbr a speech I have m?de on IRth March, 1^68, the 
summary of which had been published m the Daily Paper "Visha-
landhra ' on 19 3-19G8 at page No 1 column No 4 The Notice m 
original is herein apoe ded The action of the said Advocate and 
his client is iliegal and unconstitutional and causes breach of my 
privilege as member of the Assembly 

The notice reads as under 

"Under the instructions from my client, Sn G Venkaiah Naidu, 
Advoeate, NeHore, I issue the following notice to you 

1. That m a Daiiy News Paper by name "Visalandhra" dated 
19-3-1968 at page 1 Column 4 it is printed and published that you 
have made a statement on the Boor of the hon Assembly on 18-3 -1968 
alleging that Sri N Chenchurama Naidu hon. Minister for Municipal 
AdmmisTtrotion and Forests, Government of Andra Pradesh has depo-
sited a sum of Rs 50,000 m favour of one Venkiah Naidu the 
co-.on-ia-law of the above Minister at State Bank of Hyderabad out 
of the collections alleged to have been made by him fbr the Election 
Fund 

$ That my client instructs mc to put you on notice that the 
above statement alleged to have been made by you on the floor of 
the Assembly is false and the said imputations have been made by 
youwamonly without any legal or factual justification, truth, good 
faith or fair comment and to defame my client 

3 That my chcnt is the co-son-m-law of the above Minister 
bearing the above name said to have been referred by you and as 
such the said imputations are directed aimed at and relates to him 
and the same has afiected him adversely. Therefore I call upon you 
under instructions to inform my client within a week from the date 
ot the reecipt of the notice ( i ) whether you have made any such 
statement referred above on the ftoor of the Assembly, (2) and m 
which case if yo ! have*made so to divulge the source of information 
on the strength of which you are alleged to have made such a state-
ment, failing which my client will be constrained to have recourse to 
law as against you and others responsible fbr such a publication with 
all consequences and costs incidental thereto Sd/- Advocate " 

What do you want me to do, Mr Ratnasabhapathi? 

Sri B Ratnasabhapathi —Sir, this is a very straight issue. He 
has issued a legal notice to me with reference to a speech I have 
made m the Assembly. The speech I have madem the Assembly 
forms part of the proceedings of this House As per the CoasMut;o a 

1 8 — 7 



263 6'h July, 1S63. Pnv lege Monon given notice of by Sn 
B Rat̂ ^asabhapdthl against Sn M 

Gop^: cha 1 B A ,B L , on behalf of 
hs client S i G Venhah Nidu 
(Ref^rre t to the Privileges Commi-
ttee) 

and also the practice followed in the House of Commons, it is a 
dear case of breach of privilege 

Mr Speaker -There in no necessity for you to go into the 
facts I am only asking one thing whether you want it to be taktn 
up by the House or you want it to be referred to the Privileges 
Committee 

Sri B. Ratnasabhapathi —Let it go to the Privileges 
Committee, that is what I wan, to ask yoj. Let it go to the 
Privileges Committee 

Sri A Madhava Rao ,—I want to say something in this matter 
Irrespective of other consideiations, the pomts that arise for 
coisider tion— 

Sn B Ratnasabhapathi - It is a straight case The Speaker 
can refer it to the Privileges Committee without any discussion. 

Mr Speaker -That is what I am asking. Mr Madhava Rao 
seems to have so^e objection What is his ob)ection ? 

Sn A. Madhava Rao —Irrespective of other considerations, 
there are two points to be considered. 

Mr Speaker*—If I wanted to disallow it I cauld have done 
it l^ow I am asking whether you w^nt it to be takenup straight 
by the House 

Sri A, Madhava Rao -Apart from the personalises concer-
ned, here there are two'points to be considered. One i* whether the 
Advocate is competent to issue a notice to the person concerned to 
s'iow from what source of information he has spoken m the Assembly 
and whether it was a fact that he spoke m the Assembly. That is 
one pomt. The other point is whether any per on abo* t whom a 
reference had been published m the piper is compenteiit to cal! upon 
the member to divulage the mformati m with reference to which he 
isspeaknxg These things are not m a*ty way concerned with the 
Assembly and they *re far away from the AsseTbh. 

Mr Speaker'—AH these things will be "considered by the 
Privileges Committee. 

Sri A. Madhava Rao '—Whenever any matter— 

Mr Speaker:—AH these points wi!l be considered Not only 
that, after the report of the Privileges Committee is received, the 
House will take it up 

Sri A Madhava Rao —I am not standing in the way mregard 
to th. t matter What I am saying t?, h any matter is to be re&trcd 
to the Privileges Committee, there must be a prima &cic casein 
regard to the Advocate and ins chent. That is a matter t<? be conside* 
êd now* 



Business of the House 6th Ju!y, 1968 269 

Mr. Speaker Is it your contention that it is not a At case ? 
Sn A Madhava Rao —*I say there is no case The 

Advocate is competent to issue a notice whenever a client says with 
regard to any information not covered by tho^e procee hngs 

Mr Speaker —There is a clear provision in the Constitution 
under which for whatever a member says he is immune from any kmd 
of legal action 

Sri A Madhava Rao *—I agree True— 
Mr Speaker - If that is so, su posing somebody gives a 

notice, does it amount to breach of privilege or not ? The point 
which you are raising can be considered 

Sn A Madhava Rao — Certainly that may be one view of the 
matter The other view of the matter is 

Mr Spcal er - We are not expressing any opinion at this 
stage, and it won't be proper also for us to express any opinion at 
this stage, because we are referring it to the Privileges Committee. 
It is for ihem to consider all these issues 

Sri A Madhava Rao —If that is that case, whenever any 
matter comes up, it has to be referred 

Mr Speaker .—There is no necessity for you to speak 
Sr C V K Rao —I am very much surprised at the way 

Mr Madhava Rao, our MLA, who is also an Advocate, comes to 
the rescue of anther Advocate, Tomorrow they may even give a 
notice against the Speaker for admitting a thing So, Sir, you have 
to definitely protect the right of a member of this House since he is 
immune for what he says m the House 

Mr Speaker .—If a notice is given to me. I know how to 
protect myself (Laughter) So far as Mr Madhava Rao is concerned, 
forget that he is an Advocate 

Sri G Siviah —An Advocate is Advocat^ He is always 
protected by law. 

Mr Speaker —Now, it will be straightanayreferredtothe 
Privileges Committee for consideration and report 

Sri G Venkat R e d d y W i H the notice be against the Advo-
cate or both of them ? 

Mr. Speaker :—Notice is only against one person, Mr Vcnka* 
lah Naidu. Any way, I will go through the whole thing. 

BUSINESS OE THE HOUSE 

ij^j a. —aargBRrr'a ad-
journment motion Ty*3r* a,g63 

a2r°o-aoa agf Ty^&lh a 13_sp8 tsoST'g'g 

egRtfo €3 D g o v 

33 )j3a'> t s o S ^ a i j^d-Rigo ar° g^OTr* p-*a 



270 6A July, Rusine^s of the House 

Mr Speaker - I thmk it a veiyre^sonaHe suggestion which you 
have made I \ îll certainly consider ^bout it wh thcr I should give 
an opportunity to th;s House to discuss it m the form of an adjourn 
ment motion or under some other provisio i of the rules and give my 
ruling on Monday. 

Mr Speaker .—That is exactly what I am saying If I have 
heard Mr Rajeswara Rao correctly, without going into the merits of 
the other thing, we are only concerned with the unfortunate lot of 
the Harijans and we want a discussion on this matter. It is mly with 
regard to that you have given an adjou"nme <t motion Now, either 
:n the shape of adjournment motion or under Ru!e 63 or under any 
other provision, he wants discussion on the matter. 

— 38 tpoojgR* sjSf^R 

Mr Speaker .— Day after tomorrow I will give my ruliag* 

Mr S p e a k e r I am not in a, position to say anyttnng 

Mr. Speaker - I f you have got anything, please &cnd notic and 
I will certainly consider about it 

TTTOAJcr* 



(jov rnment Resolution * 6Lh July, 2/1 
rg. Es^e duty in :espe t of agricultural Mads 

(SriMaLViuktt^ N^tya'ia losem his.^t ) 

Mr Speaker — I am not pr pared to ans* r^nvof^ou. You 
will get a,n endorsement-1 will ask the oiRcc to give you the endorse-
ment 

(Mr. Deputy Speaker i<i tht Chair) 

GOVERNMENT REbJLUTION 

^ ESTATh DUTY IN RhSPKCT OF AGRI î LI URAL LAWS 

Sri V B Raju . -Sir, I beg to ^nove 

" Whereas during the period of operation of the hoclaniation 
of Emergency, the Estate Duty Act, oi 1953), hay been 
amended by Parliament by the following Acts, namely .— 

I The Central Boards of Revenue Act. 1963 (54 of 1963). 
The Finance Act, 1964 (5 of -964). 

3. The Taxation Laws (Continuation and Validation of Re-
covery Proceedings) Act, 1964(11 of 1<164). 

4 The Direct Taxes (Amendment) Act, 1004 (3! of 1964). 

The Finance Act, 1963 (13 of IOCS) 

6 The Finance (No. 2) Act, 19<*5 (15 of 1965) 

7 The Taxation of Laws (Amendment and Miscellaneous 
Provisions Act), 1965 (4! of 1965); and 

8 The Finance Act, HJ66 (No. lJ of ^ 

AND WHFREAS under clause (2) of aru le 3.50 of ^o Con-
stitution, the Acts aforesaid m so far as diey relate to Cbtat̂  duty m 
respcct of agricultural land, shall cease to ha^e effect o i the expira-
tion of a period of six months after the proclamation has ceased to 
operate; 

AND WHEREAS after tht, proclamation has ceased to opeiate 
Parliament has no power to inike laws for the States except as pro-
vide! m article HM* of the Constitution with respcct to matters speci-
fied m^he Acts aforesaid insofar as they relate to estate dufym 
respect of agricultural lands; 

AND WHEREAS it appears to this Assembly to be desirable 
that the matters specified m the Acts aforesaid should be regulated 
in tfe State by Parliament by law notwithstanding the expiration of 
the period of six months after the Proclamation has ceased to operate, 

NOW, THEREFORE, this Assembly hereby resolves m pur-
suance of artiUe2S<2 of the Constitution that the matters specified 
in the Acts aforesaid m so far as they relate to estate duty in respect 
ofagncul(:ural land should be regulated m the State by Parliament 
by law/' 

Mr. Deputy SpeakerResolution moved* 



6th Juiy, 1068. ^Government Resolution * 
re * Estate duty m respect of agricultutal lands 

g g v ^ ^ o 15-10-53 t^g ^coo*^ 
^^^e^Cb bod ^ ^ g ^ ^ ^ 313g> ^ ^ ^ ^ o 

63 fi * 63 63 a) 

g o ? ^ ^ <s r̂°<3 ^ ^ ^ o ^ J ) ^ v*&5o e 
g ^Obqj^^ saiga* 

-ryogb &T* ^ t ?^ ^TJ^^Q ^ n €J (5 
l^osb SĴ C^ 233 3Jo8. 195^ ^ , . . J^od 

e) $3 — ' 3 g) 

sSj^ 1960 rr* ^ 

^ ^ bod sb^gb ^^ooa. ^ooo g 

g)* -trap :—^Rygeog * * 8 

CO 63 ^ 85 oL 
10-1-68 § ^ S ^ ^ g a R ) ^ 

63 —a CJ 

e^T 10-7-68 

o ej G 
^ e^) ooo^jd). tgR Sb̂ cŝ  ^ ^ g c ^ o e ^ ^ 

-ge oar* 

^ ^ ^ ^ G ^ o ^ ^Deg^ Qo^^olgb 

^ X) D.*S ^guB?, Emergency period g *̂ g 3 



Government Resolution 6th Ju y, 1968. 273 
r* . Estate duty m respect of agricultural lands 

Estateduty Act § 8 RoR^^jogj ae o^eX) 3$ 
va l ida^ 6p3&t)o8. 

^ -o^^) —-cro^) effect 5Shay* explain 

Sri V B Raj'i Under the Central Board of Revenue Act 19 S3, 
the former Centra! Board of Revenue, which is one of the authorities 
under the Estate duty Act, was bifuicated in to the Central Boird 
of Direct T xes and the Centr d Board of Excise and Customs. 

By the Ameidme t Act The F.nance Act 1164), the scope of 
Estateduty liability was extended as to include the agncultuie lands 
situats m the state of Or.s a as well. 

I think State interests wculd not suffer by these Acts, that is 
what I can assure In all these Acts amendment? referred, tn some 
cases, to administrative matters, and, m others^ to formal matters 

Sri C V K ^ao —What is the amendment that has effected us 
and how are we going to modify it? 

gnr*ab. Exemption was also given m respect of one house or part 
thereof exc usively us^d by the deceased for his residence, the exemp-
pon being to the extent of Rs 1 lakh of the v j u e if the house is 
situate ma place wi h a population exceeding 10,000 and the ful value 
ot the house, if the houseis situate m a place with a lesser population 

Under the Principal Act (As amended by Estate Duty (Amend-
ment Act, 1958) half of the court fee paid &n obtaining probate was 
allowed as a deduction from the estate duty payable This relief was 
extended to the full extent of the court fee paid for obtaining probate 
etc 

The prohibition against disclosure of information was removed 
and provision was made, as in the Income Tax Act, to furnish infor-
mation m respect of assessments on application to the Controller. 

The rates of Estate Duty were stepped up considerably, the 
maximum having been enhanced from 40% ever 50 lakhs to 85% 
over Rs. 20 lakhs. 

The Taxation Laws (Continuation and Validation of 
Recovery Proceedings) Act, 1964, is only another amendment. 

Mr Deputy Speaker — Do you want to repeat the whole 
thing? 

Sn V- B Raju : — I have circulated a small bundle containing 
the mam features m the Amendment Acts. 

i j ^ g . et#gss?* 93,y<Rt circulate 



274 6th J Jy, 19f 3. Government Resolution: 
Estate duty m r e j e c t of agricultural lands 

Sn V B Raju —Notes on important changes made in the Estate 
DutyAct, 19:nggActs3; joao&o3 M d ^ r v - ^ ^ g v ^ ^ j 

gjR merest suffei ^ <9(2^50. 

They are actually perfectly m order and these amendments ate s.ife 
amendments and we can easily agree to this resolution. 

(J t̂ :9* interest suffer 
Estate Duty Act ^cr^j^lju ê ^ir^^^bo 

— * 

SriV B Raju —The finance figures have not been worked 
out, because it is a formal resolution 

Sri V B Raju "—It is all a legal and constitutional aspect 
Tne amendments have been passed and for the last 5 or 6 years they 
have been in operation Whether they are administrative changes 
or slight tax changes or duty changes, they arc perfectly aHnght and 
it is a formal resolution 

Federal system <5*** States ^ ^ ^ eppv-truM 
States $ s}3gaRr* 
Estate duty^) States 

10% spabjoiT'RaM States § 
Finance Commission ^ ( foouo^a & g R ^ e M ^ 

^ ^ -aa^.30 ig^uv^ ^ o ^ basn 

j ^ ^ ^ g j u d W ^ ^ ^ ^ o o o ^ ^ ^ j certificate ^ ^ 
registration time ^ o ^ ^ ^ b ^ o ^ o ^ ^ ^ S 

^ n d g ^ X ) ^o^ ^^ ^ ^ J g ir^gbocr* 

^T^go^ anytgab. 196^ ^ 3 ^o- ir-ex) ^p )̂ amend 

^v^d). 2 ^ ^ transfer ^oai 

1966 ^ 

S ^ ^ ^ g acts confusion ^ 



dove.nmeat Resolution ^ f̂ th !y, 8 275 
r^ .Estate duty in respect of Agricultural lanos 

create ^^jur^c^. t ^ - ^ a ' a j j e l ) . 
surrender ig^a ^ ^ i T r ^ ^ ^ T ^ a b o 

abagj^^. ^ Gold bonds ^ ^ ^ ^ 
a ^ o j j ^ estate duty ? ̂ a^ ^ ̂ ajoou^ob. Gold bonds 
Re gR jaa* State $ ^n) 
^amounts -u^yjocr^ ^^ba^a^y^ g v a b ? Emergency 
a ^ a a ^abr ^ Joras^aa ^cooaa ? Emergency per iods* 
TT ê o c o ^ ^ a ^ j ^ a a ^ 3o3, 10^10^68 a emer^ ncy 
^ 6 ibRaA) pass Rj^e 
States ^a j ca . Xhg a^sb^ aba^b 
d^ar -^ j Art* 249 States § a^gb^eab ^ g a y - ^ d ) 

A ^ o i j j ^ A ^ a ^ o j pass g ja Schedule 1, I I ^ ^ o ^ HI 
a*#3oa. Discretion ^Rjgc^^S b^^ab . 

Uniformity r^aabo R a j r ^ ^ M ^ ^ b ^ ^ ^ aa^a^a^ 

e ^ ^ o ^ a y a a ^ a S t a t e s A a m ^ ^ o r ^ 

a ^ a . FoimaHy, valuations m 
exeess of Rs. 1 !akh or Rs. 2 !akhs - 25%. This siab was spitt up 
into two - Rs. 1 and : i<R lakhs.. 15%; and the next Rs. 50,000 
@ 17 The highest siab of ^0% w^s raised from 3 1/2 lakhs 
to 5 lakhs. xbR8Jty3en ^ ^ o ^ ^ o t ^ c r * . 50 s i b a^a 
state ^ v o o o ^ ^ aaj^^j epoMocr* 

abaa ^ s'^o^a* 
{fSo ^ o^bJ* S^Peo 
§ " g^aygb 8000 300 

a ^ d ^ ja^^odS s^oa, ^a^o^f s&oa. 

^ ^ ^ o a ^ ^ a . axb ! 

^ j ^ ^ u j ^ . a atR^ar* direct act s r ^ 



276 6th July 1968. Government Resolution -
' r<? Estate duty m r sp*ct of Agricultural Lmds, 

Mr. Deputy Speaker —He asked two points. !930 g"* <9$ 

^ g) -cr*ap : 1960 ^ ^ 

aaa ^g^of^r-o^ S&go 

^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ deduction ^^S^t 

Sn Vavilala Gopalaknshnayya '—It is only 10% ! know it. 

Mr. Deputy Speaker —Supposing we do not pass this resolu-
tion. What will be the effect ? You will have a right to collect. 

^ *yr3er-s> ^ ^ o g ^ c R l g ? — p a s s igoR^R*^ 
we will have the right to enact. 

^ a. a. TTtap — l f o 3 b ^ 

Mr. Deputy Speaker .—The resolution can be amended. 

Sri V. B Raju .—The question :s whether rescinding of the 
resolution could be done. In 1960 the same Legislature has passed 
a i evolution requesting the Government of India to extend the A<yt, 



Government Resolution 6th Jaly, 1968 27? 
Estate duty m rcspctt of agricultural Imds, 

^ iyPcr*$; ago^orv* 

^ D. v e ? - — ^ Act emergency g j R g R , . 

cj - ^ ej 

eo 
Sn V. B- Raju —That is rescinding the resolution passed by 

the House making the Act applicable. This nsoL'tion merely refers 
to the acceptance of the amending Act^ that are passed durmg the 
period of emergency 

^ -sfDeT'e) — l a s t sentence 
' N o w therefore, this Assembly hereby resohes in pursu-

ance of Article of the Constitution that the matters specified m 
the Acts aforesaid in so far they ielate to estate duty m respect of 
agncultuial land should be regulated m the State by Parlnm^nt by 

Sri V. B. Raju '--That the matters referred to m the s Acts... 

Rjooa* It is already implemented. 

Sri V B Raju * - It is being mixed up By a resolution of the 
Assembly this Act was maJe app icable to Andhra Pradesh During 
the emergency in 68, 8 amending Acts have been passed which 
have been listed. These amending Acts are also in force If you do 
not accent those anendmcnts they will not ha.ve force, but the 
amending Act as such is m force What confusion it wil! create if 
you do not accept them, a is to be legally examined 

^ -Kr*a<y*e? —Article (250) 

" A law made by Paihamcnt which Parliament would not but for the 
issue of a Prodamation of Emergency have been competent to make 
shall, to the extent of the incompetency, cease to have ejection the 
expiration of a period of MX months after the Proclamation has 
ceased to operate, except as respects things done or omitted to be 
done before the expiration of the said period*' qo<ga<&Moa> aSft^a, 

car*tt igc&sfiMg M a n x e s ^ ^ 

Sri V. B. Raju —I am very clear. If th^ resolution is not 
accepted, the result ?s that the amending Acts will not have any effect 
in future from lOth July 

^ -3r*D%r*e : — ^ o ^ RbRsb ^ ^ R^o^?^ 

Sri V. B. Raju The original Act itself is in force-



278 6th My, 1968. Government Resolution' 
re . Estat. duty m respact of Agncultural lands 

Sn Va\i!ala Gopalaknshnayya -There is a vacum 

Mr Deputy Speaker.—Any way. the Government have to 
examine. 

Sn Vavilala Gopalaknshnayya —Here we are concerned only 
with the mam thing 3a ^Oj M^^bo^ot) 

6 10 3 ^w-ODJ. ^ 3o3o 

e) ej ej 

Mr Deputy Speaker .—You will have to bring now enact-
ments 

o 
Sri V B Raju —I am submitting to the hon Member* Let 

us not mixup two things The present resolution has limited scope 
that the amendments made during the emergency shall continue to be 
m force even after 10th July. But supposing the resolution is not 
accep ed, it does not affect the resolution of 1960. The original Act 
will apply 

^ aj^fg-sr'g) — M&rr 3X^<gj3Kr*. 

Mr- Deputy Speaker. —There is no difference of opinion' 

Tae question is : 

" Whereas during the period of operation of the Prcdamation 
^Emergency, the Estate Duty Act, 1953 (34 of 1953), has been 
amended by Parliament by the following Ac s, namely .— 

1 The Central Boards of Revenue Act, 1963 (54 of i<?03) 

2 The Finance Act, 1964 (5 of 1964) 

3. The Taxation Laws (Continuation and Validation of Rece* 
very Proceedings) Act, 1964 (H of 1964) 

4 The Direct Taxes (Amendment) Act, 1964 (3 i of 1964) 

5- The Finance Act, 1963 (10 of 1965) 

6. The Finance (No 2) Act, 1905 (15 of 1965J 

7 The Taxation of Laws (Amendment & Miscellaneous Pro-
visions Act), 1965 (41 of 1965), and 

8 The Finance Act, 1966 (Rfo. 12 of 1966) 

And whereas under clause of Article 250 of the Constitution 
h e Acts aforesaid in so far as they relate to estate duty m respect 
tf agricultural land, sha'l cease to have effect on the expiration of a 
- nod of six months after the pioclamatioa Ras ceased to operate , 



fUbvcmment BiMs : ^th July. 1968. 279 
fhe Andhra Pradesh Public Premises (Eviction 

of unauthorised Occupants) BiH, 1968. 

A. d whereas after the proclamation has ceased to operate, 
Parliament has no power to make taws for the States cxcept as provi-
ded m Article 24') of the Constitunon with iexpect to matters speci-
Sed m the Acts aforesiid m so for as t^ey relate to estate dut, m 
respect of agricultural lands , 

And Whereas it appears to this to be durable that the matters 
speciRed m the Acts aforesaid should be regu!ated m the State by 
Pari amcnt oy law not with btarding the expiration oi the period of 
MX months after the proclamation has cea^ i to operate, 

Now Therefore, this Assembly hereby resolv s in pursuance of 
Article 252 of tin Const!tution that the matters speciBed in the Acts 
aforesaid m so far as they relate to estate duty in respect of agricul-
tural land should be regulated m the State b^ Parliament by law/' 

The motion was adopted' 

GOVERNMENT BILLS 

THE ANDHRA PRADESH PUBLIC P&LMISES (Eviction of Unauthons*H 
Occupants) BiLL, 1968 

The Minister for Communications (Sri J V. Narsmg Rao) -
I beg to move * 

"That the Andhra Pradesh Public Premises Eviction of Un-
authorised occupants) Bill, 1968, be read a hrst tinu " 

Mr. Deputy Speaker —Motion moved. 

ij^ig.a atfaorf-ytg) — ! a n j a ^ ^u^arr- ^aa 
house sites a -s^a, t ^ ^ e i ) -^a 

Actab, ^sActab ^^^ ^ a a * 

Tj^sSb. ^a ^ a o 19616** pass g M Act ^ Section 'D' j jo^ 
*any premises means any land or any building' e>3 3&1 Tr*a oco^^b 
^ land building 38 a^S^o^-g n^Ddr* 

^(fo *r*6b ^ab ^ Act & 
&&Sb-tr*3<3-*S.§ v^^cao ^ab auM Section 5 
-9-*<f*go;( Article 14 8b Rggigs'on-* ^ ^ a High Court 

^ clause I I scope ^ib^a Bill 
Central Act <3** a ^ ^ e x ) 

a)%g"& Act gyror* e R ^ d ^ w 

^ ^ ^ O o ^ S ^ c ^ KoaotPoO esne^ 
60 asr*93b 6)3)93 30 80 a^esb aRbeo 16 a ^ e a 

^ o - a M ^ S b o ^ ^ Sb^a^L goo^bo^ ^drr* ^ o ^ o ^ o j / ^ ^ 



230 6th July, 1968 Government Bills y 
The Andhra Pradesh Public Premises (Eviction 

of Unauthorised oOcupants) Bill, 196 

Appeal s^cr- Direct Judge § appeal g3j§*-*ar*D§ gj^cr* 
Appeal e^^rtfo eĵ cs^ ^ o gcbia-'a 

second appeal Second appeal ^^a 
^ ^ ^ ^ 3r*3o3 Act ^cs^ 5i)3o 
^ j o ^ j ^ o ^c^ex) - ^ D e r ^ o ^ ^ ^ ^ g o ^ g State 
oSBcer ^ o ^ â ^ geaeral proposition rr* ^ Assembly ^ 
3e State OfRcer gŷ ar̂  ^ 8xbo<3D ^nr^^d). -s^cb. 
Sectioa 1 (A) of&cer to be appointed ^X) t yag^ 
districts Tahsildarrank 

3)33, ofRcer rank ^ e ^ g ^ ^ 

^^^^ grny° e p ^ ^ o ^oa &3 enforcemen ^e^go 
^ n n ^ d ^ tsa ee?jgo ^oR^o'S) 
President assent ep^^do,Article254of the constitution Section 
6 (H) oooa Transfer of Property Act Civil Procedure 
Code g)3 ô<T* ^ ^ president assent ^RoS^oR^ 

CT*̂ ) ^t&tB^J ^ o a . 

^^^oc r ' bo <go%6 ^ ^ - v d o ^ ar*cr* ^ e ^ o ^ 

Mr Deputy Speaker . - The question is : 

"That the Andhra Pradesh Public Premises (Eviction of un-
authorised occupants) Bill, 1988, be read a first time " 

The motion was adopted 

Sn J V Narsmga Rao — I beg to move 

"That the Andhra Pradesh Public Premises (Eviction of 
Unauthorised Occupants) Bill, 1968, be read a second time/' 

Mr. Deputy Speaker — Motion moved. 

Sri Vavilala Gopalakrishnayya — I beg to move : 

"That the Bill be circulated for eliciting public opinion/' 

Mr Deputy Speaker Motion moved 
(Pause) 

Mr Deputy Speaker The question is : 

"That the Bill be circulated for eliciting pubhc opinion/' 

The motion was negatived 

Sri Vavilala Gopalakrishnayya :—I beg to move : 

"That the Bill be referred to a Seclect Committee/' 

T Ir* Deputy Speaker Motion moved. 



Government Bills: , ^oth July, 1^68, 2̂ 1 
The Andhra Pradesh Public Premises (Eviction 

of Unauthorised Occupants) Bill, 1968. 

^ ^ ^ o ^ g —7T- idea RSbLo'gi 
^ o ^ public opention ^ ^ ^ t r ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ s b - ^ g j j . Mo ta^ 

^ D ig^^b. ^ ^ ^ ^ 

-g-*63§ T^^^ exemptions g^lbc^Dg 
T^^Sb alternative site cx)-Br*<g9 

major issues 
^^o^nr^Cb Act d^depect. s f ^ tpD S^cr^ ^eoa 
Xj* & why cannot it be refer\ed to a ^lect 
committee. 

^ ^d^o^ir*^ ^—ag house sites sb igRb 

yb^D "Bood^^ a>3o pass Act ^ land and brildmgs 
^X) ^o^ ) ooj%y&) land building gd^ ^ o ^ ^ j o 

^ g j eO building eo sb̂ or̂  . 

Mr. Deputy Speaker .—He wants land also. M 

compensation rr* ^ ^ ^ oc j^o^eX ) . 

^ -c^^er^e /T^^t) Sf^oSbg oojxry^ JS'^A 
a ^ b ^ ^ 

^oa s'gbs ^ ir- R alternative site ooo^ 
RoRo^oA welfare state ^ 
^o^r^bo. ^ ^ ^ pohce ^ e ^ o M , vo^^nr^ 
^o^Xb^d). welfar M f ^ ^ p - * do you 
want to be us the welf&r sta'e or not ? Please let me know. tp&r* CI 
ta-xoH ^oCbcs^^ clause ^<,<5. 

S^^oi, ^ r r ^ house sites ^ tsdjjgp&S 

o ^ X ) Xh33 ^K) wo^cfsb time 

^ *— 

Mr. Deputy Speaker -He is not accepting the explanation 
you haye given. 

^ T3-*D<r*e ^ ^ ^ ^ c & g ^ t b S * house <3** ^o^b 
Ramily & o c r ^ . 



282 6th July, 1968. Government Bills 
The Andhra Pradesh Public Premises (Eviction 

of Unauthorised Occupans) Bill, 1968. 

^ ^ T^^Sb ^ ^ ^ s ^ o ^ a $ Rig' ^ 
obligation ^o&jooa. welfare state <y* 
^^OTT' gb̂  percent e)T03-ar* 

A^-gd : cases & conside-
ration ^ 

^ ^ ' — w e l f a r e state ^nr*^ 
They are still m the Police State or Fuedal 

State Sir* 

Mr Deputy Speaker —Any way you are not accepting this 
amendment Select Committee § ^ o ^ o ^ o ^ T y * ? 

^ -xr-csb 

(^gba — ^ ^ -sr-3^ <a 

CO 

gb̂ csr̂  -cr'̂ oa 

Mr Deputy Speaker.— The question is* 
"That the Bill be referred to a Select Committee 
The motion was negatived. 
Mr Deputy Speaker *— The question is : 
"That the Andhra Pradesh Public Premises (Eviction of unau-

thorised occupants) Bill, 1968, be read a second time/' 
The motion was adopted 

Clauses 2 & 3 
Mr Deputy S p e a k e r T h e question i t : 

s "That Clauses 2 and 3 do stand part of the Bill/' 
The motion was adopted. 
Clauses 2 and 3 were added to the Bill 

CLAUSE 4 
Sri G* S i v i a h I beg to move * 
"In sub-clause (2) (b) ofclause 4 for the words: 'ten days' 

pubstituie the words 'thirty days . 



Government Bills: 6th July, 1968. 283 
The Andhra Pradesh Pu!?lic Premises (Eviction 

of Unauthonsed Occupants) Biii, 1963 

Mr Deputy Speaker :—Amebdment moved 
(Pause) 

Mr Deputy Spea' er — The question is: 
"In sub-clause (2 (h) of clause 4 for the words: 'the days' 

substitute the words 'thirty days'. 
The motion was negatived 
Sri G. Siviah I beg to move . 
"Insert the words by Registered Post and after the words 

notice to be rerved m sub-dausc (8) of clause 4 " 
Mr. Deputy SpeakerAmendment moved 

(Pause) 
Mr Deputy S p e a k e r T h e question is: 
"Insert the words by Registered Post and after the words 

'notice to be served'm sub clause (3) of clause 4*" 
The motion was negatived. 
Mr. Deputy S p e a k e r T h e question is: 
"That Clause 4 do stand part of the Bill" 
1 hat motion was adopted 
Clause 4 nas added to the Bill. 

CLAUSE 5 
Sri G. Siviah : - I beg to move. 
"In sub-clause (2) of clause 5 for the words 'thirty days' 

substitute the words 'sixty day'. 
Mr. Deputy Speaker .—Amendment moved. 

(Pause) 
Mr' Deputy Speaker : - The question is : 
" In sub-clause (2) of clause 3 for the words 'thirty days' 

substitute the words 'sixty day'. 
The motion was negatived. 
Mr. Deputy Speaker: - The question i$ * 
"That clause 3 do stand part of the Hill" 
The motion was adopted. 
Clause 5 was added to the Bill. 

CLAUSE 3 
Sri G. Siviah I beg to move: 
" In sub-clause (1) of clause 6 insert the words 'Telugu Daily' 

the words 'publishing the notice'* 
Mr* Deputy SpeakerAmendment moved, 

(Pause) 
Mr- Deputy Speaker The Question is: 
" In sub clause ( ! ) of clause 6 insert the words; 'Telugu Daily' 

after the words 'publishing the notice , 
18—9 



284 6th July, 1668. Government Bills * 
The Andhra Pradesh Pubhc Premises (Eviction 

of Unauthorised Occupants) Bill, 1968. 

The motion were negatived. 
Mr Deputy SreaLer '—The question is : 
"That Clause 6 do stand part of the BiH 
The motion was adopted 
Clause 6 was added to the Bill. 

CLAUSE 
Sn G. Siviah . — I beg to move . 
"In sub-clause (2) of clause 7 delete the words 'whether before 

or and for the words 'such time' substitute the words 'Ninety days/ 
Mr Deputy Speaker .—Amendment moved-

(Pause) 
Mr. Deputy Speaker '-—The question is: 
< In sub-clause (2) of clause 7 delete the words whether before 

or and fbr the words 'such time' substitute the words : ninety days/' 
The motion was negatived. 
Mr. Deputy Speaker.—The question is 
"That Clause 7 do stand part of the BiM." 
The motion was a adopted. 
Clause 7 was added to the Bill 

CLAUSE 8 
Mr. Deputy Speaker '—The question is: 
"That Clause 8 do staad part of the Bill". 
The motion was adopted. 
Clause 8 was added to the Bill. 

CLAUSE 9 

Sn G Siviah *— I beg to move: 
" la sub-clause (1) of clause 9 delete the words 'or such other 

judici '1 ofRcer . . . m this behalf/' 
Mr. Deputy Speaker .—Amendment moved. 

(Pause) 
Mr Deputy Speaker The question is : 
"In sub-clause (i )ofclause 9 dele e the words or such other 

judiciat ofRcer m this behalf " 
The motion was negatived 
Sn G. Siviah Sir, I beg to move: 
"In sub-clause (2) (a) and (2) (b) and proviso of clause o for 

the words fifteen days' substitute the words 'thirty days/' 
Mr Deputy Speaker.—Amendment moved 

(Pause) 
Mr Deputy Speake rThe question is: 
' In sub-clause (2) (a) and (2) (b) and proviso of clause 9 for 

the words 'Rfteen days substitute the words 'thirty day'. 
The motion was negatived, 



Government BiHs: 6th July, 1968. 285 
The Andhra Pradesh Public Premises (Eviction 

of Unauthorised Occupants) BiH, !968 

Mr Deputy Speaker/— The question is * 
"Th< t clause 9 do stand part of the Bill" 
The motion was adopted 
Clause 9 was added to the BiH 

CLAUSE 0 
Sn G. Siviah . - I beg to move 
"Add the following at the end of clause 10 
'except on the ground of claiming the property m question by 

the occupant or occupants' " ^ 
Mr Deputy Speaker Amendment moved. 

(Pause) 
Mr Deputy Speaker .—The question is: 

' "Add the following at the clause 10 : 
'except on the ground of claiming the property in question by 

the occupant or occupant or occupants'/' 
The motion was negatived' 
Mr Deputy Speaker:—The question is. 
"That clause 10 do stand part of the BiH" 
The motion was adopted 
Clause 10 was added to the BiH. 

CLAUSE 11 
Mr. Deputy Speaker;—The question is: 
"That clause 11 do stand part of the Bill " 
The motion was adopted. 
Clause 11 was added to the BiH. 

CLAUSE 13 
Sri G. Siviah beg to move: 
"In sub clause (2) of clause 12 after the word 'Any' 

insert the word 'Judicial'." 
Mr* Deputy Speaker Amendment moved. 

(Pause) 
Mr* Deputy Speaker The question is: 
" In sub-clause (2) of clause 12 after the word 'Any' insert the 

word 'Judicial'/' 
The motion was negatived. 
Mr. Deputy S p e a k e r T h e question is. 
"That clause 12 do stand part of the Bill" 
The motion was adopted. 
Clause 12 was added to the Bill. 

CLAUSL *8 TO 20, CLAUSE 1, ENACTING FORMULA AND LONG TlTLB 
Mr. Deputy Speaker: —The question is: 
"That Clauses 13 to 20, Clause 1, Enacting Formula and Long 

Title do stand part of the Bill". 



2P6 6th July, 196§ Government Bills * 
The Andhra Piadesh Ehctricity Duty 

(Extension and Amendment) BiH, 1968. 

The motion was adopted 
Clauses !3 to 20, Clause 1, Enacting Formula and Long Title 

were added to the Bill 
Sri J V Narasmga Rao .—I beg to move. 
"That the Andhra Pradesh Public Premises (Eviction of 

Unauthorised Occupants) Bill, 1968 be read a ;hird time " 
Mr Deputy Speaker —Motion moved. 

(Pause) 
Mr Deputy Speaker . The question is . 
"That the Andhra Pradesh Pubhc Premises (Eviction of 

Unauthorised Occupants) Bill, 1568., be read a third time/' 
The motion was adopted 

THE ANDHRA PRADESH ELECTRICITY D U T Y (EXTENSION 
A N D AMENDMENT) BILL, 1968 

Sn V B Raju —Sir, On behalf of the Chi^f Minister I beg to 
move 

"That the Andhra Pradesh Electricity Duty (Extension and 
Amendment; Bill, 1 68 be redd a 6rst time", 

Mr Deputy Speaker - Motion moved 

^ a. lya ' —.gupgiK*, 33 =cr*er* Madras 
Electricity Duty Act of ?989 Sir, that Act is in forcc m Andhra area 
the purpose of the Amending Bill is to extend the Act to the Te-
langaaa area also Act ^ a^pggbxS aRc^au Rgb 

& licensee tsoounr* electricity energy 3 aao3j^-tyT>g)&) 
3)3^3^090srt&ibR e^ 3§o3a<3b3bo3 3 2RoRo. ts Act a"* 
^refg rr^^ Railway con-
cerns v v o ^ energy i b ^ b o s b 
exemption ^^ca Constytution &r*sr* 

-sr-^ ^^b^giiu ^ o ^ entrgy a 
^ generate :go&aa3 energy ^ ^ 
g^ojo^, crX) ^ Tr-^ 3§o3<bd3J3o43 duty 

concession Constitution 
^ ^ T 3 - < y r * — a m e n d m e n t s g^or* 

^^a-O^inn^^. seeond reading— tp&y<&)g<&*oo*. 
cy^gir- A c t & apply 

^ ^ Electricity Board g 3 a. There are three Actg 
relatmgto Electric energy, ( i ) 19 !0 Act of Government of India 
ElcctricityAct. (2) ^93!; Act. (1) Madras electricity Duty Act- (a) 
1948 Act 1948 Act [& o % Electricity Boards & ^ w , 
What is called Electricity Supply Act of 1948, Rxr* R 

Act o % Electricity Board g j constitute 3 o& g 



government BiHs: gth July, 19(8 
The Andhra Pradesh E^tricitv D^ty 

(Extension and An:cndmen^) BiH, 3938. 

ts Board & ^ Acts ^ ^ ^ ^ 
^ o ^ i i o ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ private license 

e o ^ ) private agency -cr^Tr* electricity generate ^ ^ g ^ o 

^ companies electricity K) 
generate ga ^ ^ ' o ^ i ^ t a . ^ ^ y ^ 1939 
Act of 1939 which is in force hi Andhra Area if it is extended now 
through this Amending BiH to TcLngana area, the effect is, Sir. 

Ry'goy ^ generate Metrical energy, 

^^bv^gM ^cno&^x) R I M A o ^ ^ vo*^ 
^ ^ ^ It is a very simple Bill It is techni-

cally extending to the other area of the State, and also the eifect of 
enforcement will be on only two concerns and the leturn is also very 
neglible-tea thousand rupees. These arc the mam features of this 
Bill. 

l ^ j g . e R j R ^ : — 3 * r̂ ao cr^ i r - ^ eon^ t? * ^ extend 10 ^e? 

essT'cS&o tpur^^^ v o ^ ^ v o r r * ^ ^ electricity consu-

mer* &—residentia l , industrial and agricultural purposes & Ty*a& 

38 Xb^ ^a^go^ ^ ^^ clarify :&Rr*9. 

^ X). tr^^ : — s ' e f ^l!) Electri-

city Board rates sb ^ o ^ ^ t r * ? ^ o electricity rates 

^ Electricity Board Ml§8 i ^ ^ o 
L j^y^ o ^ ^ e a ^ ^ Electricity Board generate 

power duty goTo^o ^ ^ o A ^ ^ d b , 
—cur* *3o(R> ^ o ^ e o power generate 

3a *r*3 ^ ^ ^ working of the 
factories gb, townshipiugaj ^pm^a^jur^d). ^ ^ ^ ^ 'six pies" 
unit !bR iates ^ o ^ ^ o ^ - c r ^ eisf reimburse ^ i r * , 
that is a matter for them, 3 paise ^cr* duty 
h)^ 10 l3e ^ ^ o & o 

^ ^ j g j ^ D j : — p a i s e ' change ^tb^cr*? 

^ B. Tr*ey : decimal coinage § &r*3j<%o— penalty 
technical g tawta* ^ paise paise ^ ^ 3 paise 



288 6th July, 1968. ^ , , Government Bills: 
The Andhra Pradesh Electricity Duty 

(Extension and Amendment) Bill, 1968. 

RSo Electricity dutjy " g l ^ a y g j ^ x r ^ 

Dv^co^ oxr ^ r g sSoR̂ O —(1) Industiial Estate gj 3oRo§o-3 
^ocr'O, (2) Entertainments a aiT ^oc^g). 

^ D. g). -ô â  : — E l e c t r i c i t y consumption g) 
^Cb — 

6 pais tt-an^ec. 

^ §), -o-an — ^a generate ^ ^ 

^ private power of generation 

bo<5 oar*(gy*gt3 ttoAjonr^tb—^^o^grr^^ —oxr* ^ ^ 

Electricity Board 

^ ^^o&tg:—Industrial HsttblishmcRt a 
Electricity duty "goRgo ^ ^ 

!josjo$oM electricity rates 8nP !2nP. 
^a § ^o^^sb ^ ^ ^ ^ 
Industrial establishment gj ^^orr^ ao^oA 

-a-*8bo<3. eleetncity 
^VBSonT agricultural purposes ^ a o ^ C . eg S3 <2 o 3J* or* 
amendment ^ n ^ ^ o ^ M 
^-nrr<3§ 8 ^ ^ ^ 5 ^ ( j r * ^ ^ ? ^ 
^X^a 3)38 guopgon* ^ 

)jS&g<to 000a gRoR 

^ ^ Private electricity generation 
duty "gc^^g) ^ ^ g ) — ox^^orr^ 6 pies 

o e gag-R ^o^ocj^g" M^J^ao^bg)^ electro 
city ^oo-o^^od^g" du^oX) 



Government BiHs 6th July, K68. 289 
IheArdhra Pradesh H^ctrictv Duty 

(Extension an 1 Am ndment) BiH, 1.68, 

energy & ^ne gbsb 

^ o Electricity Board -y^^g 

^ a ^ e l ^ energy ^^nr^ob. ^ y - ^ ^ o ^ e r * ^ 
10 { r ^ ^ ^ g ^ ^ current ^ ^ ^ 

ir'iy^ex) ^ ^ ^ ^ iJ^IbtLn^ R). 

^ X). : — ^ gr*a simple bill 

^jo^rr-d) electricity ^ ^ ^ H o , 
oo j t^^ private concerns , - x r ^ g ^ ^ 

t9<%rr*S. ^cn! Electricity 
private concerns produce g a ^ ^ t a ^ ^ ^ Hb ̂  -gxb^cb. 

ooja^osb private concerns o ^ ^ l ! 
nationalise ^ 

agonr- ^ e ^ ^ c r ^ M ^ d o o 
e?^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 3%orr* two con-
cerns ^RC Electricity duty ox^tf 

d) ^ i r - ^ o ^ Jlb^-g Indu§trial 
concern* ^ ir^M subsidy ca^RbaB^Cb. 
e subsidy ooooA^d^ cr* ^bg indu-
stries ^ n ^ o ^ eicctricity duty s3-*a ^ 

industrial deveiopment duties 
s3-*pa#Sb ^ ^ industrial development -?*<&). - ^ ^ g 

S) ^ oSb o. ^ 5 agriculture i r^^o. ^ ^ oRr- X) 5 
^ ^ Xb̂ o ^ <33̂ -0-* ^ao^&D 

expansion ^ agncuituresb ( j ^ ^ g ^ 
^ ^ ^ electrify ^o^^or^X) 

electricity C k u ^ o ^ ^ sy**9 e ^ ^ o 

sao&o. Electricity ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ service a r ^ o 

^ ^ { j ^ & r ^ ^ ^ M ^ o ^ * ^ 



290 6th M y , 1968. Government BiHs: 
The Andhra Pradesh Electricity Duty 

(Extet-Sion and Amendment) RiH, 1,68. 

electricity R*^ g^S^apasr'-s** supply ^0^^008 report 
a s ^ ^ S b telephones services 

r̂-c? ^ ^ ^ ^ i ^ d ) Staff StaiBF b̂ 

^ ^ o ^ d b Staff aa^arriS ^ staff 
Electucity ^ ^ ^ ^ e j a ^ o c o . Industrial 

concerns 

^r^eSb electricity 4. 5 e^e^eo electricity u^gg^-g 

Electricity staff ^grr* oxr* ^ o ^S^^osb 
^rxo Electricity 

^TyTgeb. ^ o c j 8 o u t o f t h e w a y ^ M g o 

^ §^boSbg '—t3<yg3K°, ^Jo^rr-Cb oco** g)eo 
Private generators hiR duty 

ibR duty ^ ^ c b . jRapgb ^Sio 
^ ^ g b cRrgab ^^^^^ Electricity Board sb o o a ^ s b j 
^nr^^b. v g j "gcr* ^gb 

S^s^go^ grg^&x) ^bo^eb. service conditions & a#oT* 

s^o^^K^^o B^iy g^s^r-^o^ojo^ 

General Hospitals ^ power s^^go^o operations e^^Torr^ 

r^j ^ d ^ g — R ^ g ' R j L ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 

-cr*a;<o ^ ^c^ )̂ lg<a Industries sb 

gixo frequent yr* lines interuption ^ ^ 
epgtM 8 shi^ ^ ao^h, o ^ e) 

- s^eo^ workers ;§_4S§ ^sSc^M etWodj 
Electricity shift ^ 



Government BiHs . 6th Ju!v, 19(<8- 291 
Trte Andhra Pradesh Electricity Duty 

(Extcnbion and Amendment ) BiH, 1968. 

^r-e 46 minutes, a S ^ s ^ ^ e niore than one hour ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ o n e 

hour <g product!on s ^ c u o ^ ^ ^ j vages o c o ^ 

e ^or^mdu&trial concerns s b ^ ^ oc^)^^^ 
^ r ^ ^ ^ o ^ incentive ceo^g^^Tv* power supply 

pioduction r^^o ss^A^o. 

^ ^ ^ o ^n^JoA ^ power supply ^ " g j ^ j j 
industry 5 ^ ^ encouragement o o j ^ j i y ^ ^ , water supply § ' 

^ ^ ^ ^ ^ j e x ) ^ ^ power rate gb ocoxb 
TT^s^o industrial tariff ^o-a-*eb. start 
^oco^ Industries power subsidy 
Ty*43§ ccoKb^^Cib third plan Government of India speci-
f y rr* provision provision ea-g^o^Rj^D s}^^^ power 
subsidy o^ar* a^f^^r^ industry 3 ^ ^ 

d ^ ^ c ^ o ^ j ^ ^ power subsidy cjo-xrgO. It is a comm 
itted expenditure and it is very unfortunate that nothing is provided 
m thi* year budget and the Director of Commerce and Industry is 
saymg that since there is no alloted provision he is not m a position 
to release this power subsidy Lgorr* aS"^.*;^ *R<3"Stry 

70 igeo, 80 
ooj^^ofr^ Agriculture g j ^ c ^ o ^ 

^ ^ Agriculture transformers g T ^ p o 
regulars ^rcab^A^cco^o^ge cropes 9b ^X^do- R13J3 

instructions oo j^ge ^ 

^ 8* pre**: — ^ g w ? , three acts & oâ -
Indian Ekctricity Act l^iO liccnce licerce 

(2 ) Madras Electricity Duty Act of 193% Generate 
supply electr.city dut) iSl^a. ( ) Elcctncity Supply 
Act iy-a^od Electricity Board Constitute Ty*3$<%o. es^^^b 
^ Electricity Board. Generation cr*& cost cf production, 
Higher cost on the*mdusjttia! load agriculture load 

Electricity Supply Act Electricity B^ard 
budget ŝSryd̂ b Madras electricity duty act of 19^9 

duty lElectncity Board 99*9 
lecurring Electricity Board jgoaa ^ ^ 

Mgra&y* r ' ^ ^ ^ B o F ^ private generation 



292 6th u',y, 1968 Co\(nmte. tBd's* 
The Andhr-i Pradesh Kle-trict^ Duty 
(Exte^sioi and Arrend r^nt) BiH, 

Electricity Board ^od (go^^oo uniformity 

P^^o Act & "guorr°-Kr'gb apply ^ ^ ^ 98 
impact, &M& financial realization 10 

eo sj 

g —^8 todt^^, <3 0 & $3 ^Slc^o ^coo^ f 
^S ic^o^^ )^^^ 2 6)8 Xo<33^o 

iB-raia 

Ri*^ 

^^08 ^8 ^ ijo 6 g) 

B ^ a g " ^O^sgdsb 3&0 nr* & ^ -cr*. 



Cove H'a^nt B ! ^ 6th Ju!v, 1968. 393 
ihc Andhia 

(BAt^s^na d Aiweiriment Dili, 1968. 

Mr. Deputy Speakei -T<ic q estion is; 

"Thatthc A'idiuu P*adcsii Li^tucityDuty (Extension and 
Amuidni'nt) Bill, be ic. d a fi.st time " 

The motion wa*> adopted 

Sri V B Kuju Sir 1 ix^ to move 

^Thatthe Andma Piaacsh UeLtnuty Duty (bxtenhion and 
Amend^Mnt) Bi t, e lead a sccond tune " 

Mr Deputy Speaker Motion moved. 

(Pause) 

Mr Deputy Speaker -The question is 

'Tha^theAnJhia i'iaJesh Elccticty Duty (Extension and 
Amendment) Bill, he reaJ a second time/' 

The motion was adopted. 

Ci At ^^ 2 to 4 

Mr Deputy SpetKCi' - the question is 

"That clauses 2 to l do st^jid part of the Bill " 

The motion na^ ^dnpted 

Clauses 2 to 4 wc e added to the Bill 

CLAUS1S 

Su V. I'. Raju : Sir 1 beg to move : 

' T o r clau^c 5, substitute the following, 

'5. in sect in 1 3 oi t-̂ c Pnncipal Act, — 

( i ) m subjection 1) 

(a) R)rthc woids '*Andhra area of the State of Andhra 
Pradesh", the words 'State of Andhra Pradesh" shall be substi-
tuted ^ 

(b) pics'\ the words ^three paise" shall 
t.c substituted ; 

(e) ior the mtrds "two annas^ in the two places where they 
occur, the words * twelve paise" shall be substituted; 

(n) m sub-section (4), for tue words "two annas" the words 
"twelve paise*' shall be subst tutcd " 

Mr, Deputy Spcakci Motion moved. 

;Pau^c) 

Mr. Deputy S p e a k e r T h e question is; 

"For clause 5, substitute the following 



294 6th Juty, 1968. Government BiHs: 
The Andhia Pradesh Elec rici ^ Duty 

(Exteasio and Amend^en ) Bit, 196s 

"3. In section 3 of the Pnncipal Act,— 

(1) m sub-section (1)— 

(a) for the words ' Andhra Aiea of the State of the Andhra 
Pradesh", the words "State of Andhra Pradesh" shall be substi-
tuted , 

(b) for the words "six pies", the words "tlnee paise' shall 
be substituted, 

(c) for the words "two annas" m the two places whe e they^ 
occur, the words "twelve paise" shall be substituted , 

(n) m sub-section (4), fbr the words "two annas" the words 
"twelve paise' shali be substituted" 

The motion was adopted. 

Mr* Deputy Speaker.—The question is 

"That Clause 5 as amended do stand part of the BiH." 

The motion was adopted 

Clause 3 as amended was added to the Bill 

CLAUSES 6 and 7 

Mr. Deputy Speaker .—The question is * 

"That Clauses 6 and 7 do stand part of $he Bill " 

The motion was adopted 

Clauses 6 and 7 were added to the Bill. 

CLAUSE 8. 

SnV B Raju:—Sn, I beg to move: 

"In clause 8, omit item (n) and renumber item 'm) as 
item (11) ' 

Mr. Deputy Speaker/—Motion moved 

(Pause) 

Mr. Deputy Speaker —The question is: 

"In clause 8. omit item (ii) and renumber item (m) as 
item (u). < v / <** 

The motion was adopted. 

Mr. Deputy Speaker —The question is. 

"That Clause 8 as amended do stand p4i% of the Bill:'* 

The motion was adopted. 

Clause 8 as amended was added to the Bill. 



Gjvern'ncit Hi!!s : ^h July, 2)5 
he Andhra Pradesh Electricity Duty 
(Ex'eanon and A nendment) Biil, 1968. 

CLAUS1 1 ENACTING FORMULA AND LOM3 IlTLL 

Mr. Deputy Speaker * - T h e question is: 

" r h i t C i a h a e l , Ena:t^ig Formula and Loig nth do stand 
pait of thJ Bill ^ 

I he motion ^its adopted 

Chiu^cl, Enacting formula and Long Tale were added to 
the Bi!L 

Sri V B Raju -Sn, t beg to move 
"ThtHliicAndhrA Prado*h Ebctricity D^^y(E\tens^nand 

Amendment, Bt i 196^ re read a Hurd time " 
Mr Dc,*uty Speaker: -Motion moved. 

^ e o j o - c y ^ o ^ , 
j f ^ ^ ^ f̂JJO^ 

Sn V B Riju * - ^hcy c muot mike 4 dent i ito the zone and 
atca of the Elcctnc^y B^aJ 

oojcB"* ^ o ^ ^ocj ^ cŷ  o tn 

^^b^boa. 

Sri V. B. Raju : Th<tt will be considered on merits 



29$ 6th July, 1968. Government B'iH&: 
The Andhra Piadesh Bectrmt^ Duty 
(Extension and Amen ment) Bil , 19ti8. 

^oco ^ u c u o a — 2 0 ^b^^er <X) 

^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ a r ^ * ^ e ^ g j r R o ^ e ^ y ^ 

^ ^ ^̂ ^OKT- ^cs^o^) ^ ^ 

^o^) ^^ocs^ A 

^ 0(5** ^^ooug 

^ Under Section 7 of the Madras Electri-
city Act "Any debt due under this Act which r mams, any licensee 
may with the previous sanction of the Provincial Government and 
subject to such conditions as they may think tit, must rccover from 
am person ^r class of persons to whom energy is sold at a puce of 
more than 2 annas per unit, the debt which falls to be pa:d by the 
licensee in respect of energy so sold or any part of it as may be de-
termined by the provincial Government". -srna aMo^d Rcgy-tR* 

ej 
^ g. — " M o r e than two annas" a*<3 g>oa. tsoTb, 

aS" Rr3-*c3b3%Sb ^ R i R j = m*. 



gavemmentBiHs 6thJk*:y i9)S. 297 
The Anlhrt Piadesh Payment of Sihi^s 

.nd Rcm^va^ of D!squ^ificat!ons 
(Amendment) BiH, l'tOS. 

^^ § 3R OJJ e o ^ f ^ o V r ^ c ^ 

Sn V It R^u - Anv hccnsce may with the prcv^us sanction 
of the Provincial (Itucrnmrnt and subject to such condmons as th^y 
may impose, recover ^rfin anv person or c! ss of persons to whom 
energy M so! i a! a pure moir than ^vo annis per umt More 
than two annas ^ t a l ^ R ^ & j ^ jo 

n L - ^ - ^ 

Mr Deputy Speaker The quest mi is: 

^The Andhra Pradesh (Andhra Area) blectnca! Undertaking 
Acquisition (Amendment) BiH be read a thud tunc " , 

The motion was adopted. 

AHE ANPHBA PRA^ISH PAYMlNT f)r SALARHS AND REMOVAL OP 
DlSQUA^nCATIONh (AtHNDMtMj BlLL, 

Sri P V. Nara^imha R ô : -Str, f rn behalf of the Chief Mini-
ster beg to move: 

''That the Andhra Pradesh Payment of Salaries and Removal 
of Di^quahiications (Amendment) BtH, 396K he read a Rrst time " 

Mr. Deputy Speaker Mot'on moved. 

280 ^ ^ ^ ^ 

^ ajRoMjo ^^b^go S&oR, j j ^^^o 

^o \ ^ o ^ ^ ^ b ^ ^ ^ ^ 

^o^^o ^ X ) asT ^^joa. 

rQ ^ CO 



298 6th Juhi 1908. Government Bi„s < 
The Andhra Pradesh Payment of Sa aries 

and Removal of Disqua ificat!ons 
(Amendment) Bill, 1968 

ooo^od ^ ^gbgr^aS ^o^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 

sMo ^aioSb ^ ^ ^ v ^ ^ o ^a^eMfb-tr'gjg 

^ ^ n r ^ ^ j . esKTctao 210 g^^^d^) 
e o ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 1957 sbR ^b^Co 38 
g^dy 210 §^3350 g 80 

exŜ e 55 Cb eo 

ao^^^Sb /T^^e p^sTeo, 
so o ^ eo co ^ ej <3 —* OS 

enP^-ao^gpM mo^oo. ^eao 9>S$K)9"*eM 

^ ^ MoBbg — s g b o ^ ^ o ^ D aEr*oRr*ex> 
b̂ovQ (S^yorr* Incidentally also to 

mcreas the Salaries of theLegislators -cr-sl 

oppose ^ ^ ^ 80, 100 90 State Exchequer Er*/<33 

^ e^]?^ estr-oCSbo T^db (jdox^df ^ ^ 
aoiRSba ^^o TgEfR'Sg S^D 

g. ^^ccbg ^ ^ A^g/^eo Ty*&er*e?& aa^g^ 

distribute 430 surve)Tand land records 



Government Bdts- 6thJu!v, 1M8. 299 
The Andhra P*ad sh Payment of S t*anes 

aid Rcmova! of 
(An^eudment; B il, 1968. 

^ ei tp 

5 ^ o ^ ^ ^ 60 ^ ^ ^ -a^R) 

facility t r a ^ c ^ a d?^ 25, 

80 e j ^ ^ ^ o ^ e x ) 

.)c<R)Sb To correspond wtth the 
Government OfHcia!s on a'i puhiic matters, xT'c^ex) t 

ir^^^o 36K;abe!3b e ^ ^ o ^ ) Mcdr^eo 

s^oRbeo, a ^ ^ o voRbR R, T C. ^ 

Qo?^ Rgbgtb a ^ y ^ o 

^ conveyance 
— * a gb̂ or̂  with retrospective eflect, 6-8-1961 

A ^ r g ^ ! ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 

t f ^ ^ 9Tr^6?3J. 

A^Srg^ ^ -T* : — d^^g^ i 9b R b 

Sri G. S i \ a y y a - ! am ^u^ject t^ correction. gboiR 
reHosp^ctive eHect 

a^e^ ^ ^ I oppose to ra!!y every thing. withdraw 35a 
D^H&j 8b v^KStM ^ If the 
Min!S(er or the Speaker or the Chairman docs Hot use the Govera-

- i^Qt H ^ n ^ he wdt ^e given a Home Rent Allowance Why? Tr>a 
' ^jgo^ ' jb) tbuse re.it a!l wance 
^ we come here tt? do som^ social ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ i 

conveyance oHowance ^oRbsb! ^ ^ 
j Anancia! position ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 

unemployment ^ K i A ^ g y g b , ' ^^b^W^^o^db ^ ^ ^ 



300 6th July, 136^ Government Hts 
The Andhra Pradesh Payment of bataues 

a d Re nova! of DisqualiScations 
(Amendment) Bill, 1968 

^^bO B* ^e^gS^oco — § ) ey ^ oppose ^xbr* 

a>l3;Sbr*ib ^ ^ ^ ^o a j sbo. ^ag^ar* 

unemployment eo g) go 

e3j3gorr<soa, 

allowances xse^jO aov^ tPSSb^o^^Ry^ 

M^r-ir-gjosr- involve ^ 
^ (Rgr'aa ^ g b o ^ ^ d ) . ^^b 
^ ^ g r r * Oppose g^nr^R ) ^M^sb ASb^ ? 
^ae i a tax ^ s}g)<3b ^ ^ ^ ^ g Kb 
^ o ^ ^ o & j o i ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ return & xb Ty- ^ X) §"*<& 

R), 120, 130 [jT*^e>abo3 

V ^ ^ o ^eao^r*^ 33. 250 eo ^ o j j ^ , §50 eo ^ o o j ^ v * ^ 

^ f fgr^ ^ T J ^ ^ ^ c b . 3oag*r*ta 
, , ̂ ^ Let thenTnot take their 

$a!aties at the enhanced rates. Let them take Rs. 239 and Rs. !6 D.A. 
(u^erruptip^) If they want to take the enhanced rates and stiH prefer 
to oppose the Bill, it would he better they resign. QtherwMte let (hem 
not oppose the Bill, I challenge them on this ground. ^ 



na^rtirun' HiHi ^ t̂h July, IS6S 30] 
Tu'- Ptadc h ^ ent of Salaries 

and Reiovai oi D!sqnai!h:aiion$ 
( U n u i d m n t ) n H , 

^ OS. w 

Sri P V' Narasnnha Rao: t adnm that they have a right to 
oppose and greater right to take. (Laughter) 

J^OJU^J). &)o^a/Y*6b ^ ^ c ^ ^ c r * ? 

(M f Speaker in the Cha:r; 

250 ^o^ ) ^60, 

^oMR Roy-tut?* ^^t^^oo^j 
^ ^ o ^ ) ^o^^iy^ex) 

^ ^ ^ A^o 400 ^ A ^ o , 

%#go 86 a&^oe ^ b ^ o R ^ ^ e ^ ^ 

^ S b ^ ^ ^ o b y d ) a r ^ o 260 ^r^bgbTT^cb, ^ ^ 

M0 ^O^) 460 3o&do wM^o. j a ^ e ^ ^ ^ 

-o^^c vo^^J* ^d^or^M a^Mayr* ^ S ^ a r g ^ 

TT^a a&gtM ^ ^ 100 ^cr* ^ ^ 

^ ^ ? ^ ^ , 
Mr! Speaker ! mi ' get it<;l$?i8cd. ^ 

^ : Rr*#*oatM T ^ ^ c ^ , 

v^ tn mrr? 



302 tHy ^ 
H e ' ndt â P . dv i "i en^ o ' ^a!a 

arm j^cnovat ot UisquahReatto^s 
( Mwnt.L.eni) BiH, 

D^cX^r*^^ ^TP'd) lb ^ ^ —̂  eo 

c^^n^o v^^^^bgoSb 100 OJ^^o&Dex) J go 

ooj^ ^ o g ^ t ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ g ] [ j ^ ^ ^ ^ g 

70 e^e^sx) ^ e^exT ^ ^^^^ oooo^S^^ 
^ ^ ST^-sfRb ^^-sr*^ "cr̂  KhoB&.nP'* 

—o ^ eo o. L-

ssQ^ S ^ ^ *s?e> ^ ^ o B b e o 

^ ^ ^ ^ o i?̂  ^ ^ ^CSb -or^uX) 
^ gb&uoa ^ g ^ ^ o 

^tjc^a^ "^ooj a j^ch- ta ) eĵ c?^ ^^ e^b^e ^ o rr^^ ^ o 

^ c e ^ ' ib p R*̂  sgbga 



L,ove"m.rti' Juiv, 1968 
Ti^ .n hra I'rad ^ 4 

Free Bus passes, 
way pa^ cs ^ " 

) -cr^^ . ^ , n^j ^ ^ ^ 1 

^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ '""Mf ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ n h G 

opoo^e ^ ^ ^ th. ^ ^ ^ ^ - o^T!^ 

^boO S^&RgR^B ^o l^S" ^ ^ chaHengc ^ 
oppose ,3?- ^ ^ ar^ ^rr^^A) 

yo*^ CC3-* &X\3 ^cA Ofjj^-o. Prmcjples 
bo^ oppose R o ^^g^x : 

pass ^ b^oad o !ook a'* ^oRr*as-<'3 ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ n e ^ n r ^ 

^i^ujr^A) tmP^a ctro^pective eHe^ 
^^auudT* ^gjoa,^ tangs' 

salary Q^ar^ta. 

^Tr^cb* a u c ^ / r ' a s i e ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 
^ ^ ^ J S ^ L ^ ^ 90^<R> adopt ^ 

^ ^ ^ SS^rr* a o o ^ oo^^ 

(T^^r* a* g^ET-a* Shadow 
Cabinet & form go&g4^gTEr*ab grabs' 

TT^DoP jjd&Rg&j g r o t r * ^ ^ ^ 



804 6th July, 1968̂  Government Bills: 
Th^ Andhra P adesh r?yme,nt of Salar!es 

and Removal of Di qualifications 
(Amendment) Bdl , 1968. 

^ ^ ^ convince 

ĵurr̂  i g v ^ a Employees g 

^ ^ RS^ 

^ D o a ^ ^ free railway passes, bus passes a^Soo^a^o 
sD^^o ^ o ^ ^ b ^ 100 3rnt e ^ ^ eH&gboRa ^ a ^ ^ b 

cr^^b 6aa salary etig cr̂ ag honorarium ^a v^/^o&Mo 
RO s b g a g ^ ^ n b , 

^ ^ 
(g&o ^ ^ ^ ^ 10% cut 
retrenchment a M^a j a 

? ^ CO 

housing allowance a 250 ar* {! o 2bo-3 600 dr^ H 

^ ^ 350 xbo-3 850 ^ p esb ^ o i g b & r ^ & g 

^Xhgba ^TT^eb.. ^ ^ g^^sb 

B a ^ ^ ) &a§ ^(b^j yŝ bgoo 

^ ^ ^ aea ^ xb ^g 
e^^a^o^b ^ i f v ^ g ^ ^ 
vans a^gco gsy^bo^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 



Government Bd!s: 6th Ju!v, 1968. 803 
The A idhra Pradesh Payment of Satanes 
and Removal ot D^juaiiticauon^ 
(imeiKtmen) Bd!, 

w^c^ooR Ho tel 

go^g) ^u^Sb^o^ sa!arie$" ^ ^ ^ ^ r - ^ g 
M. L A qu-triers^ ^ ^ 

a. quarters ^ ^ ^ "av^gb Door^ Windows 

-a*g3.o famdy quavers ^ p̂g* 

-̂ Sbocr* gd&^^b M, L A. eo^^sb^ family 
quarters ^g).* 

360 ^ s ^ o K t o 600 oj^sr^cd)^^ ^ 

^ ^ a a ^ v ^ ^ : — ! a s t amend-
ments sr^^a ay* 15 B ^ g ^ b83 
^ - g g c d r ^ ^ ^ ^ s^-^^-A) mur v ^ a a 400 

dy^^o&o^ Sb^c^ ^TT^^j. ^ o^^o^ 
w o ar̂  S^ya-tab. Q o ^ o ^ r " ^ ^ t r *^ jjS^Sb^^J 

oc^r*!^ ^ ^ - ^ o ^ s S e & ^ c a . tacfo 

5L 100 RraTo&pg** ^^ ^^^bo^a 

a a p ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ o M ^ 

e^a^sb S6 d r ^ o & e ^ !ist 

^ ^ ^ ^ <*9 
J ^ g r r ^ ga v g ^ o gty* ^ ^ ^ c r ^ 



806 6th July !%S G .vemment B;Us -
The An ilra Pradesh Payment of Salaries 

at d Re nov^l of Disqua iHcations 
( meit) Bill, 1968--

*r<3b a a a D o B ^ ? 

v^Ra^)* <s3ygb jjjaiosb o ^ o ^ a ^ S r ^ ^ o ^ ^^drr^ 

gonyrcoja a a ^ e ^ ^ ^ — ^ ^ ^ ^urb 

c -^a :^ ag'a-

103 ^ a a ^ ^ ^ ^ b o t ^ ? 

^^JOO <6 ^aa^olg^b. sb ŝb 59 a, 3br*9b ^^JSbo 
&r* § aa arr^ 

aKbtT^aca ^ a c ^ c d . 3J& 

^ *nasr*p ^a^e^ac^bg * — ^ ^ ^ ^ subjective rr-
e^-aoR^Jo object ive^ a ^ - O ^ ^ o ^ ^ -qr* a o. 
^ bjective 

â r̂ subjective rr̂  
^ ^ ^ a n ^ a oatoa, ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 

, ' ^ab^ abgo 

^a^ca M b ^ n r ^ ^ b o 190, 160 

^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 5, 10 



Covernment BHls' 6th July, 1963. 30? 
The Andhra Pradesh Pa\rn''nt o' Sa^am^s 

and Re * ova) i (i fi^Ji^as 
^Amendm^nt) 

Tgnfaty*. ^ ^ , .138 buu^ 

^ o ^ j fkXuR ^ ^ o ^ ^ g ^ b o ^ / r - O b 

-Er*PS v^d) SiRa-t^ao, ^ o ^ 
^ o sr^b bod) g>a 

^ ^.{RooTb S00 

^ ^^a ^ ^ oidmary 
o o o ^ ^ e o o ^ o ^ Ryan* 

gcr* DeA > Mc&a. ^^ ^ J v^y^o subjcct:ve action ycr- objec-
tive action d^subjcchve satf&etion carrect policy MS&3bo%& 
^ ^ subjective satisfaction ^ ^ o 

bjcctivc satisfaction ^ ^ o ^Sb-̂ ^ ^ ^ Rbgo jjSat) 

3bo^Rr*#a Income tax Moi^tJ^cb. 

Tr-^a oppose igc^b^Q 3%a Income tax ^ at-Kr-̂  
pay i g d & ^ o d Hio-sr* amenities ojjsTgo^ 

OM3YKT* oppose aib^ amenities ^ c r - ^ 
^ J j O , Parliament ^^sbgesb o c j ^ j a ^ ^ b ^ b o ^ 

^^ American Parliament ^ g ^ 
go43a agpRRRb ^ o 6 

g R w ^ , j j )^ Congress member gb 

^ o v * iSab* l3 Rr^ j fo 

Assembly -sr-lfR) T T ^ a o - ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 
-ar**3h) ^ A ^ r - ^ A r nr* point pomt ^Do 

sa^oja ^ g o e ^ o ea^y^-

lt36o 0 Aa^gTrw (ten);,!0 per cent 
^^ocr^doA, iSv-tfoTBb, i b ^ o ^ d r ' ^ Sb 

to per ccnjt ^ao&S^ RbTs^doA. ^ o ^ 



308 6th July, 1968. , ^ ^ Government BiH$. 
Th Andhra Pradesh P.Lymcn? of Salaries 

and Removal of Oi qudlmcaiions 
(Amendment, Bdl 1^8. 

nra3o& e a^orraa^eo ^ ^ 10 per cent cut 

^ ^ ^ ^ ^ a^^^bao ^ ^ 

^ objective stand t9oojl§ senous ^ 

<9^0 ^^b TT*^ 

ar^dj ^oabo^* 

r^bgoo ^eD^orr* ruS^aa ^ab 
3 9 0 3 . ^ ^ocoj^ab -sr*^ g-g 
-Kr*rr°tyeM rr ^ a. ^ Ba^ilbocr^aboigb 

^^obosb ^sbt^ atKug^cyTas 

&,^.Act ab cr-aa facilities Ty-̂ b 

ao^ voluntary rr* cut 
o63a^ aado^^j It is left to %hem 

tsoRba^ ^ ^ o v ^ a , ocoe Sb^o-v^ 

balanced thmbng-T^<Rb ^a ^a) ^ n r ^ a b ^ a b & ^ a 

&aa &aao3̂ 8o-ab§*'*o'& =T*er* v^rb^^ooRX), ajid objective 
:eali(y oco^^^ ^ ^ ^ v ^ a o a , is^b xba^b ^ ^ 
sab^ g-b&oA^ajo&r'v'', ^ a ^ a ^ o ^ aae voluntary cu^ 

ej —# 

a o R ^ c ^ ar*s, 1961 ^ i b ^ ^ b ^ a^eaa ^aoobo a ^ o a . 

tp̂ JT aaao^bo a*a eo*^ ^o&a 



eovframcnt BiHs: (th ^ i} 309 
The Andhra Pradesh Pa^m^ t o! S.! nes 

and Rtmova! ot 
(Amendment) BiH, 

^ t t r^^ ^ 

cooov Q ^ ^ t-

tmaM 

^ / s ^ o ^ ^ o a . 6aoAjsy*,}(3aa ^ a B ^ ^ ^ 

3&x>&% MS ^(^^J^ v ^ d g ^ ^ ^ g r ^ o o ) ^ ^ . ^ c O o g o ^ g ^ 
t ^ a g o ^ oaoo^ ^jTcr^T^ ? ^ 

^ IS ^J^^J^OJ, MC&3 tp4jr*r} 

^ i ^ n ^ ^ ^ 8 

^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ayroRo ^ r ^ ^ c ^ y * 

^ V fO r o w ^ ^ 

^oa ^ j ^ c t ) . VtxrtSj T A. 

^ ^ o ^ o ^ a ^ ^ ar*, 6aa ^js^sj 

d^on- "RAM ^ d ^ y y ^ e ^ A ^ g & v - a , o&^s^oy -n^gc&jQ. 

c&orr* 3*6 v*333%<y* 



310 6th Ju!y, 1963 Government Bills; 
The Ardh*a Pradesh Payment of Salanes 

and Removal of DisqualiScations 
(Amendment) Bill, 1968, 

903* ^ ^ ^ ^ ^Sbo^ao, 

o^D^o, ^ ^ ^ eX) 

e>B ^^orr* v^a^o g o R ^ a ^ a 

M&a -sn*̂  ^ ^ ? a i f d^T privilege 
morons ^^Scnr^ag^^M^ob, ^aa^y^g 

a^Sbg^?—^^v-g^ ) privilages 

^ e A o ^ a j o . tsvaba aa^ ^ e ^ o ^ ^ j o , n!ght watchers 
^ ^ TT-ea Peons ^ ^ e a c ^ a b j . -y^eg^ 
aifja &* M&a*^ ^ ^ ^ ^^o^TJ^ax ! . KoR^og** ib^o ^e 

^oOb^o ei"3!h-&*go&*ar* ^ ^ o ^ ^ o r r <§&$ ^ ^ o ^ b g ^ 

^ ^ cco^c^o^ ^ a o - ^ ^ a ^ i ^ a o g^^o 

^RbairtgeMAxiiSo^a oc j a j^^ jao^ TTdg 

^-sr'egb Panchayati samithi President 

40 16 a<&e> ^ ^ f b ^ b o a ^ ^ ^ 5b^o 

^ 



<3overnm$nt M i s .* 6tb July, 1968. 3n 
The Andhra Pra esh Payment of Sa^ancs 
and Removal of D:squaiiR nations 
(Amendment) Bdi, 196S. 

^ g). ^ ^ ^ (aexr^tb) :—supgtsp, ^ aea$ 

r^ab ^ a b RSbd j o^ Rd^ ^ aoR d r - ^ o & c o 

s}*^ vocod^ a o d v ^ ^ ^ 250 

continue a^o^Ra ^ , ^ ^a*"* slab 
system a^o-aa. ^ ŷ̂  ^o^b "^oA T r ^ s j 

aS^auJ, ao€3o TT-^^^ *B gS^a^ . a oeo ^ o ^ CO CO CO CO 

amenities /MoR ^ ^n^o 

&joo6a a^aaoo be3_ac# ^^^^ British Parliamentary 
^ a b a e a ^ i y ^ a j j a r a ^ ^ r r * ajo&jj 

procedure aBl^a^ygb, ^ bar ^ ^ o & a a^axr* 
^rr* ^ a j ^ Bar ^ abo-a a a j a a y ^ /ra^ ^ a ^ g ^ e o g v * 
^ a . ^oRba^ a^asa ^ ^ Bur au^A jo ^ ^ ^ b c ^ o a . 

^ ^ ^a aoasb Bxcise Coliector smuggled hquior 
e a ^ a b - * a&a j ^a^y^b a^ooo ^ A a ^ y 

aaoocb^g a ^ a Hquior e o ^ oxr^ a j r^bo^ 
v o ^ a e ^ a ^ a iiquior ^ a ^ ^ ^ a r - quota av^AJOlS^ -sr-fbo 
^ o d a ^ a a ^ ^ 

^ a T^^g* :—tpggap, Saianes Bii! /b5oa as<b 
a ^ ^ B a x b a a a a a a aj^ab^ a^dR a ^ w g^aej ^ ^ CO * CO 

^ a ^c^a^icr^ar* a . a a^a^a . a$bga$ 

s i ^ ^ a b o a^a a ^ a g o v * r ^ a 

e ^ a a c d ^ ^ ^ b ^ & o tag a a ^ ^ a . ( a ^ ^ ^ o g ^ a b u . 

aoabgb aoasr'a'tt'a, aba ^oabxb^^aa ^a^^b 

a^aabj ^ ^ a b o , -sr-a r ^ a o 

^ c o ^ ! asb^ a n * a ^ ^ a b j 

^ J o ^ arn fo f r * A o ^ a o ) c^cr^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 



8i<2 6L& 196̂  Govemmert Bills: 
^ he Andhra Pradesh P^ymet t of Salaries 

and Rernova' of Di quahRc lions 
(Amendment) Bill, 1968 

33 ^ ^ ^ ao A a^orr* ^Cb/^cR ^ ^ a 3b3Y\*u 

7'l^e) 3ooa voters s ^ a s 
^^^^ ^^bgr^rr^ 

%e rra 3)3 *§3 
TT^g^d ^ a Industries ^a^grr*^ ^nr^ooo. 

d-s^ex)^ 
&*6b *^3bo 

^ ^ y*e?> platform ^ 3 ^ <y*ap or̂ ex) ^ o ^ c 
3J** ^^ 3buo<3b 

^Tr-S) session -e-^&oo^ a3R3 session 
-û Soccŝ , ^o^Sb a8R3 gj^cr^ go^ 
Dd̂ b 100 percent "^e^oda a, 

M^-^o^a-^a^ 

nr* ^3b ^ ^ ^ o ^ c a ! 

^o^br^T^ea 

^Lojj*^, ê ^ o ^ ^ ^ r e ^ S fO j^ 

^-cr^eD -u^j^g^g^ 

^ ^ ^ ^ o ^ e S eiK ^a 

^ ^ 



Government B M i : 6th J ^ ŷ 1 3!3 
The An ihra Pradesh Payment of Sabre* 
and Removai of Disnualn^tnionh 
(AmendmepQBd!, ^ 

3t>&o%a T e r ? ^ aabageo 

^ ^ j a x ) r r a a ^ ^ ^ 

^oco*^ ^ ^ ^ sin -gRi&'g ^ ^ ^ a 

^ a a o ^ ^ ^ a 38T3-*R) v ^ ^ a a y ^ a g 

3 )3 i b a o ^ S o R b ^ ^ a g s*<Sb. 

V ^ ar* ajg O rr̂  democrats ?ysjhm ^ a ^ ^ a - ^ ^ a ^ y ^ 

a j ^ o r r * /r^^bw ^ a-9T*3T'(K) 

a eayeo^ca . tnaa /baoa asb^a 
gr*aot?o<a, Tr*a s ^ o ^ o a ^aa^bjab. 

^a ^ y ^ R ^ ^ A r ^ a b j . ao^ba^ao^^ sbr̂  ̂ ^ ^ a ^ e o ^ 
â r̂  ^ a o e ^agy-c^ 

6 qtr^da ^a^gsron^ a ^ ^ b o r ^ a a ^ ^ g o 

& o ab a r^ a aoa^mean^a -y*%b. 
5 a o a ^ ^ ^ ^ d ^ a o ^ o r r * a a ^ â  a 

^ D^crr* ^ a ^ r g ^ ^ e o e^acr^ag^cb. aooR 

5b5b ^ g ^ g^o^ Sb e a ^ g e a a 
^ X b aoR a ^ a ^ e x b aoa^gexb 

^ a g ^ b e ^ a a j ^ a o j Mamga s^a^o 

^ A, *Bô o&g (&>§#) : — & a a Salary BiH 
T b j ^ ^ R b Aaa salary biH t*3iy-.3g ^Kb a^a^y 



814 6th July, 1968. Government Bi Is: 
The \ndhia Pradesh Payment of Salaries 

and Removal of Dtsquahii attons 
(Amendment) BiH, 1968 

V33 3%)g<98b "^o^tr-ag 

e a ^ ^ [ p ^ L ^ ^ ^ 80 ^^a^ex^r r -

3b33bo 33b3go3b *)3o 

-sr-M 
D.O. letter ( j y ^ , -s^ag replies gj^cr* ar*& 
3od gr&^SSao ^ ^ e^^gorr* lS3b 

^j^jo ^ ^ ^ ^ C b ^ ^ ^ ^ a j a r o ^ ^ 

a ^ a o i X g ! ! ^ ^ y g ^ as a r * ^ 

oRr, ojj-* oor̂  &a{ § 

* n -g* L 

^ feo ^-gS" ^ ^ o o ^ a - y t * 3^o3bo 

Deamess Allowance 

ec^ ) ^ r d 33bcC&o^ 3bo^bo v *33 

^ I b o ^ aes'rr* 3bir^d3b &aa 



government Bi l ls : 3 th !u iv 813 
The Andhra Pradesh Payment ( f S dartes 
and Remova^ of Q:s4UAhR 
(Amendment) hdl, 

X). ^^ TT°$)rY*8b 

^cr* ts l o & c ^ 
chancc ! 

y^^tbd ^ j ^ g o . (b lOOe^ ^ ^ ^ ar*3) 
^s E§ijyT"K) s^sr* oL L o— 

6 ^ ^ eo ^ d) 3 o A 

(interruptions) 

Sii K. Govmda Rao What m all that, Sir ? 
Mr. Speaker; Please hear him, don t interrupt. Kbg* ,&&* 

Take it m a good spi it. ^ ^ 
^ ^ 

CO 

^g s^r o o o ^ e a , Bus tickets o^Tr^eR 
a*: ^ ^ ^ — t ^ T H a . Qdow^ 

* ^ ^ ^ IS t , ^ ^ coo^o^Z) 

a f ^ g ^ e i ^ e ^^ tsooooO. ^S^po ) e a^orr^ 

Rtb^^oScr* ^ c r - e ^ ^ N.G*0 e SbR 

Rr* N G O. 
oo3&*oa. 1^18 70 coo^y.^ ov* 10" 

! 8 - P 



316 6th July, 1%8. Government Bills; 
The Andhra Pradesh Pa\m< at of Salaries 
and Renaova< of Disqua iScati ns 
(Amendment) Bill, 1968. 

boagaa^do, R y a g a ^ d o 

^ ^ ^ — boeo 

103^oa ^a^ 5 — ^ ^ ^^L^ ^ ^ ^ O b . 

a j ^ ^ o ^ o a , ^ a ^ ^ ^ a ^ 

Mpgss?, de Payment of Salaries B i l ^ e o a 

&aa Salaries Bill t s & ^ o Allowance ^a 

ma Honorarium ^a rr^ ^ ^ ^^bo^oc^a bco-^rr^ "ggcR 

Sj^o^ca dr- 860 ogb Leo ja^F^A^R) CO u M 
R)oa a^^bex) a r ' ^ ^ b ^ ^ca ôabgy*(%(3a, rr*a amendî ies 

qay&i ^ 250 eo ooj^^^Cb. g*&ao 
dr" 50 eo vd^co, ^Dog) 40 eo ^ 

^ a ) dr* 20 e^, ooo'.-s-* — o o j a ^ d ^ , 2&0 ^ 

nn^o^T^Cb OOĴ  dr* 250 e)9b dr* 250 o j oooo^^bo^ 
aa^ 100 d^a^c^^ ooo^jy^arj. 

^100 dr-a^obe^ Sbgb amenities 

3&y%o^fioaaj3g ^Social worker gj amenities 
^ a ^ o . ge aaocbo^ ojo^d-cr^^o^ [ a & ^ x ^ 

^a^a^a, -sr̂ as -y^&e^a allowance ^ honorarium stab^ 
^ ooJXH^Sb ^ (a^b^o 850 d r * ^ 
od)^ ^^ou^ax) bodc^ ^ ^ a o ^ o a a?a ^^^b^n^d). 

ar^^) amenities 100 dy^c^en ^r-^oa^rr^a 
a ^ g a ^ constituency ^ a d A R o g ^ d j j ê 
ir^a) ^ ^ ^ S b r r - ^ a ^ e aa 

^ ^ L [j3*g<s&orr* -cr-^^OM ^ ^ ^ a ^ , (Mo^pb^y^ ^ a a ^ ^ 



Covennmnt Bil!s: ^th July, 1968. 217 
The An'ihrt Piadesh Payment of Salaries 

and Removal of Disqualifications 
(A'r.endm m) Bdl, i968. 

amenities s^d). Tr^^j agogRS 
free pass ^ ^ essential g>& S b ^ i r ' 

o J ^ b o ^ ^ lailway accident 

follow 2)3oR6 tea 

^ ^ ej a; 
f^j^S)? sS^jo ^^ex) tsocoar* 

6 cncumbrancc eiao, 

passes oxS^ru^aa b-Krgir* ^S^-sr^M §60 

bo bo 6 a>23<T?orr* ôCb̂ oX) 

^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ' ^ g ^ e j ^ g ^ ^ ^^cr'Cb. 

^oooy <jgar* j c ^ ^ a aaoR 
TT65 ^^o e ^ g Ao^xnB. ^A^^^c^b^o ^oSb^o 55b 

Passes 3ooaa e?3 
13 e^gotp**^ cD ooo. Tŷ db 

a&a 

aaTBTg ê*) urSb ^J^go 
Sfeo^^^b. ^ ^ O T ^ ^ ^ g o S'PR ^ 

a record a#3b Aao 

aRygb 



8lg ! Go^Cihmcnt BHs -
Ti c ^nd^ ra Pradesh Payment of Salaries 

and Removal of Disqualifications 
(Amendment) Bnl, 1968. 

^a^nr^da a^orr^ -3[8o-d<go a^a^v^o j . u ^ g d ^ o ^ R b abaa 

ax^Qorr^ cooR tLaD ^ a y ^ b (Pas' 

(jr^o^ba^a ^otbocR a^sb service 
stamps ooj^^r-^ir^ ^s 100 dr^a^c^bex) &o ^ a ^ 
^ ^ g o b n r ^ s ^ ^ a r r a stamps a $30^ 
"gdo 50 gr^o^ex* es^^Ty^oj j onr^d). ^ 100 
d y ^ o S b e ^ abo^) SO i^ao, 10 

-gs ^ ^ d ^ a tiaoSb 

ae^a^o ^tj^^eo. ^Doc^r^) ^ eo 

^ - a a o J a d s o ^ a b a ^ a o u * ^ c ^ ^ a ^ h r s b 

^^b^T^gex) ^Sb au^D 

Mo-^ feel ^ a ^ a d ^aoBbi. -yp agb ^a ^ab 

*axx363 Enhanced emoluments ^a^acy* " § 

-^a Tr-Cb e)^ go<5** 
0006 a g a , 

r^e a savory* ^oco^ 
^ a ^ o ^xbg^aeao^* bob 

i r d ^ ^ ^ ^ 

â Xi aa^oa. i r ^ a a^bg^ ^caco ^a^^^o R T. c . ^ ^ ^ ^ 

^ a ^ tpaeM eo pass oco^ 
s aaa^ a ^ ^ c visit g o & ^ ^ ^ t b . ^o^"a^ 



Government BiHs' ^ ^ 1968 319 
Ti?e Andhra P ^!esh Paym^n of diaries 
and Remove ^ f Di^q ! t itkaiois 
(An.endme 4) B,H, 1%8 

^DO afoaaroR Gcncia! consensus 

90U ^ c t , 

a r ^ - s ^ & d ^ ^ d eo g(JJ 

R ^ e D - ' R j ^ ^Oj j^e^j^, ir^d) ^ ^ c ^ 

- j a * . 1̂ 0 ^ ^ 

a ^ 0 (xbo "^o^^o 
^ Cb ^ o ^ ^ o &) 1!) p O 

-us^G^A ^ I ' ^ ^ d r ^Jg e 

a.eRoR. ^ J o ^ s b c ^ , 

^ S'^-sr'ge^) a Sr*o 1% sr* a S 
c o j ^ ^ r ^ o ^ ^ o ^ o MRac?&3Ty*ao.a 

-*r*& ^ I T ^ s^gboR. 
gn-aa e o ^ Rr- X ^ ^ o 

^ ^ ^ - ^ a - y ^ d ) . s ^ S er^g^rr^ -gre&OEP*, 



<3X0 "th July, Oovei t ment ^ills : 
The Andhra Pradesh Payment of Silaries <tnd 

Removal oi Disqualihcntions ( \mendmenn 
Bill,1068. 

i3 u^o a a 

ird-s^aS $0^0 d& f&n^R 
^o^ -cr°& or* a^ 5 d trjo aaoSoo^ 

^ ^ ^ ooo ^ ^ er̂  ^o ^ d). 
<338 aa^ydb a a ^ o ^ 

a e ^ o ? ^ s^sd^orr* ccuR 
u ^ a ^ ^ o - D ^ 8^ o a g a a^aa 

aS&^a^ojoa^o 63oajs$o?3, ao a 
o o j ^ ^ a o a , aa^oTXcr'&e ^o^^-o^ asb^.a 

i§gb aj^a^a^nr^a^ a a o d n ^ ooocs^ aib 

^djsb ly^^o^a up a 3 3 a, 6aa e a j ^ a o - ^ s j e M a a ^ a a 

^ a. a gdaoa-STT'g) 

It is not as if we are bringing it for the 6rst time and christening it as 
salary for the 6rst time, Sir. 

Mr. Speaker —I think even m the other Legislatures the 
word used is "salary" In Parliament also, the word '-salary" is 
used. 

Sn D. Venkatesham —We are not paid people. It is only 
honorarium given to members. We cannot claim any pension. By 
having salary, one will become a pensioner, What I feel is, it is 
better to substitute m the place of "salary", 'honorarium" or 
"allowance". Mr. Speaker —You can consider about it later on. 

Sri P V Narasimha Rao —This is a term which has been used 
m the Constitution I don't think we can go out of it 



Gov rmrnt BiHs* mv, 821 
The Andhra Pradesh Payment of Planes 
ana Removal of O^squdl ficat ons 
(Amendment) BtH, 

Mr Speaker.—The questions 

"Tha^ the Andhra Pradesh Payment of Silanes and Removal 
of D squalit^utions (Amendment) Bdl, i')63, he iead o first time " 

The motion was adopted. 

Sri P. V. Narasimha Rao * Sir, 1 beg to move . 

"That th; Andht.t Pradt^h Payment of Salaries and Removal 
of Disquahhcations (Amendment) B;!!, benad a second t ime" 

Mr. Speaker - Motion mo\cJ 
( PaiMe ) 

Mr. Speaker: The question is . 

"That the Andhra Pradesh Payment of Salaries and Removal 
ofDisqualiilcations(Amcnd^Ynnt; BilL 1068 be read a second time " 

The motion was adopted. 

Ci.A^sr 2 

M r Speaker: ! here are as many as 9 amendments, 
to tins clause and 1 suppose all of you are ovirg the amendments 
Most of the members had occasion to speak during the general dis-
cussion and so ! shall stiaighiaway put all the amendments to vote 
without any discussion. 

Sri K. Mtiniswamy: - Sir, 1 beg to move. 

" In sub-section ( ! ) of new sect; n 3 after the words "Comial 
of Ministers" insert the words "and the Leader of the Opposition". 

Mr. Speaker :—Amendment moved. 
(Pause) 

Mr* S p e a k e r T h e question is : 

" In sub-section a ) of new section R after the words ' found? 
of Ministers" insert the words "and the Leider of the Opppsition". 

The motion was negatived. 

Sri G. Sivaiah * Sir ! beg to move: 

" In subjection (1) of of new section 3 delete the words "and a 
conveyance allowance of hundred rupees per mensem". 

Mr, Speaker : Amendment mo\ed. 
(Pause) 

Mr Speaker:—The question is 

" In sub-sectitm (1) of new section 3 delete the words "and a 
conveyance allowance of t * o hundred rupees per mensem". 

1 he mot on was negatived. 
Sri K, M u n i s w a m y S i r , I beg to move ; 



CthMy.1968. ^ ^ ^ ^ e r . ^ t Bills ^ 
The ^ndh^ Pradesh Payment . f Sa aries 

and Removal of Disqualifications 
(Amendment) BtH, 

"?n sub-section (2) of new se:tion 3 after the words "other 
Ministers" insert the words "and the Leader of the Opposition" 

Mr Speaker '—Amendment moved 
(Pause) 

Mr Speaker .—The question is. 

' In sub-sect on (2) of new scctnn 3 after the words "other 
Ministers*' niseit the words "and the Leader of the Opposition" 

The motion was negatived. 

Sri Vavilala Gopalakrishnayya —Sir, I beg to move 

"In the proviso to sub-section (2) of new section 3 fbr the words 
"8ve hundred" substitute the words ' three hundred" 

Mr Speaker -—Amendent moved * 
(Pause) 

Mr Speaker —The question is * 

' In the proviso to sub-section o" new scction H for the words 
"five hundred" substitute the woids "three hundred". 

The amendment was negatived. 

Sri G Sivaiah .—Sir, I beg to move 

' Delete the proviso m sub-section (2) of new section 3". 

Mr Speaker —Amendment moved 
(Pause) 

Mr Speaker —The question is * 

' De!ete the proviso m sub-section ('3) of new section 

The motion wjts negatived. 

Sri K Mumswamy * - Sir, I beg to move * 

"In sub-section (8) of new*section 3 after the words "any other 
Minister" insert the words "and the Leader of the Opposition" 

Mr, Spea er —Amendment moved 
(Pause) 

Mr Speaker -^-The que tion is 

"In sub-section (a) of new section i after the words "any other 
Minister" insert the words "and the Leader of the Opposition". 

^ he motion was negate ed. 

Sri Vavilala Gopalakrishnayya :—Sir, I beg to move . 

"In sub- eetion (8) of new section 3 delete {the words "whether 
or not", 



Government Biiis . 6th J: !y i 323 
The A^dhia Pnule h Payment of !es 

and Removai ^̂  iMieatimis 
(Amendment) Bdt, 

Mr, Speaker -Amendment moved 
^Pausc) 

Mr. ^ peaker: The question is * 

'*In sub-section < t) of new seutî n a d !cte the w^rds **wheth( 
or not". 

The motion tugtitived 

Mr. Speaker: Now, theye are two amendments given notice 
of by the Chief Mitn ter. lie may move them 

Sn K. Bra' mananda Reddy : Sir,! beg to move 

"In clause m sub-section ( ! ) of new section ?!, for the words 
"{wo hundred" substitute the wo*ds "four hundred" 

Mr̂  Speaker:-Amendment moved, 
(Pause) 

Mr. SpeakerThe question is: 

' in clause 3 in subsection (1) of new section % for the words 
"two hundred" substitute the words 'four hundred." 

The motion was adopted. 

Sri K. Brahmananda Reddy :—Sir, 1 beg to move: 

' In clause 2, after sub-section (H) of new section S add the 
Mowing new hub-section '-

The income-tax payable by t!.e Chief Minister, the 
Deputy Chief Minister, if any. or any other Minister, in so far as it 
relates to the salary, ajlowances and perquisites mentioned m fhn 
section, shail be borne by the Spte Government,"; 

My Speaker t - Amendment moved. 

^ ^ — ^ ^ eg 
axr+jSi? ^^^Hjotjo ^ ^ ^ ^ ^jo^ce^) d r ^ ^ a 
Qo^ ^ d 500 ^ 400 o j— . 
L90J ^ ^ A^oig)—a>o^/T*§a 

1S60 ^ r o ^ n ^ w 
^ ^ &00 oxr <9'RioEa'R>o4M 

^ ^ i ^ o & u 1 800 6r*.t? ^ ^ 
tr-^&o^ E ^ ^ ^ o ^ ^ 
gP^&S" ^ R, ^ o ^ ^ m M 20 ^ E0 ^ 

^ h)^ "3-*6S rr* R^) ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 



324 6th July. 1968* Government Bills 
The An<lhr t Prad sh Payment of Salaries 

&nd Removal of DisqualiRcatioi s 
(Amendment) Bi!^ 19 8 

ac^ ^ O o ^ a ^ 3R)oa ^ ^ aj^Sb 
nr^^ao. ^a^^o&x) a^jj^o .rba^cj 

ŝ ô? ao^ir^D 

B ^ o ^ a o o ^ — ^00 dr* eo ^ 400 ex), 

^^b^g aao^bo^ v^J^o S'Rai^aa^a. ^a 

/ ^ a a . a ^ ^ o ^ i ^ ^ — 200 3bo.R 400 ^ 03b ^ 

^ga^aoj ^xy* In heu of Government house to which every Minister 
is entiled, we give him Rs 500 

d^F aaoc6o We have got several per-
qmsites which are free from mcometax in so many !aws. ^ ^ ^ ^ 

aa^ -s^^^a aameo gagRb. 

Free &ommcometax aa^ag 

^ a a. a^a —Free <90^ Bao-^b^boa 
There are well established principles for computing that 

6gur&. ^ do not think there is any need for us to make any changes 
here. The l Mention is very clear and the income-tax people know 
ho# to calculate and it w 11 be done accordingly 

Mr Speaker The question is: 

^InClause2 after sub section (3) of new Section 3, add the 
following new sub-section: 

' (4). The income-tax paygMe by the Chief Minister, the 
Deputy Chief Minister if any, or any other Minister, m so &r as }t 
relates to the salary, allowances ano perquisites mentioned in this 
section shall be born b̂  %he State Government \ 



Government Hilis ^th Ju!y, 196$. 325 
The Andhra Piadcs Pa) ncnt of Salaries 

and Removal and Disqua lhcanons 
(Amendment) bii!, l%b 

The motion was adopted. 

Mr Speaker —The q u e s t s xs: 

"That clause t!, as amended 1 do stand pait of the Bill/' 

The motion was adopted. 

Ciause as amended, was a&ied to the Bill 

CtAbsr 3, 

Sri G Sivauh Sir 1 beg to move: 

* " M sub-section ( ! ) of new section 4, deleted the woids 'and 
a convc;ance lWvance of two hundred rupees per mensem'.". 

Mr Speaker .—Amendment moved. 
( Pause ) 

M r Speaker: The question is : 

" In Sub scetiou ( I ) of new Section 4, delete the words 'and 
a conveyAnce allowance of two hundred rupees yer mensem 

The motion was negatived. 

Sri G Sivaiah beg to move : 

*Deietc the proviso m sub-section (2) of new section 4". 

Mr. Speaker :-—Amendment moved. 

(Pause) 

Mr. Speaker: -The question is . 

"Delete ĥc proviso m sub-scction (2) of new Section 

The motion was negatived. 

Sri R. Satyanarayana Raju: -Sir, i beg to move: 
" !n the proviso to sub-section (2) of new section 4, for the 

words'Ave hundred rupees', substitute the words 'three hundred 
rupees'.". 

Mr, Speaker:- Amendment moved. 
(Pause) 

Mr. S p e a k e r T h e question is : 

" In the proviso to sub-section (2) of new section 4 fbr the 
words <Rve hundred rupees', substitute the words 'three hundred 
rupees'.". 

The motion was negatived. 

Mr. SpeakerThere Are two amendments given notice of by 
.the Chief Minister 

Sri P. V/ Narasimha Rao :—Sir, I beg ta HMWR? 



3% 6ti $ 8 Government B:!!s * 
The Andhra Prades ̂  Pavm nt of Salaries 

ard Remo^a of D sq^aliRcations 
(Amendment) Bill, 19,8. 

' In Clause in sub-section (1) of new section 4, for the 
words 'two hundred' substitute the words 'four hundred". 

Mr Speaker -Amendment moved 
(Pause) 

Mr Speaker --The question is. 
"In clause 3, msub-sectun (1) of new section i*. for tlu 

words 'two hundred, substitute the words Tour hundred " 

The motion was adopted 
Sn P. V Narsimha Rao —Sir, I beg to move. 
'Tn clause 3. after sub-section (4; of new section 4, add* the 

following new sub-section 

'57 The income tax piyble by the Speaker or the Chairman, 
i n s o f a r as it relates to the salary, allowances and perquisites men-
tioned m this section, s! all be borne by the State Government 

Mr* Speaker —Amendment moved. 
(Pause) 

Mr Speaker —The question is 
"In Clause 3, after sub-section (4) of new'section 4, add the 

following new sub-section 

'(5) The income-tax payable by the Speaker or the Chairman, 
m so far as it relates to the salary, allownces and perquisites mentio-
ned m this section, shall be borne by the State Government* 

The motion was adopted. 

Mr. Speaker —The question is * 

''That Clause as amended, do stand part of the Bill"* 

The motion was adopted. 

Clause 8 (as amended) was added to the Bill 

CLAUSE 4. 

. Sn P* Narsmga Rao .—Sir, I beg to move. 

"In Clause 4 for the words' three hundred and Rfty rupees 
substitute the words four hundred and 6fty rupees*/' 

Mr Speaker :—Aanendment moved. 
(Pause) 

Mr. Speaker .—The quest:on is * 

In Clause 4, for the words 'thr.e hundred andRRy rupees/ 
substitute the words 'four hunured and Afty rupees' " 

The motion was nsgatived, 

Sri D Venkatesham :-*Sir, I beg to move : 



^overnmcm i!'Hs 6 h Jul , 1'6s 337 
The Andhra Pradesh Pavmei of ^a^ri^s 

and Rcmo a! of Disqua H ations 
(Amendment Biih 

" la clause ^ l ^ r the \\^ids*thicc hundred fifty rupees' sub-
sfit'itc the words 'fb ! hundred rupees'. 

M r Shaker Amendment moved. 
(Pau^c) 

Mr. Sp r j k e r ! qn^ t n? is ; 

"Jtnctaiise^f^r^i^^oids 'three !mmhcd hf(y rupees', sub-
stitute vnuds hund^d rupees'. 

The mutton was negative!, 

Sn D Venkatesham -hi ciausc 4 for th^ words 'three hundi^d 
and Hfty rupees* substitute the words 'live hundrea r̂  pees\ 

Mr. Speaker: Amendment moved 
(Pause) 

Mr Speaker The quest on is : 

*h tdaufc4 , for the words'three huudied and hfty tupees', 
substitute the words bunded rupees * 

The motion was negriti/ed* 

Sri K. Govmda kao . Sir, ! beg (o move: 

' ^orOause substitute the foHowing -

Addan^%v^ub^shusc(aa)of subjection ( ! ) uf Section 
H of the principal Act 

'(a a) *':) Every Member of Legista^urc shall be entitled fbr a 
free quarter in the city of Hyderabad. 

(ii) Lvery member shaH be provided with a telephone at his 
permanent residence. 

(iii) Fvery member shaH be altowed to use free the jeep of the 
Panchayat Samithi of which he is a full member for not less than five 
days per month in his constituency. 

(xv) Every member shal! be entitled fbr a Rrst class raiway 
pass fbr {travel in the State of Andhra Pradesh and pass m R. T. C. 
bu es in our state wherever they are available. 

(v ) AH expenditure* borne oy each of the members of State 
Legislature on postal and telegraph chargcs shall be reimbursed by 
the State Government". 

Mr. Speaker :—-Amendment moved. 

^ocno^a ^ s b w ^ o ^ c d ^^i&Xb^ 



338 6th July, 1363 Government Bills * 
The Andhra Pi ^desh Payment of Salaries 

and Rem ^al ot DsqualiScations 
(Am^ndmem) Bill, 1968 

Mr Speaker —The question is 

'Tor Clause 4, substitute the following < 

'4 Add a new sub clausc (aa) of sub-section ( ! ) of Section l l 
of the principal Act. 

'(aa) fi) Every Member of Legislature shall be entitled for a 
free quarter m the city of Hyderabad. 

(n) Every member shall be provid "d with a telephone at his 
permanent residence 

(m) Every member shall be allowed to use free the jeep of the 
Panchayat Samithi of which he is a fu'l member for not less than fhe 
days per month m his constituency 

(iv) Every me i ber shall be entitled for a first class railway 
pass for travel in the State of Andhra Pradesh and a pass m R i . C 
buses m our State wherever they are availble 

(v) All expenditure borne by each of ?!ie members of State 
Legis at'ire on postal<and telegraph charges shall be reimbursed by 
the State Government'/' 

The irotion was negatived. 

Sn Vavdala Gopalakrishnayya :—Sir, I beg to move 

" In clause 4 for the words 'three hundred and fifty rupees', 
substitute the woros 'two hundred and fifty rupees'." 

Mr Speaker —Amendment moved. 
(Pause) 

Mr Speaker.—The question is* 

" In Clause 4 for the words 'three hundred and Afty rupees'* 
substitute the words 'two hundred and fifty rupees/* 

The motion was negatived* 

Sn R. Satyanarayana Raju —I beg to move : 

"Delate Clause 4". 

Mr, Speaker:—Amendment moved. 
(Pause) 

Mr. Speaker :—The question is . 

"Delete Clause 4/* 

The motion was negatived. 

Mr. S p e a k e r T h e question is : 

"That Clause 4 do stand part of the Bill/' 



Government Bills* 6tn luly, 329 
The Andhra Pradesh Payment ef Saranes 

and R*mo\al of Disqualifications 
(Amendment) Bi'd, 1968 

The n otion was adopted. 

Claus^ 1 was added to the BiH. 

Sri G. Sivaiah Sir, f beg to move 

"Add the following new sections at the end of Section 1! of 
the principal Act . 

H A AH the member of the Andhra Pradesh Legislative Assembly 
shall be provided Government j^ep cars foi 60 days in an ;ear 
to tour t)ien rt^pectnc Asstm^ly Constituencies. 

11 B. All the members < f the Andhra Pradesh Legislative Assembly 
and Council shnll be provided with service postal stamps for 
oiRcia! correspondence and free passe* to travel in A P. S. R 
T C buses and Ii*dimiRadna;s within the boundaries of 
Andhra Pradesh and Tt lephones at Government cost wherever 
the tetephoi e system is working. , 

11 C. All the memhrrs of the Andhra Pradesh Legislative Assembly 
and Council shJl be provided s îth free accommodation 
during the peiiods of Assembly, Council and Committee 
meetings". 

Mr. Speaker : - Amendment moved. 
(Pause) 

Mr. Speaker : The question is : 

"Add the following new sections at the end of Section 11 of 
the Principal Act. 

H A. AH the members of the Andhra PradeshtLe^islativc Assembly 
shall be provided Government jeep cars tor 60 dt.ys ;n an year 
to tour the:r respective Assembly constituencies' 

11 B, A!! the members of the Andhra Pradesh Legislative Assembly 
and Council shall be provided with service postal stamps for 
ofHcia! correspondence and free passes to travel in A P. S 
R. T. C. buses and Indian Railways within the bouuda ies of 
Andhra Pradesh and Telephones at Government cost wherever 
the telephone system is working. 

11 C. AH the members of the Andhra Pradesh Legislative Assembly 
and Conned shal! be provided with free accommodation 
during the periods oi /sssmbly, Council and Committee 
meetings". 

The motion was negatived. 

CtAUSf 1 

Sri Vavilala Goialaknshnayya : I beg o move : 
"This Act comes into fbrce at once". 
My. Speaker : Amendment moved. 

^Pause) 



330 6di July 196^ Co\ernmen BiHs 
The Andhra Pradesh Payment t f Salaries 

and Removal of Disqat tna 'ons 
(Amendment; Bill, 968. 

Mr Speaker —The quest,on is 
''This Act comes into force at once" 
The motion was negatived 
Sri R S<3tyanarayana Raju - I beg to move : 
" In sub-clause (2) of Clause 1 for the woids' on the sixth 

March, 1967', substitute the words 'from the date of the commence-
ment of the Amendment Act'. 

Mr Speaker --Amendment moved 
(Pause) 

Mr Speaker . - I h e question is 
" In sub-clause (2) of C!ause I f o r the words 'on the sixth 

March, 1%?' substitute the words ' f r jm the date of the commence-
ment of the Amendment Act/' 

The motion was negatived. 
Sn T Satyanarayana -Sir , I beg,to move * 
In sub-clause (2) of Clause 1 delete the words "except section 
4 and section 4 
Mr Speaker ,—Amendment moved 

(Pause) 
Mr Speaker The question is . 
" In sub-clause (2) < f Clause 1 delete the words 'except 

section 4 . and sect on 4 " 
The motion was negatived 
Sri D Kondal Rao . - Sir, I beg t<* move : 
"Tn sub-clause (2) of Clause 1 oelete the words 'except 

section 4' and' and section 4 shall come mto force at once " 
Mr, Speaker '--Amendment moved 

(Pause) 

Mr Speaker The question is : 

"In sub-clause (2^ of Clause 1, delete the words 'except Section 
4' and' and section ^ sha 1 come mto force at once/' 

The motion was negatived 

Sri P. V Narasimha Rao --Sir, 1 have got one amendment. 
In clauses 2 and 3 we have adopted certain amendments ^his is 
consequential, so that they may not be given retrospective effect 
It wiH have prospective egect, This amendment is meant fbr that 
I beg to move 

For exislmg sub-clause 2 of Clause 1, substitute the following: 

"(2) This Act, except the provisions m— 

(i) sections 2 and 3, m so far as they relate to the convey mce 
allowance and the income-tax to be borne by th * St te Government, 
aad 



GovernmentBil 's 6th July, 3968 331 
The Andhra pradesa Payment of Salaries 

and Removal of Disqualifications 
(Amendment; Bill, 1933 

(11) section 4, shal* be deemed to have come into force on the 
6th March 1967, and the provisions excepted in items (i) and 
above shal! come into fbrce at once". 

Mr Speaker .—Amendment moved. 

^ RgbeS"* 

BS^ agyaodjraj . ^ojj^osb retrospective effect ^o^sb ? 

^ .-Retrospective effect "g^ocr^ 

o 

^ -—Income tax ^ retrospective effect 

^ S) ^ — c r * -

Mr. Speaker^ They are not giving retrospective effect I* 
comes mto force after the Bill becomes law That is the eflect of thî  
amendment The question is* "For existing sub-clause of Clause substitute the folio" 
wmg 

This Act, except the provisions m 
(i) sections X and 3, in so far as they relate to the conveyance 

allowance and the income-tax to be borne by the State Government, 
and 

(ii) Section 4, shall be deemed to have come into force on the 
6th March 1967, and the provtsions excepted in items (i) and fn) 
above shall come into force at once". 

The motion was adopted 
M r Speaker : - The quest.on is : 
"That Clause 1, as amended !, do stand part of the Bill"-
The motion was adopted. 
Clause 1 as amended was added to the Bill. 

ENACTIhG FORMULA AND LONG TITLE 

Mr. Speaker :— The question is * 
"That the Enacting Formuh and Long Title do stand part of 

the Bill", 
The motion was adopted 
The Enacting Formula and the Long Title were added to the 

Bill. 
Sri P. V. Narasimha Rao : — Sir. I beg to move -

"That the Andhra Preaderh Payment of Salaries and R&mova 
of Disqualifications (Amendment) BiH' 1968 be read a third time 

38-.1S 



332 6th luly, 1968. Government B1 ss 
The Andhra Pi adesh Payment of Salaries 

and Ren oval of Disqualifications 
(Amendment) Bill, 1968. 

Mr Speaker — Motion moved 
(Pause) 

Mr. Speaker:—The question is. 

That the Andhra Pradesh Payment of Salaries and Removal of 
DisqualiRcations (Amendment) Bill, 1968 be read a third time 

The motion was adopted 

Mr Speaker.—The House now stands adjourned tdl 8 30 A M 
on 8th M y , 1968 

The House then adjourned till Half-past Eight of the clock on 
Monday, the 8th July, 1968. 


