
Issued on N-J-39 

Vo!. X X ! ' n ^ ^ ^ n i "̂̂  December, 1958-
No- 2- t ^ ' ^ ^ ^ ^ K w 1? (Tuesday) 

ANDHRA PRADESH LEGISLATIVE 
ASSEMBLY DEBATES 

OfRcial Report 

F A R T II - Proceedings other than Questions and Answers 

CONTENTS. 
PACES 

Business of the House. ... , ... .. 71 
Paper laid on the Table of the House 

Appropriation Accounts 1955-56 and Audit 
Report 1957 of the Government of Hyderabad ... ,.. 72 

Government Bills 
The Andhra Pradesh (Abolition of Cash Grants) 
Bill, 1938 - Passed ... ... ... ... 72 

The Hyderabad Tenancy and Agricultural Lands 
(Andhra Pradesh Amendment) Bill, 1958. 
—Referred to the Andhra Pradesh Regional Committee ... SO 

Business of the House... ... ... ... -« 8$ 

Government Bill 
The Madras Rent and Revenue Sales and the Madras Revenue 
Recovery (Andhra Pradesh Extension and Amendment) Bill, 94 
1958. —Passed 

Note.—*at the commencement of the speech denotes conRrmation from the 
Member not received in time. 

Printed By Nagafjuna Ptintrng Works, Hyderabad. 
For The Director, Government Press, Hyd-A* P. 





THE 
ANDHRA PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY DEBATES 

OFF!ClAL REPORT 

ANDHRA PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

Tuesday, the 2 nd December, I9S8 

The House met at Nine of the Cbck 

f My. Sĵ eâ r in th,6 Ch^trJ 

Q UESTIONS A N D A N S W E R S 

(S<g P<%rt I) 

BUSINESS OF THE HOUSE 

^ a. j?jc&s$3j* 8 rDs$c&)^^o): Rr§& Legislature 

Secretariat y ^ "The eiev nth year of Freedom" o & &^ 

^ ^ ^ ^ & suppty ̂ ^^ ^^ AH India Congress Committee 

Publication, ro^ai ga>4$ ̂ oo jsS^^&3 r^ :&*& 3^cp 

ao?5f ^ c f : ef&a urgent ^ ^ ^ allow ^ % & 

Secretariat ^^ < ^ ^ o ^ ̂ tyR "3>a ^h3 gr^R). Finance 

Department 3*& ̂  w ^ * & ^ ^ ys53go*& 3 ^ gg^$ ̂ ^ 
l^of^. ^& 83*a*n* i^^goo^^, ^^o Secretariat ̂ oo aa%& 



7J 2nJ Dece77!&er, 7PJ^ The An<%m Pr^J^A (AM^foya 
oĵ  Ĉ ĥ Cyrano) Bfi^ /Pf<y. 

^ $3. O ^ X ^ ( f ^ o ^ ) : ^ ̂ 5t^ go30 ^o*^^ ̂ 6oC 6 ̂  

*$<&;$ ^oo^rrcb 3c^ar-^^6b. 6 5) *§<$) 33a motion move ̂ >̂ 

^ - R x u p ;3<Rbo&. 

&bS<T ^ ^ 5 " : ̂ o ^ ^ <3*Sg*a -̂ ,̂̂ ^̂ . Minister T̂ oj ̂ ^ 

P A P E R LAID O N T H E T A B L E O F T H E H O U S E 

/(ppwynaf/pH /4<xx>M/??F 7933 S6 ̂ J / 4 ^ ^ J?(^ry 7P57 

77^ M^fj;^r/br France ("Srf A\ J!r^wn^^&R^^y)r 

Sir, I lay on the Table of the House, a copy of the 
Appropriation Accounts 1935-36 and Audit Report 1957 
of the Government of Hyderabad under Arti.le 151 (2) of 
the Constitution of India. 

Mr. 6'/7<'#%<y/'; Paper laid on the Table of the House. 

GOVERNMENT BILLS 

/%<' /4nJArj Pra&tT/t (/4&o/fi?pM qjfC<M% CranfF) 
R/7/ /P3& 

Mr. $9M%<?;-: There are some amendments given 
notice of by Government. The hon. Minister for Revenue 
may move them. 

C/#M<y<? 4 

77?e MmLyfer ybr jRrvf/%M̂  ^rf ̂  ^^Araffj jRd3f̂ ): I 
move. 

"In item 2 (i) of the Table for the words 'if male, in 
case the grantee is' substitute the words 'in the case of a 
male, or an unmarried woman, if the grantee is'." 

Mr. $p<?a&pr: Amendment moved. 



The AnJhrd P?^^h (Abolition 2nJ December, /P3# 7J 
of C^nh Quanta) Btii / ^ & 

Unmarried females aaoa^o e,g* provision ^^^^^-^ ̂ ^ 
o-a& ^o^e^ ̂ ^ ^ ^& ̂ gc^^^r?) 'unmarried women' <sa 
l̂ r̂  3c^&S&o a6<!ca. ^o^Sol^ Ho^^o. 

/k?r 5^^^^-: The question is: 
"In item 2 (t) of thj Table for the words If male, in 

case the grantee is' sub stitute the words 'in the case of a 
mate, or an unmarried woman, if the grantee is\" 

The amendment was adopted 
tSn ̂  %nA;<2f<2 /?a# : 1 move: 
In item 2 (ii) of theTable tor the woids 'If a widow" 

substitute the words 'in the case of a widow'. 
"In item ? (1) of the Table for the words 'if male, 

incase such cash grant' substitute the words 'm the case of a 
male if such cash grant". 

"!n item 3 (ii) of the Table fur the words 'if female' 
substitute the woids 'in the case of a female". 

Afr. <$)%'#4;<v-: Amendments moved. 
(f%M,ye) 

A/r SjPf#A:<?r: The question is: 
In item 2 (ii) rf the Table for the words 'if a widow' 

substitute the words 'm the case of a widow'. 
"In item 3 (i) of the Table for the words 'if male, in 

case such cash grant' substitute the words 'in the case of a 
male if such cash grant'." 

'In Item 3 (it) of the Table for th) wirds 'if female' 
substitute the words 'in th ̂  case of a female'." 

The amendments were adopted. 
5 W C. %M3ma/K/% jRcJJy fj&M/gH-fJ : I move. 

"In sub-clause (2) (i) of clause 4 for the words 'four 
times' substitute the words 'one time'," 

Afr. *$pe#%fr : Amendment moved. 

^ t§ <aj;&oB**5& : ̂ s t ; ̂  amendments ?68oa agj,:§ 

35-*\;3). category (A) <s** ^a^a*as ̂  Baa 3o*a gsSgsSeag ̂ ^^ 

^̂ x) ̂ <R ôo!̂ r?co ̂ r^^^J^ ^j^u)o^^&x) ̂ ^^&)<^^a. a^g^o 

^ ^ e D 3*3a. ̂  ̂ g'̂ ôr̂  5b<$Sb 5T8 a^dRsSa^* S^^g^ ̂ . cs^go^o 

c^^ R a c ^ ^ ^ O o ^ ^ ^ e d & & ^ 5^^ e.̂  "B̂ s> ̂ ^t tTco^ 



^ *3. *3o^^c^^ - ̂ ^o ̂ o ^ ^oaun-iniorinat!on gather 

^rns* ^o"& 3̂ 'H 3oOU û"cj tLsc^ ĉ D c^3 t l ^ c^^^^^j 

that will be ihe iargcst amount which ^it! be given. 4 cep 

category (A) ̂  Ji3n ̂ oa ^?yj^ 18[)H 33033 maximum 5n <̂r Jh 

J03U J*^K) ^^ou J)j/ld)̂  ̂ 05 t)P ̂ r^o^'p l)tô  SL̂ < ̂ , Q.cboĴ  

groaaaoR 7x:rjr̂ , uTcjŷ usoL̂  ^)L^df:^ LCJ r^a-e^^Rga ĝ cc) 

<̂ ^̂ ô ^^o&. t̂ ĵuG ÔJb 7,̂ 8 1*7 or̂ uu J)crC;5 tSOo^^e;^ 

:§uejjoa categroy'C ^ ? 1M Lj.^ ̂ ,^^. cso^r^ (j (;M xaoae 

Ŝ dJ axr̂ Oo. X)r^^^o^o cn^^^j^A.G OfHcc^oJ), ^r 

es!^ ̂ 0^) ̂ u^^ ̂ ^cruoo^D j?65 u a ^ Compensation, ̂ ^<^. 

l̂ &o r^, utmost 3 t.tx ̂ ^ r ^ ^ ^ g heavy compensation raa 

ye<3 cor ^itooS'lbo^^) withdraw ^s^a^uiiD ^n&$?^r 7^^ 

< ^ ^ ^ 3<.a6j Ĵ :ô 5j ̂ o^^^^o. Quantum J^^^. ^^5"^.^T 

<D733*3S ̂ ^ ^IWQ (̂ rnco once for all overcompensation ^^*& 

^r^?S^n*X) extras rdinary s*^ r?^5 ojr e)*2co5"^jc^^ wt h-

draw ^^5*^^^^ 5^00^^^. 

<§) t3 ^o&a^*3A : ̂ o(0r?d) oaR^R $)^^^b sS^y^o 

B ^^^ C ^ ^ ^^ 13oe3& iyey ̂ aa^rr ^r^^. sy^ ^5b^^ or. RH 

o^o<5^ X ) ^ ^ E^^o 'A' y^a. ^ ; ^9^a ^ ^ 5 . a.r\-̂ -̂.55 

4 ; 3=t2 l̂ o), 1̂  lo^RSa ̂ $^&oa. ̂ o^s^o B c ^ *3b*3 a* Xanlrrc*, 

Afr. *$pr#R<T; The question is : 
- "Insub-ciause(2)(i)ofdause4for the w rds <f ur 

tin es' substitute the words 'one time' " 

The amendment was negatived. 

&<;' %t'/7a/% C^^/^Ar^/?^^^ (^f^M^///) r I move: 

"!nsub-c!ause(2)(i)ofdause 4 for the words'four 
times' substitute the words 'three times'/' 



The AnJhra Prd&sh, (AMitton 2?id December, 793<3 "J 
o/ Cdsh. C?T<mts) BtH, 793^. 

M r *Sp̂ Â:er: Amendment moved. 

Mr. $9(?a%<?r; The question is: 
"In sub-clause (2) (i) of clause 4 for the words Tour 

times' substitute the words 'Three times'/' 

The amendment was negatived. 

6*rf %?v//%/<3 C^^/^ArrMf?jyy^ : Sir, i beg to move : 

In sub-clause (2) (ii) of clause 4 for the word 'six' sub
stitute the words 'two and half. 

Mr. tSpfaAjrr : Amendment moved. 

6 times <3& oajaacf̂  ^ s ^r^o. Payments ^^o *a rr 

^o^^g). & ^ reduce ̂ *& 5?^od(S). Incongruous ̂  ^o^o5. 

Afr. *yp^&(?r : The question is: 

In sub-clause 2 (ii) of Clause 4 for the word tsix' sub
stitute the words 'two and half. 

The amendment was negatived. 
,&*; %zvi?a/a G<?j?#/aA;rMMgyy% : Sir, I beg to move : 

In sub-clause (2) (ii) of clause 4 for the words 'six' 
substitute the words 'three'. 

Afr. t!%Mkfr : Amendment moved. 

Mr. iSjpeYy&rer: The question is : 

"In sub-clause (2) (ii) of clause 4, for the words 'six' 
substitute the words 'three'." 

The motion was negatived. 
*SW %fw?gJ<3 G o ^ ^ k r ^ A ^ y y ^ : Sir, I beg to move : 

"In sub-clause (2) (ii) of clause 4, for the word 'six' 
substitute the word 'four'. 

Mr. *SpM%pr : Amendment moved. 
(Pause) 

Mr. $p<?#A;<?r: The question is : 

"In sub-clause (2) fii) of Clause 4, for the word 'six 
substitute the word 'four'/' 

The amendment was negatived. 



76 TnJ Defender, 7P3^ The AnJ?^d P?uJe\^ (AMition 

6*n Fhv//^/^ C^/?n/^kf^//u^yw : Sir, I beg to move ; 

"Insert the following proviso before the existing 
proviso. 

'Provided that nobody wiH be paid a lumpsum of 
Rs. 5000 at a time' " 

m o v e ^ ^ ^ ^ . Q o c ^ ^oO^rroo RacfcoUiaar* ^^54 i2 ̂ o^o*& 

<̂ D̂ o<55 (j^aoRB-aa ^^o^oa. ^a rehabi!itation 5^^^ t37$a 

o^*^ ̂ o^o compensation ^ ^ x r ^ ^ R ^^. Rehabilitation 

^*ioo5*i2&o^^D oaMdRo J)̂ a§ 5 l̂ s*oib (at a time) asa^ 
sj-dd^, Qâ (fso 12 annual instalments oRB^Rja. &^3 s&*# m 
annual instalments ̂ o^oD. ;3-*sog) *^o^^ 6r^cx^ej o^&oa. 
At a time oaa^a 5 ̂co s*6&. 

^a P^vf/j/^ Gop^f^r/^AM^^: I beg to withdraw m y 
amendment. 

The amendment was, by leave of the House, withdrawn. 
<5W R. &?M^grayya, (R^c/zfr^^y^/e^-O^er^J): Sir, I 

beg to move: 

Add the following proviso to sub-section (2) of 
Clause 4. 

"Provided that in respect of each of cases speciSed 
in column (1) of the table below, the compensation 
payable under sub-section 2 for cash grants specified in 
Parts A <6 B. of the Schedule shall be paid subject to the 
conditions specified in each case in column (2). 

(I) (2) 
1. if the grantee has other A sum equivalent to one 
source of income of more time the annual amount, 
than 5000 per year. 

2. If the grantee has other A sum equivalent to two 
source of Rs. 2000 per times the annual amount, 
vear. 

Mr. ,%<?#A;er : Amendment moved. 



The AndftM PydJarh (Ahô tfon 2yid December, 793d 77 
o / G ^ Grants) Bi!!, 79J& 

^ ^). ^o^c&g:. ^^gg:, ^a aoa)7T36 B ^* <xD5g^^ 

^ ^ o ^ <s3°^&. ̂ odSSgo g S3<̂ a) ̂  TSaggo\;&. & o ^ ^g^gg>o^ 

c:ĵ  ^)^d^r^ t33i?a&B*̂ s3D ^o^^r?d) g^^rzygo vg^(S>. zr5§ 

o x ^ o 1^) ^c&j)^d). s;5̂ $̂b <3og ^crd^o sr65 gH3g^<5^ 

^gj<^ ^<a. y&§ ŝ ?jo ̂ o^ o M ^ o ^ 5 ŝ gaoa- sr^5 go^\cp^§ 

^ ^ ^c?d^o 10 *i^, 20 ̂ 6^, 5 !&*_ ^ g ) ^ ^ base ^a o ^ ^ o 

a^c&o. srr? ô bco &o^ maintain !3aiS"^oagr5S {r^-o^^oo 
— ^ ^ &j 

^s*oo compensation oD^col) ̂ ^ o ^ cxog^^^^. 'a' "̂ Rr<; 

eo^ *^^5yd)r?^. gbge^^r?^, tP&agcdS sr3oo*R) ^5S mainte-

nence ^oRoBsrge* zyX)g53̂ gEâ (3&. y^^zycXbo^o^g^g^^ ^co^ 

§^^^boa- t9o<58§ aj'ĝ g'or̂  ox^g^^o g^Soesgo y^S. 3 tco g^\y55 

10 o&o es_̂  ̂ o^i^g^. &jg"^oag g^\^35 10 lo ^ Ŝcpcs* ^o^^* 

i^g^g^. s-*a43 ̂ ?̂ ) e?n*&^^es ̂ ^^gc^g^^o Socialistic pattern 
of society 3^as r)d)go?r &o^o&. ag^sre§ <3&a-a. ^^s-63 
^sb^Sj oD^^o ^?gd^o s*<s>. ^a gradation basis *̂ ^ asa^ass 
Lr*^§^^^L^^3. Q^5* ̂ ^d^sSKx?^^^ gradation g<5<§§bR base 
^ox) i^d^^o^^^o. 4 times, 6 times iseSgoa^o -̂s tg^oaa 
^o&& ^^^^oo^sre <3^^<^^§ g?a*3^o s*<3b. Q ^ ^ &g^cy^ 

^^)T-^o^]& J)^^g es-<3&o ̂ g^^6§ ^Sox^g g^o&. ^^^r3§ ggS^a 

^r^ca. r ^ gradation g^s) aoa^rrss 8 , ^ ^ 5 7 0 ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ . 

§^ .̂ ̂ o&ocy*3&:- <9<5gg, ^ gg^ea^ 'other sources 

of mcome' ^ ^ ^ i ) ^ ^ n*â gy-<a; consideration ^^ ^^ 

§^ro. ia. a3r) & ^ ^ & ) r o ^ provision ^o^^). Other sources 

of income &o3 gog^crS)$ 6r. 5 *^o dr^d^o ^crd3oo glS^ 

^^*&b3 Su^gog^d ecrd^o, B o ^ l§ooK)!§, e^o^^o *Bo^ *3&&^oa*0. 

A, C, Categones a <saogo<a gradation g#as g o c a ^ ^ ^ ^ 

(̂ . "§. *3o^CP^ :. a-S gg^ea ^oA^3o^4j-M ^)eo^. 

tggco tw ^^i^g^F^^ c*er- *§cr ag^R. J^g3S eo^co ^^5* 

^g^D Q^ 1864 g gog^yfog* e36Aoa. 1962 g g o g ^ ^ ^ S R&gReo 

sny^Cb. &baoggb^ g r ^ r & , ̂  a&gxxsgS ^ o ^ ^ t m ^ Q^g3-^gb. 



7% 2n<% Dec^m^y, 7PJd The AndTtra PTdJ^h (A&!rtion 

t3̂ 5$̂ o crcr ŝ 3̂*2a;S ^̂ dsbŝ o. ^D^o ^̂ \ compensation 

Afr. 5^Mk^r : The question is: 

Add the following proviso to sub-section (2) of 
Clause 4. 

"provided that in respect of each of cases speci&ed in 
column (1) of the table below, the compensation payable 
under sub-section 2 for cash grants speciRed in parts A and 
B of the Schedule shall be paid subject to the conditions 
specified in each case in column (2) 

(!) < (2) 
1. if the grantee M s other A sum equivalent to one 
source of income of more time the annual amount, 
than 5000 per year. 

2. if the grantee has other A sum equivalent to two 
source of 20C0 per year, times the annual amount. 

The amendment was negatived. 

Afr. $PM%2/*: The question is: 

That clause 4, as amended, do stand part of the BilL 

The motion was adopted. 
Clause 4, as amended was added to the Bill. 

C/%My<?,y 2 %7M? 3. 
j&fr. Rp?<?R<v : The question is : 

That clauses 2 and 3 do stand part of the BilL 

The motion was adopted. 
Clauses 2 and 3 were added to the BilL 

Afr. <S/7e#A;<?r : The question is : 

That Clause 3 do stand part of the BilL 

The motion was adopted. 
Clause 5 was added to the BilL 

Mr. <5p4?a&er: The question is: 
That Clauses 6 and 7 do stand part of the BilL 



The Andhi-d Pyadesh, (Abohtion 2nd December, JP53 79 
ojfC^h "Qrdnt^ B^!, 7P33 

The motion was adopted. 
Clauses 6 and 7 were added to the Bill. 

Mr. iSped/̂ /' r The question is : 

That the schedule do stand part of the BiH. 
The motion was adopted. 
The schedule was added to the Bill. 

C/gMje 7. 

Mr. *ype#%<?y .* The question is: 

That Clause 1 do stand part of the Bill. 

The motion was adopted. 

Clause 1 was added to the Bill. 

Mr. Speaker; The question is: 
That the preamble do stand part of the BiM. 
The motion was adopted. 
The preamble was added to the Bill. 

5W ^. %n/K3fa .Rao : I beg to move : 

"That the Andhra Pradesh (Abolition of Cash Grants) 
BiH, 1958 be read a third time and passed. 

Afr. *%e<2A:2r. Motion moved. 

a:$y<go <%3Dyr oB^Sbocr, aiaooB'S'SS gt^aa s r o ^ gr^cn?* ^lj 

^ o ^ ^ o o 50 o<&o dP^Pd^cx) s S ^ ^ D § ^0X3^oa. yg)i3 SRoaj 

7?^ cnr S)^dip^ ôO)?y &*:&i8rag* ̂ ^ ^ o ^ ro^ §^eos^cy^&. 

^ ^ y o ^ *̂ o) s;^?ao C3<5o?^^oa. *̂ ox)? &r^d^ogb a)ooO ^jX-O* 

S}SS?&)0 g'aaoRRb. ^ ^ccog d r ^ d ^ o ^ p ^ ^ o ^ ^ s S o ^ QS)<?ao 

Afr. ̂ pca^r . The question is . 

That the Andhra Pradesh (Abolition of Cash Grants) 
Billy 1958 be read a third time and passed. 

The motion was adopted. 



cn!tM^! L%?i& (Andhm Pr̂ Jê h 
A?nendmcnf) Bdt, W R 

& / ^ %;;AYy?% R^o . I move Sir, that the Hyderabad 
Tenancy and Agricultural Lsnds (Andhra Pradesh Amend
ment) Bit), 1958 be read a Arst time. 

,tfr. S p ^ l w : Motion moved. 

r-^J dr? ^̂ ) l3jRRoo* ̂ 0 ^ uod) ;3^o^ ̂ )0oO cap 39*2ooS* 

Sec!ion 44- reservation of lands subject to certain limits 
which a landholder is entitled to resume for personal culti* 
vation from his protected tenants. 

Section 38- enables a protected tenant to purchase 
subject to certain conditions the interest of the landholder 
in the lands held by the protected tenants. 

as DRor? tLRjp. -%s RoR^oJ* trotS* S^oS^ S ^ J ifO^^ 

r:^, & ^ ^ ̂ of\^ ;j*a) ^ < ^ ip^5 s ^ ^ o ^ z y ^ ^ ^ . irya 

As the above sections now stand, the right of purchase 
by the protected tenant under section 38 can be exercised 
even in respect of the lands which had been reserved for 
personal cultivation but which the landholder ̂  had not 
actually resumed and taken possession of at the time of 
purchase. Thus, the right of resumption for persona! 
cultivation would be substantialty contained in the case of 
certain landholders as a result of the operation of Section 38 
and an anomalus position would result if, in respect of 
the land which the landholder has reserved for personal 
cukivation, the protected tenant should be given a right of 
purchase. !t is necessary to make a provision in the Act 
to the effect that the right ,of purchase under Section 38 
cannot be exercised in respect of iands reserved to the land* 
hoider for personal cultivation under section 44. This 



Th? Hyderabad Tenancy & Agy^ 
c:̂ ĉ rjt Lan^5 (And?tra Pradesh 
Anen&tent ) BiH, 7PJd 

2nd Decem&er, 7P3<S di 

ciause seeks to amend Section 38 (1) suitably with a \iew 
to making such a provision. 

38(1) enables a protected tenant to purchase a land 
at his option. Compuisoriiy transfers ownership of lands 
from the landholder to the protected tenant. 

tL,aaoa. (gaefoBoxSaari) !$&;$ sMib^,5* ib^og^gb tgRra^a 

ar^lstJ ^ ^ ^ g P ^ * B ^ ^ ^ o ^ g o ^ $ ^ ^ o l . ^e 33^ lo^r 

Q^jy^ *3oor?ST" 32o3*63<5̂ ;6y° ^p^eo^ ^^^. 3S.S{— ^ ^ o iger'g'*, 

^ ^ ^ o ^5^ry<j^ sSy^^o ^^?3o^o 39̂ )30(5̂  &?5^&. ^o^5:^gb ô ĵ  

Protected tenants delayed 
as owners under section 38 
Area purchased by them 
Protected tenan's declared 
a; own.rs under Sec. 38 (e) 
and N o of protected ten
ants 

Area t/ansferred 

Average transferred to each 
protected tenant 

Total amount cf compen
sation Axed by Tribunals 
f̂ r areas transferred from 
owners. 

8084. 

69 113 <3g*cn9 1 *3o&x). 

ap2jy:o dejr^ 11 425 

sRasxfb <3*exr5*S*s 1885 

*aa^o i8,4ll. 

^ ^ o ^ c y " ^ 87,669 ̂ ^cr^ 

sSbeofb e r e ^ y ^ 10392 ^}. 

*^ ^o 97900 Ĵ. 

^ p ^ o ^ 7 ^. 27 gbo^eo. 

^ ^ o ^ - 31,33.669 sS. 

& o e o ^ ^ ^ 3,53,429 dS 

pR)<g,o3'* 36 co. 

5^co?Sh^ Co. 33 & ^ a . 

Clause 18 (1) of the Andhra Pradesh Ceiling on Agri
cultural Holdings BiH, 1958 says : 

"Notwithstanding anything contained in subjection 
(7) of section 38, and sub-section (1) of section 38-E of the 
Hyderabad Tenancy and Agricultural Lands Act, 1950 



#2 2nd December, 7P3R The Hyderabad Tenancy & Agri
cultural Lan& (Andhra Pradesh 

Amendment) B:H, W 8 

the ownership of all iands heid by a protected tenant 
immediately before the notiBed date, except such portion 
thereof as has been reserved to the landholder for resump
tion for personal cultivation under section 44 of that Act, 
shall stand transferred to and vest in the protected tenant 
from that date " 

^Sbon*^ §T^lcS" "a^oiT^ (§o^ &rŜ  arao ̂ 05y^<r^ cor- ̂ <^c^^o 

^ § ^ o a . of course subject to payment of compensation 

Rxed. 

47, 45, 48, 50 l^&eo l!S5* ̂ 5 ero&gS ̂ oe)o$ou)RS). ^a 

^6r? gaigdgxRo ̂ ^. ^a^^go Sj^^ *^c<^ Rrao c^!$^<53§ Le^<^ 

^sr^era sse^^^Q^ ̂ e&^^o^^^o. Qo^^d^ cssa^ transaction 

3&)dS *^^e^ ^^) ̂ e ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ o ^ ? & . 5^d^RJ gRo4§§ ̂ o^^o 

a^^D^^ r̂Ĵ  fo^&oa &njSSso ̂ a^^yd). 6S)^ ^6au) s^o^^6^ 

^oA^6^3^^. ^^S) Ibef Ŝ)ô S 6̂ J* ̂ d^re^ 5Ddd&o a,Ef43aX̂ a. 

*^oF ^^^§ ^o^c^o^ ^ ^ ^ ^ R ggy& ^d^er, ^^ ̂ eo77E^ 

6̂ daSR5" ̂ gR6§§ ̂ ^^OjR (̂Sosr̂  sS^iraotyer ŝ â Ŝ$o& D̂ cxD̂ ) 

s?^o<^oa. 5)3̂ 0̂  yyd^Soo^^r^ §b& ^&§^^-^ D^oDou) 3^oS) 

Mr. <Sp<?%%er: The Regional Committee Order says : 

"Every BiH affecting the Telangana region which is not 
a Money Bill and contains mainly provisions dealing with 



The Hyderabad Tenancy & Agri- 2nd December, 7P3d, S3 
CMttt̂ mt Lands (Andhra Pradesh 
Amendment) BU!, < W & 

any of the scheduled matters shaH, upon introduction in 
the Assemb!y, be referred to the Regional Committee for 
conMderat on and report to the AssemMy". 

" .... shaH upon introduction in the Assembly, be 
referred to the regional committee for consideration and 
report to the Assembly". 

laaRa <9*ao&J*;S°i33T'aoa3*R)g&$ &g<sM5*ga3&$3 3oaoa"§ 

^3^-^^oC 6&^d3 5Lu^^ 3Cb3-g ^ * ^ o & ^ ^ ^ e o r r 56g^^(fo 

I think that is the proper procedure and I have no 
objection to foHow that procedure. 

o 

tpgx rd) yog, s}^y^ § ^ ^ RRgSrcu ^sxupsia. 

r§; 1. *^o^^CP^ : 3ta<sa?S(5* ̂ Sbd^o^ ̂ 6f\o*n*^ ^of^^il 



#4 2nd Decem&ey? 7PJ^ The Hyderabad Tenancy & Agn-
CMtt^m! Lands (Andhra Pradesh. 

Amendment) BiH, /P38 

gD&T ^^$6" : ^a ^R^^^o, §sg3bR<!!r ̂ ^d^o^) 6^&5j^-^R 

^^jd§ 6̂ J* ^a ^^^.(5&o^ 5&^& û)jr6 a^srsf aur^ Ibof g*^^3 

B o3o^* 3°a63 

^ ^ *3o^^CP^) : B o^o^* olSixra ̂ ^ ^ ^)^a? 5^cs&^6* 

^o*& 83^d5* & ? S ^ ^ , ̂ ^*^)^f g*gbi§5 sSoaoRRo. 6s3d^^y ^gD^^oO 

3^A0R ĝ iĵ cgo grey- e?^y^o QOj^S'd^^srRx). 

^fr. ̂ ? M ^ r : The question is: 

"That the Biti be referred to the Andhra Pradesh 
Regional Committee for consideration and report to the 
Assembly" 

The motion was unanimously adopted. 

^ &. RjoRRtS&g (R^sS^o) : 39<$g3E, 3eorrar §t3d&RJg'ao4§ 

6<$^cr, ̂ cr ? 

5SoSS& ̂ ^ooa. cyX)&o^ ^o^a §<5o^, " B o ^ §<5o^ e b ^ s^ 

^j &. &30(Sddi)g: ôa)*§ ̂ dsr^^ ^ ^ o ^ c r d ^ o ^^^*§ 



The Hyde?-d&d<i Tenancy & Agn<. 2nd Deceiver, 793^ M 
n̂!c!4mt Lan& (Andhra Piadesh, 
Amend?nent) BiM, 7P3^. 

^ a *^^oo *5oo7rB^"§ ;3caoao3a5 ^ $ S ^ ̂ ^* *^eorr2?*&o ̂ o * 

^^^§§ ^oS:ol§ Sr>So%- ^ ^ a . ^ S3-"^, c^S^^^o 3*c;dao5*(3)* 

^^^od)8o S^gooa crD3 ^^^r^^o r^S ̂ j(lre3^ Bo3o^* ^ 5 o ^ . 

^d^y^ ^rs^co s^g^^do 3903* egd^^^oa* 

BUSrNESS OF THE HOUSE 

&3IS5* ^ ^ 5 * : Q^^53b^^5"3c^ extension biHs.^^033^ 

^5^ a^gRo a ^ a ^^3 &?3§ ^oa3oaoag a.3* *^o^d§ eL-r^^o^ 

(3) 5). Hk30^dcXi)§: ^<$gg:. ^ o t S ^ f <3-*o5 e^ogb goao 

^ o ^ g c ^ ^ ^ ^ 1§^ &o3^rr8g* ^ r ^ ^ s y ^ . ^T^d^goo o^p^gy^^ 

5lr 5 ^ 0 ^ *Ri33*g), ^ o ^ ^ ^ ̂ o§^^6^eySb zroa^* *^d^^o gboRa. 

&3j5aon*s3D $3^ 3*0330* *̂ oi33a-X)3 ^oA^ao^rCb. s*ag3, ̂ ^X) aog^g' 

5^ey^ yo3acrjk&go ̂ oaa. ^5^ Businss Advisory Committee 
^^Sr^^o 393&3o3^a. re3^ e^^^3 ̂ ^ ^ o t ^ f a ̂ ^ 0 3 3 0 ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ . 

QSS-ŷ 3 <yy ̂ &$3.d&6" !c§ ?^6oa *̂ i36* s3zy^. 4 ̂  *§& ̂*̂ " 

5̂)53.d̂ <5* ̂  TV D%us3iys&&^3*j},gca. 

^ &). ^o^dc&g : 3*3^5*3-6 ^(T^S) 5)^b^ ^og^ ^DdRE). 

^ "§. *3og*^cr^ : tsggg, &30I) *^^co, ^ ^ C o ^ 03^ 39*3os§ 

^00^33 T§^&. y D §^(^ 3^93 ̂ ^3^03&. ^Sb 4 6^8PC0 ^€T<^ ̂ W*63 

y o g ^CogFY s30/\^ ̂ d)5?^ T§& Council ̂  B^cr^S ^y^oo33*& 

t93a-<%Sj*n* r*o^^^) m ^ ^ ^ o a . <̂ Ŝ$ ?5^^ 3*3S XSos3o$oa^ â ^ 



<M 2nd* Decern^ 7PJ($ T^e Hyderabad* Tenancy & AgT^ 

CMttMyat Lands (Andhra Pra&^^ 

AmenJwent) Bttt, FP3<S 

Ao^eXm^o^. 3̂ ĥs? yoo &5oDa aysDea 3&\ o^x-^^S cr^^^j. 

^ ^ ^ ^ o * & Qga-R X)3 suff f ̂ ^)&^a. S*a<s3 ̂ 33 ^ ^ 36^0o^ 

D^oMu^^o^^^r? S^a&s'jjR) 6^ ^& <=$^^y^ â ^̂ or̂  3 1 

:?rbo6s)od^^o^^3 e)^&3§ st^A-^ ?y 33 3303333*033, ^ ^^^ 

*3l̂ r T3. Q^x-R 6X) "g^^^SS^o^&A^ro^ 3^6^aa^^3b^03. 

zy33^3oO tsR̂ o-R*, <^c^ l&S"2oo45* 3^^c^^)o^oa. 4^ "§^^3oC 

^) *B. "So^^O^^ : o3g$a-& **S)<sx) ^loc&^ ^ 5 3a uoRa 

6^cy^ e<o33̂ a. ^o<&7^ J*4§?G3 Q ^ ^ ^ , 5Sr M 3 ^ ^ ̂ ux)od3'* 

t30&B3*̂ &) 3 ^ &,̂  X)̂ gO0 ̂ OX)Oif 6?5 ̂ 5 " *3 ̂ * 3^Co. S3o3,3-

^o^^move 3oooo^o-3§ ^^637^53 3^^*^3§ 33§g*:,o&oaao 

gb^6* ^ ) ^ ^ * ^ ^ ^ ^ non-ofRcial business ^ ^ o ^ 

^ r h 3 ^ ^ ^ ^ . Estates Land Act^ ?$u^o^o^^ amendmg Bdl 

& 5^o<&7^ ̂ exoC^*^^ araa *^o^3 Council ̂  ^o^&y-33 Lcao 

(̂ )&, ^oR^d&g: yaagyn* Se!ect Committee 5 ̂ o ^ 

^ *B. ̂ oS^CP^ : g^. Qg^-R pass ^cM^srjw. 

(̂) &. &,o<S<y<3ag : ^ ^ ^^9*033 ? 

^ ^ o ^ aaggacrag a^%oRa33a. §̂ d) &)§3^ ^^ re-notify 
3d^^c^^^Q^. v o ^ ^ y^3 ê(y/v pass 3d&aR)j. 

<&? P, y^&r^fjA: Madras Estites Land (Reduction 
of Rent) Andhra Pradesh Amendment Bi^the Andhra 



The Hy&ydbd(i Tenancy & Agn- 2nd December, JP3& ^7 
CMttttmt Lands (AnJh/ra Pradesh 
Amendment) B^t, 7P.53. 

Pradesh Bhoodan and Gramdanl9J8Bill^the Hyderabad 
Prevention of Frangmentation and Consolidation of Land 
Holdings Bill, S^s a ^ copies ^ ^ ) ^ ^ ^^. 

(̂  &. & o ^ d & g : Select Committee 3 goaoRgo&g ^g 
e ^ Rso<a &^§^o&. 53^0^ Madras Estates Land (Rent Red
uction) Bill <3oxa*sK)3ga3-g Madras Estates (Aboli
tion and Co version into Ryotvari) Bill a> Mas$%aiS Bhoodan 
Bi!!, Hyderabad Prevention of Fragmentation and Consoli
dation of Land Holdings Bill a> aaorocrsSa. 

&)o^f ^^g*; The Bill is being extended to the new 

territory 393 aR^asgoR a-aaadaoS* <9 aooo& §^_^ Reason* 

tbairRass- ̂  c=$ig a^d^^ a^Ra ̂ e^eo^^c^ <^^a. ^a^^y* 

(̂  a. x^oatfesag: ^ ^ a ^ ^ ^<r^e^ a#<33*a^ ^<3&o 

^d^^o ^ooui^a ?y ep$)&*<)35o. e o ^ ^ o e ^ 83^5?^* S$Ko e3K?s?dio^; 

o o ^ ^ c ^ ^?*ego<5^ S^r3o^ *Bo^^o^o) ̂ ^rcgo &3^ *5^o7rsr 

^ceraS 5$8 olS R&r*o33 ̂ dSô X) t?o^ ^oa-aS 5$̂ 5ol3 RayeR) 

^oor^Brgb ^^^_8o^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^a ^_^aeo<5*3'<Bo. ^s ̂ r^X3^ 

*3o<&) ̂ ^o^oSo goaoRoaaa y ^ S)63a ̂ (K^TV o ^ a o ^ shgo^ 

AonrO. ^O(3o^^ &3Bb ^a^^Sb ga^R ruling ^ ^ a r r ^ o ^ R ^ y 

^o^ircsogT-a' n-aa ̂ *$gg*o7?- ̂ A^o^ R̂ xŝ o ^^. l. 2 clauses 

RsSbogcraS ^)0)a^cpa§ ts^r^a^, ^aeoc^ go^^orr ^&^o^ 

cra§ gt r^^R^gb s5^ir^o ^SSocr l3d&^o s&oRR T^S. < 3 o ^ ^ ^d) 

t3^o^^o M^Ssoa- &o*& sr^o&ooa. ^-35^ &!6^o^ s&*tp*R g ^ 

clause 3o R^^eaeo TSgB*dl§ ^ ^ Hxb)^^oo- ^R^o3al§ e^^TV S M 

y^g^sSra^ ^-^ ^g^go-aS e^ysf^o^^a. tsoanSg s^o^r?^ 



#8 2ndDecem&er, 7PJ# The Hyderabad Tenancy & Agri-
ctt̂ ttra! Lands (Andhra Pradesh 

Amendment) BtM, JP3^. 

($; ̂§. *3o3atr3): *3D^^^ e^^^R 'predicament' #* 

Ro-R3. ̂ y g ̂ R) Bill & withdraw 3d&&. ̂ a &,g* Centra! Act 
& RoaoaoRR Seu. B*3 J*3 i) 5̂ eyl <y RRda ^aBRR^*a ̂  eo<^8& 

^o^j^^os?9 ^R^Ro^a ir*on*a. o a^o^ ^^^^ ^o^a a3)& 

"We have no power. W e have no jurisdiction on what 
Parliament has got to do. W e can do only subject to their 
prior consent. Their prior consent is limited to amendment 
of certain clauses but not to the whole Bil^'MoiR^a. 

3s difficulties a a ^ o n . ^o&ao -& "^Afaoota" 33) 

2r#3#apa R&*oa. 3 ^ ^ Land Acquisition Act & RoaoaoaR 

^ g R ^ ^ R S ^ ^ r a R ^ R D . <ye^o^^*&^^!&. 2*aR#h t)Co 

^da eo"& Ro^gR &<n<333o Raai^^oa. ^ ^ : ? 5^S)g^ J^Ro 

6o*&, ̂ 6*7TCb D-aâ r-zr RR8oc?ool) R^a %?b3) Tj^crag ^R<& 

a^R^a. I a m m t interested at all nor the Government is 

interested* 

^ a. aoadd&g: Select Committee 3 RoaR gRyg, 

e^^gf crgrgoXo R ^ d o Central Act ̂ amendments sra^R^Ro^ 

^a^ ^^Sj-^RX) &o(an*a 3R\R^. ^^(f^^gy-a- o RR^es^ 

"aanyag b^R^Rr^. Land Acquisition Act & RoaoaoaRog 

Rc^^ Setect Committee 3 RoRn*a§ ^o!a7?&§ &s^o^^o ^ 

<3^B*t ^ ( ^ ^ ? S)ĵ f 77& ruling a3jaRj& Qo^^6*7r9 e^ 

Md^oR^^p^ arRo^ya ^^ ? aaR^R QR9R3<$g agcR^o y ^ ^ c ? 

(§j ̂  * 5 o ^ ^ : Parlament Speaker n*a. Central 

Act RD RoRo RR^E9 ̂ d^Ro^ ^o* e^a^d^o e^Coa^a. 

(^a, ^o^(fd^g: President ^^^- previous permis

sion 3a3 &Ro Central Act ss RR^es^ ̂ ^ ^^^rd<&. -̂  ̂ $DR& 

5aRj& Select Committee 3 Roa^R^ Qo^Rygo eR^&a & & r a 



The Hyderabad Tenancy & Agr^ 2nd December, VP3# $P 
<TM!t̂ -ra! Lands (Andhra Pradesh-
Amendment) BiH, 7P53 

sr^h:^ r * ^ ^^^saco ^d^PoD ^ogr3e! ̂ ^rco ^oA^5ou)^sSj<^ ^SS 

^s^e^o 233̂ 3*6= "*̂ r Select Committee ^3 agror? ̂ & ^ ^ 

^dk^oa rr̂ g* ̂ d) ne^saacnya" $=9̂) ^^d^O. *sr& Q5oA^5o^ 

R3"§ ^ ^ ^ ^ ? ^^gb ^$y^^o BtRfnag* 3"^ ^oA^6o^^*§ 5Sr^ 

^ 5 ^ . a,S* t^dj^^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ § ^ 8osS ̂ X D ^ ^ & , y ^ ^ K ) ^ ^ 

^^^E3 lSaa*D§ gy-cr ^^^- o3oocr ^o^&so gasa ?=^. Select 

Committee 3 Roag ^cb^^ ^3ss&o r*^ ^^rece^ ^ o a * 

Select Committee ^ ^b^s^cy e)cA^8o^ atgonsaa ^bo^T?^ 

^&^o^§^^do^o^go? Select Committee ^oA^eo^a, &3oa*^ 

*3^§^^r-^di)? ^ o ^ ^ ^ B ^ S ) ^ 3oooaoC3 ^430 ̂ ^ State ̂ 0 csSea 

^ ^ ^ ( ^ 3 ^ "^^e35*& ^cd^go adopt 3d&^<g(R ? "^0!^ s S ^ 

^&l3^ t^d^o^ *3eor?^ 3-*̂ ou°3§ ^ 9osi tj?3j^^i3 "BooiY^* 

^ "3. ̂ 0 ^ 0 ^ ^ ) : 3 3 ^ s^rs^^r? ^^ routine ;*ra 

(§; 5). ̂ o^dd&g* 'Rout'ne' ̂ 033*̂  y^^.sxp&*§Vo ^^go^b 

sicn^^^sip? Qocy^Ca^h Grants Bill ib3*^^division*3a^<R. 

University BiH^s ̂ $D^^^o^d)Sa)o^S3^^^&^:&!^ *2o^ ̂ aei^* 

^d^o!b^^\ca. Cash BlHs erodJT^H^d^o^ " & ! ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ . ^^n 

two Bills pass 3s-*:xa; ̂ sl^ two Bills pass :3d& J ^ a * ^ . $^^g 

*Sô  BiHs ̂ , <9c(3)̂ ;$r ^o^*3o?s clauses ̂  ^00??^^ s$ 5c^ 

^^o ^o^a. 53& normal procedure r? ao^a. §^q^ debar 

ĉxD*#, sy$3a ?68oa;$ constitutional powers ^^ ^^^^^s 

aon*D. ^K)d s;5^^^ ^&6C^^ ruiing ^ Q ^ ^ o ^ o ^ ) ^ ?y 



% 2nd December, ̂ PJ<S The Hyderabad Tenancy & Agy;-
CMitMrat Land (Andhra Pradesh 

Amendment) Bd!, 7PJ$ 

Mr. iSp̂ a/rc/': In this matter I have refer:ed to May's 
Parliamentary Practice. I have a!so consumed other 
Provinces and I received a note from the Mysore State 
Legislature that the whole Act shoutd be considered as a 
fresh BiH As you know, Mysore State also has transferred 
territories newly added to it, and therefore they are also 
similarly situated. The opinion of the Mysore State Legis
lature is that the whole Act should be considered as a fresh 
BiH, if the BiH says that the Bi<! is bemg extended with or 
without amendments, and some times repeal and* extension 
also; three things may happen; sometimes there will be no 
repeal of the existing law of these transferred territories; 
sometimes the Government may not propose any amend
ments in any particular sections; and sometimes there may 
be amendments So, in ail these cases the op nion of the 
Mysore State Legislature is that it should be treated, in 
justice and equity, as a fresh Bill, that means something 
like the whole Act being before the House. 

I may take you into confidence and toil you that I have 
consulted the Advocate General H e agreed with m e and 
I have consulted two Ministers from Bombay and Mysore 
and they also agreed with m y view that it must be, injustice 
and fair-play, treated as a new BiH, as a fresh BiH, and 
therefore those who represent the tiansferred territories 
should have a right to go into the whole Act ̂  /?#w and 
any ameidmcnts that are necessary to improve it must be 
aHowed. 

Again, there is one precedent m the May's Parliamen
tary Practice. The London Education Bill was sought to 
be extended to London, and such amendments which did 
not relate to extension were disallowed, but any amend
ments in those provisions which applied to London could be 
allowed. That means, in certain cases if the Government 
reserve certain clauses to be applied in Andhra and extend 
the other clauses to Telangana, in that case those clauses 
that are being extended to Telangana alone can be amended, 
can be considered, becasuse the Government are reserving 
some provisions to be applied to Andhra. If the Govern
ment ar^ extending the whole BiH to a new territory, m y 
opinion is that the whole Act shou!d be taken as part of 
the new Bill and the Members should have the right to 
propose amendments for improving the BilL There is no 
question about that. 



The Hyderabad Tenancy & Agn* 2nd Decem&ef) ̂ 9J^ P/ 
cti!cMmt Lands (AnAva Pradesh 
Amendment) BiH, V9J& 

Of course, I have seen the objection raised by the 
Revenue Department, and their objection was somewhat 
more relevant than that of the Law Depatment; I 6nd 
nothing useful in the memorandum supplied to m e by the 
L a w Department except some general observations. The 
Revenue Department says, that so far as Andhra is con
cerned, we are net amending the Act, but in the case of 
Telangana we are passing this Act newly and enforcing 
this Act over them. The question is this: <?hah we say. 
"because Andhra Act is not amended no amendments 
should be allowed, or because it is applied to Telangana. 
amendments should be allowed and the amendments will 
apply to Andhra also/' Equity and justice require that 
the whole Act should be taken into consideration clause 
after clause. 

&i jKl %7?Zr%/% 7?<2p: Even in the case of Central Act? 

Afr. $9<ra%<?r: No. With regared to the Central Acts 
you have to take permission of the Central Government. 
And if ycu feel that you cannot amend the Act without the 
previous permission of the Central Government th^t is a 
Afferent matter, and you can except those Acts. M y 
ruling applies generally to atl Acts wh'ch you propose to 
amend, excepting those which you cannot of your own 
accord amend wnhout the permission of the Centre. With 
regard :o them, you consider, keeping this principle in 
view, whether y^uhave a right or leave it off. That is 
left to you. N o w 1 give this ruling with regard to the 
usual State Acts, Acts within the jurisdiction of the State 
Assembly, when they are extended to Telangana, to an 
important region In certain acts, the Government takes 
the power to extend, and because that power is in the Act 
itself, that will be extended to district after district. But, 
that is not so in the present case- One big territory is 
added to the State and there is no provision m the existing 
Act; the Government is extending the whole Act to a new 
territory; when the Government has taken up the responsi
b l y for administration of this new territory, they have to 
take all these responsibilities. It may take a little time, 
but we cannot help. W h e n we have taken under the juris
diction of the Andhra Pradesh State Legislative Assembly, 
a big territory inhabited by more than one croTe peop!e, in 
the interests of Telangana, in justice and fairness to them. 



9J 2nJ Dec^m^er, 79J<$ The H^derahxd Tenancy & Agrt 

ĉ itMru! Lands (Andhm ffddesh. 
Amendment) Bdt, 79J?R 

the whole Act has to he reconsidered Of course, there 
may not be many amendments and there need not be if it 
is r good act. Therefore, I give this ruling which applies 
to aH amending Bills; excepting the Central Acts which the 
Government cannot amend without the permission of the 
Centre. So, 1 a m confirming my previous decision. 

(j^g). XaaoXcr$r One submission Sir! -as Acts 

Ka l^orr^Sa ^ eoal3^&Xryaa, ̂  sections 3o eFONeet^odolaaoaD^ 

H u e ^ . Boo7Y^^b ^csoo&o-D^o^^^^ c?a ET^ ^aoyaeS Act 
— ^ to ej 

Afr. *S/7f^ r; I think, in equity the whole Act should 
be {laced before you because when wc have taken the 
responsibility we have to spend some time. All that is 
necessary is to do justice to Telen^ana. 

(§j 5). x a L o ^ c ^ : ^o^^^^(o^^ro<^rr" Central Acts 

5^^o 5y^?5"^^^a aa^g^oa l)0^b ^&L^ . . 

Afr. 6^^/r^r: I cannot give a lulmg about it. 

eo ^ —° 

(̂j "3. *3og*a)ty*;$) : 8j^ Act ^ ^ ?5^^eaeo &^§^S) ( r y ^ 

^doDoig sr*^ ^ ^ ^ M ^oa. sSr^^ conAdence 3s*&*% ^ 

^r^o tSr^g^^e. But, we are not going to surrender that 

right to any one. 
Afr, ̂ fa^e/*: M y ruling does not cover it. Therefore, 

let us not discuss about it. 





and rhe MdJrd^ R^ven^e Recovery 
(And^fd Pradesh Exteas?on ̂ nd 
Amendmgnt) B:H, JPJ& 

Afr. *Sp^A:^ : This is a special order with regard to 
these Acts. Members can take any Act of Teiangana or of 
Andhra. If you want to read, you can take and read and 
! give my permission. 

G O V E R N M E N T BILL 

77?e Afa&#F R^/ and R<?veMMe *$%/&? %/?%? ?A<? AfaJ/w 
.R^vpMMe R^co^ry (^4^Ara Pra^A Exf?MtM<?H a^J ^ ^ ^ J -
w^f) Rf//, 79.53. 

*SW ̂ . ^ ^ a f a Rao: M r Speak r, Sir, I beg to move: 

" That the Madras Rent and Revenue Sales and the 
Madras Revenue Recovery (Andhra Pradesh Extension 
and Amendmend) BH1, 1958, be read a Rrst time/' 

Mr. tSppc&fr: amendment moved. 

Madras Rent and Revenue Sales, 120 go^gyroKraa Madras 

Revenue Recovery Act 1364 a* a a. Hyderabad Government 

Demands Act 1380 gab a*i3a. sygj* *ag.S* 103 ̂ o& 14155d^ 

fundamental law ̂  RoaRo ̂ ^ ayoaocx)^^, Land Revenue a*§ 

^^JL* ^^^orr &!b^ye^a -^ are! ̂ ^ . n*3§^5^ ^ ^oo &*&3oR 

o&oa. n*D^ ^§b^!$6", ^ShX)o-& <s*3 ^cro^) &R^r^otreb. 

y^^BT &s*srfo &̂ ox)oa ̂ ^$* reference &*^y&^. ib̂ <5* 5 ̂  *̂ oo 

;§oa. ^^o$ g^a^S* s^e^^y â r*<sb"3Dô sb <aasy-gtg5* powers 

provide ^ ^ ^ 5 ^ . 

Hr'RtPB?^ Rao3*a "&^^ 131 5^ certain items from 

attachments tsa ̂ oa. ̂ ^&§^6 3r^^&) &^&) 3&*gsg'' ^ . 

^5d&5*^ sS^eo ^d&)&j*35 QogS'a sS^^o3^ &ib§^o^K!-^Co. ^^g* 

&^y &*^a5* ^5"& ^ ^ ^d^no3 ^^5" 9a?*g ^ r & 3 R$bgoSo 

&S3 ^ ^ ^ & . 69̂ n*g gê <y items attach ^^sj*^^ t3asj*g-

provi^ion ̂ * ^c^s^. 15 &*spo ^&a^^ ^ ^ o a craj* ^oa. 

s*a goyd&eo esQ^l) ̂ a 15 5**epcD &od^). g&g property loss 



The Madias Rent and Revenue sales -nd Detent^r, J9J^ Pj 
<zn<% the Madras Re^en^e Recovery 
'(Andhra Pradesh Extenston ay*d 
Amendment) BsM, 7PJ& 

^ ^ ^ o 5 ^^5 *Zo&3̂  <gs$%ar-as provision 3^3oa^ Madras 

A c t <Ŝ  ̂  ^^o-^^y ^^ ^ ^ i 5 ^ ^ ^ Rs^yaaodJB ^?d^&^ ^s^iD&D 

3*633 ^ 3 ^ ̂ B ^ S)^or? ^^^cr^^*&) -3**&5B &*§^^o. ^ ^ ) ^ ^ ^ 0 3 

s§;Ŝ :ryE3§. c?X)^ ccooy^^i sSr^eo §A^gLu*^o^ :§oa. Exem

ptions ̂  r^q^d^ 33\5oa ^ a ,̂ ̂ ^o s^e33§^^r^d^ z&oa. 

^ o ^ cr̂ r̂&R ̂ ^ ^ a ^ ^ b ^ ^ r ^ ^ a ^ ^ ^ ^^^ ŝ oa. 

^&^§^^ (gg'g'. j)̂ 5D &^gbs^^^<^3 ẑ oa. s?o^ §̂ Ro3*s;§;̂  

^ < & ^ ^ ^Sr^^o ^ & ^ > ^ ^ ^ S b & ^ ^ e ^ ^ ^ <p%o S^o5. ^ ^(^07V 

&^^ o*3g ^^rco ŝr̂ oco. Amendments sŜ ĵ ^̂ D ^^^07? 

Afr. 6^€^fr: The question is: 

'That the Madras Rent and Revenue Sales and the 
Madras Revenue Recovery (Andhra Pradesh Extension and 
Amendment). BiH, 1958 be read a first time/ 
adopted. 

The motion was adopted. 

5W j& %?iA;af<3 Rac: I beg to move: 

"That the Madras Rent and Revenue Sales and the 
Madras Revenue Recovery (Andhra Pradesh Extension and 
Amendment) Biii, 1958 be read a second time " 

My. iSpaa&eT*: Amendment moved. 

( PgMF<? ) 

Mr. *Spp#&<?r: The question is: 

"That the Madras Rent and Revenue Sales and the 
Madras Revenue Recovery (Andhra Pradesh Extension and 
Amendment) BiH, 1958 be read a second time." 

5W %w/%/<3 Cqp%/a&rjFA/H%%: I beg to move : 

Tor the word "Tahsiidar" substitute the words "an\ 
ofBcer not below the rank of a Revenue Divisional OfRce/ 
wherever it occurs. 



:M <2rM? D<2o?yn&er̂  7^^y TAe Madras Rent and Rct'ent̂ e Safe^ 
and the Madias Revenue Recovery 
(^ndhra Pradesh. Extermon an^ 

Amendment) B*H, /P3<$-

Afr. 6!p^^A^: Amendment moved. 

^ "3. *ao^^(T^ : Clause 4 (!) § (̂  ^Do^o K*3*o 

^^d&gr^co, ^*B. ̂ ^yi5^^^'35 7va^^ ^ d c o ^ Substitute 

Tahsildarfor any Officer not below the "rank of a Revenue 

Divisional Officer" ̂ oa.gas*^ 14(a) Sub section (a) & delete 

the words "as in accordance with religious usage" a$x e,g 

amendment oxnyja. ^^sy^ Add the Hiowing at the end of 

section (a) of Section 14 (a) proposed "and ornament of 

the children below 12 years of age" 

g^g* ^$s& : "That the Bill may be read a second 

time'' 3sa s33<npf?a propose ̂ a . g*asr^ "That the Bih may 

be refered to a Select Committee" <s!3a cago a e ^ a . 

(̂  *3. "So^<bcp^: Select Committees ^oiSa first 

reading ̂  (rsyMc?. 

Mr. 6)?^A;^r: After a bill has been read for the first 
time the member in change may make one of the fblowing 
motions that JLt be read in a second time either at once or 
on some future day, "At once''^s-^a. W e have accepted it. 
asyyR) " That the bill be read a second time" oarra " That 
the bill be referred to a Select Committee'' <sarra « That 
the bill be circulated " ssarra asSdea move ^gagaS), &oa^ 
7^^ "That the bill be read a second lime" ^a move 
3?*a. asSyga 3ban*aa Select Committee 3 ^o&o^&a^&^^^j* 

& f jKf. P^^k^f^ R^o : "Not below the rank of a Reve
nue Divisional OfBcer" <si§ ggRea ̂ o^ gy*6y*%a35). 

^ ^ 6 " ^^3T: Select Committee 3 3^9i3 motion ^ . 

^ sra^o ^ ^ o ^ ^ c & § : K? amendment 5ra^aa<y6b. 

gir*&<y*a ^ c?as a^o^ ^^u-^ gag* â rĝ s ̂ B ^ a ^ ^oo*§ 

y ^ acygorr y^gg^o ^d&cras harassment ^^cras tsgyifo 



T?te Madras Rent and Revenue Sa!es 2nd December, 79J^ 97 
<md t̂ e Madms Revent̂ e Recovery 
(Andhra Pradesh Extension and 
Amendment) BiH, 7PJ($. 

3os*35. 

(̂  sra^o ^ ^ o ^ ^ d & g : ̂ 3o ̂ $)^o sS3 ̂ o ^ consis

tent 71* ^ & . Elections ̂ ^^ cMa-tRa^ ^^^^(^re3 §^6^<^ 

1§& '^^^erCo' <s3 c3b^^&?y^ &ib ^*§dipeg^M ^(^r^r? ^ & . 

&^g^3 ^^^cS5o*& crcr &^(3r^do7V S§o&ao<33 ^ $ ^ d & ^ ^ 

^ o ^ ^ . §r*o^ g<g§Soa- 1§^^D, ^^&cr-Cbo"& &^^r^5*cr? 5̂ o 

daoRb ^ o ^ r r ^ o ^ press ^d&^o. ŝ a <g&gfS$o ê od̂ gS D^^^TT 

^oa. ??§o^ (̂  ̂ F- ̂ o^^cp^rra ho^ ar^^o ̂ oa-a-a &o!^^do 

^d^^d^. ^o^^o*& s*^ 3r*c%s3orr 5^$3 ^sS\db-3^"§ 130^^3 ar? 

^o ^oa. ^sr^tra'a ^ ^ o ^ o aa^rg o x ) ^ ^ ^ ^o^ayarv ^o 

^^) ̂ gp^g) ?y ̂ ^. asaigg&s&a 03?Srg ooo^^^^go ej^^ o33^d^. 

<3S'2y-(S'* t & s S ^ go^c-^o^ ^r^^o ^S^&$7-d) *3%2#o e3(3o?^^^a, 

^ modus operandi apply s*&oa* ̂ o^cra§ First Class Magis
trate oas*aso3^ &^g^S ̂ B^db *a9*3 r ^ acŷ orr' ̂ ^0^07? ^ 
judicial mind & asS^rRgda ^a^^o-^ a?-^go&* -̂ g^^sa 

(#) a. yoS'tfd&g: ^^gs:. ^s Act <s* ̂ <^&) "Collector" 

^^ *a&r*a. Section 7 ̂  ^ Any oScer or group of ofRcers'' 

isa amend 3?*a. 'Any oSBcers' <so-& village oS&cers ^ ^ 

Afr, i!f. F ^ ^ ^ R^o: H e is not an oSicer. 

<xoO\ annexure &* o^s^^So^^e *3oo^^^X)5 53^y^o^^ &*oa)oa. 

Collector ̂ o*& ̂ d$)^ ea^gs^^a^^, gsj*$xy*a3g ^o^^d^. y a 

cfS^^cr-^a ^o01§ 7?^;&*e3'* auction ^&dgrS)3 6D?Srg ooo^^^& 

gr*g<)̂ o ^^^. ê odSô o &^^5 ^ 9 ^ 3 *aa%o ^sSg^o. yê Ŝ 

g^g&g^o 3-& e ^ O o C d^rg^ B̂g'taiS) TS63-o^ g^^ea ^oA^5osrc?a 



9<S 2nd Decem&er, 793^ The Madras Rent and Revenue Sa[e& 
and the Madras Ret/en̂ e Recovery 
(Andhra Pradesh Exten^ton and 

Amendment) BtM, 7P5d. 

SbSg" ^ ^ 6 * : ̂ o R ^ ^^o^^d^gr?&, Section 2 § 

"Power of TahsHder" § K)̂ 5D "Deputy CoHector" ^ 

a aa*^ press ̂ d&^o, *dd&g*ĝ d̂o ^^co^^s^. 

(̂  *B. *So^&)cr^): Clause 7 3 R^ts"^. 

(̂  {3, da^oc'Sa : Clause Y 3 amendments oM^xxa. 

^oS5" ^s'f: n ^ o ^ d a ^ a amendment ^^^ 

<j 

cojp power sg^a. ^o^y^ocr 4 dr^<^o3 s$&^ seô ĝr̂ 'g 

JL^g$3 ̂ Bg'^S^aa distraint ̂ a M ^ C B ) t y ^ ^ ^ o ^ ^ b T r *^o&oo5. 

Q5 <?^o a*r3r*<3ho3*3 ̂ oooCoOti ^^aSos^D ^ ^ ^cy. "an* ox*^v<^ 

ê power ̂  Revenue Divisional ofRcers ̂  ^a& 3da<gs&o'*a 

**6di<^to^^^)oa. ̂ o^^gbo^ ox>s$;y;a Judiciary a separate^RR 

ê̂ sr̂  ê Revenue divisional ofRcers gs Vast areas oco^ 
(^y^ax. ^ ^ 7^j^&)^ Q^o^ Land Reveune distraint s& 

^^§<S ̂ og"i§ *3̂ <gs&̂ a ̂  ^<^ea^ gp^g^Lo^^ rf^ a*8 s$&^og 

Mr. 5^^A;(?r; The question is: 

'Tor the word 'Tahsildar' substitute the word any 
'oEacer not below the rank of a Revenue Divisional OfRcer'* 
wherever it occurs. 

The amendment was negatived. 

5W M . M?gf Re^dfy (Af̂ cÂ rJd!): Sir, I beg to move : 

"Delete Sub-clause (ii) of clause 4/' 
Mr. t%?%%;er: Amendment moved. 



The M a & a s Rent dnJ RevettMe Sd!e^ 2nJ December? 7P3*d PP 
and the Mndr^y Revenue Recovery 
(AiM^M-d pT^de^h. Extension ̂ nd 
Amendment) B:H, 79J^. 

$) d&5:. ?y^iBa : " Provided also that Tahasildars ^ (D 

shail not be entitled to any fee or compensation for 
selling " eta opRa^a aaa^ ̂ ^ a . aRyga 5aa omit ^^^ 
oa sao^rrao ^ ^ ^ 3 5 . Qo^^d^b ^ ^ ^ < 3 b eŝ ) co &̂<3o<33So fee& 

^ a commission <ra ̂ ^^g^sio $3^r^^^. s;^^ ^s section^ 

omit 3 d ^ ^ ^ ^e ^ ^ ^ ^ fees rra commission ^a ^^§^^ 

r§\ *B. ̂ oS'^CP^) : ^5J^§cd)^o^o^^da commission rr3 

fees 773 o33Ŝ (̂3o. ^^ S$30&gr'# oD^e^efd). tsoaa^ os^o^^ S ^ o ^ 

Commissioners a <Ksi3)3*a. ̂ ^ ^ Commissioners & &&!?*&.. 
irag 030̂  ̂ bod^ ̂ a i j y fees ̂ 3^ o^&i§ ^&*tg^<^, 

t§ ^. ^o^ocr*B& : ^a^^So "g'a-^tygb" ^ a ^o"§3 a ^ ^ ^ 
L a o *j 

^ ^ ^ ^ n crS)g &)(&CD?Y- or class of officers <93 ?6̂ ŝ& ^ ^ ^ 

&o3oa. &a§ y^c35^ ^ ^ ^ r * ^ ^d)ti)sr^. 

& 7 ^. ^/?A^^ R̂ ?(? : Here it is not contemplated that 
any one below the rank of the Tahasildar is vested with this 
power. <5a<ĝ a reference <3o<Rs*3%:a3rr ^dagea g^gdott &,^ 
5a^r^ Jl̂ eo*2oo*§3 y^ocr ocao^ Erer aipao*3ooaDo;r3o ej^e^-

^ ^ a . a^cra^s^r? ygSoo^ i) department tŜ aas&eo ̂ depart
mental ofHcers ̂ a ^ R - &c-^cf^g5Co-operativeJnspectors^ 
Excise Inspectors "Soo^e^^d) cop g a ^ y ^ R . Q& recovery 5 
3oaoao3RaRda$$3. As far as the Revenue department is 
concerned an officer not below the rank of Tahsildar is 
authorised to make any kind of distraint under this Act* 
even under litigation. 

i§ aossasS *3oS"&2^a f3o3iT3a): " N o one below 

ihe rank of a Tahsildar esa s&o^rrta ^8 w^ss^s? *^&^&)oo 

s^syd). " Any ofRcer or class of ofBcers " ^a ^ol> " A n y 

oBScer of Revenue Department" ^aar ^^ " <s*sh§era ̂  

^aar a^eo^ g^^^r? gg^ea^oa. Q^y& ^ero^ revenue 



700 2nd Decembgy, 7P33 TRe Madras Rent and Revenue S a ^ 

and the Madras Revenue Recovery 
(Andhra Pradesh Extenston and 
Amendment) BtH, 7PJ^. 

arrears ^so^^cxD ^sgr^^a. <ge clause ô r ^g^n-

^ ^ ^ ^ o arrears ^&^s^7r ^ ^ . s^od aagrg ^ ^ ^ ^ 1 3 ^ 

^ ^ ^ M ^o*t (gas'g'aDoa. ^o(&^^ s^oa^rr-^ ^aa clarify 

& / ^. P ^ ^ ^ ^ J&23: Board Standing Orders which 
are all equal to law: S. O. 41, 47 Section 5: '...enabling 
Collector or other officer empowered by the Collector 
theTahsildarofthe Taluk to realise...' This is not being 
altered. 

ao^^ departments ss ̂ os3oaoo^D /̂ ^̂  ô p clause sy*% sr^^ 

The subsequent clause refers to other departments,and 
not to the Revenue Department where there are Deputy 
Tahsildars and... 

5 W PM/a/aTMa/vf F^A:a^^ar/M: That subsequent 
clause must be deleted. This refers to the Revenue De
partment only. 

tSn /̂. %M%:%f<3 jRao: Please listen to me. The refe-
rance to the other departments has come because they are 
already exercising these Powers. gsSyaa normals "Revenue'' 

s*(R. ŝ a recovery of Revenue s*o43 ̂ sh^erco a,^^5*^ ^o^o 
g ^ ^<a. It is only to recognise this fact that this is being 
brought here. I also undertake on behalf of the Govern
ment that no one below the rank of a Tahsildar will ever 
"be allowed to exercise these powers. 

^ d&S). KrR*5a : M agRan* dear rr deRue TScRgR^ 

Jin* ? 

^rf X. Hs^a^a jRao : O n behaF of the House I a m 
undertaking this responsibility. a*as 13 explanation 3*3 



The Madras Rent and Rweiuve Sales 2nd December, f 9Jd /Of 
<and the Madras Revfn^e Recovery 
(Andhra Pyade^h Extension and 
Amendment) BiH, iPJd. 

(^)d^5^ Fyf\"3&: yd) I960 s$ goag^sRo ^dl &o^n* 

^^^ ggajeorr̂  ̂ o^d). y&3 sr̂ o ^̂ y<3o oppose ;3<sa;$ab\&. 

amendment & withdraw ^ a o ^ ^ a a . 

Sir, I beg leave of the House to withdraw by amend
ment. 

(The amendment was by leave of the House withdrawn) 

^^ g^^g^rr coĵ  amendment move ^d^nyas y^ess^ ^ ^ 

^ s ^ srcic ^ ^ 3^ea "any o&cer or class of ofRcers" ̂ co 

s?^ "of not below the rank of a Tahasildar" <sa ̂ a ^ sy/̂ 7r 

^ *3< *3o^&)CP^ : ^^ Board's Standing Order ^aa 

aa^oc d±)?r^^. It is already on record for the last 100 years. 

Board's Standing Order No. 40 Raa3 a^oe* tggana&oa. 

(§) d&S). ?yA"3& : gg^ gsSds&co consequential amend

ments 3&3 <S& ̂ e^ao^^o ^^. 

Mr. g p ^ ^ r : The question is: 

"That clause 4 do stand part of the Bill/' 

The motion was adopted. 

Clause 4 was added to the Bill. 

(&-; & .Ranga%%%t% MMJa/mf Hz ?Ae (%?/;*) 

Mr. C/K?H7?MM r The question is: 

"That Claure 2 do stand part of the Bill/' 



702 2nd December, 7PJS The Madras Rent artd RevfnMe Sa!^ 
and the Madras Revenue Recovery 
(Andhra Pradesh Extens;on and 
Amendment) B;H, 7P3^. 

The motion was adopted. 
Clause 2 was added to the Bill. 

Af/*. (%Hf7M%n : The question is : 

"That Clause 3 do stand part of the Bdl". 

The motion was adopted. 

Clause 3 was added to the Bill. 

C7ans€ 5 

& f % v z M a Gopa/%%ns%K%xya : I beg to move : 

"In sub-clause (ii) of Clause 5 for the words 'District 
Gazette' substitute the words 'Andhra Pradesh Gazette' 
wherever it occurs", 

Mr. CA<w;?iaM: Amendment moved. 

^ ^ ^ o ^ a ^ ^ C o . ^ ^ 33>g93b Sj^^ ^o^^r^a 3^)&^Cb. 

Correspondents Rr*ga ̂ ^ s ^ ^ ^ e3o^??^^. ^ t ^ ̂ ? ? ^ rra 
^ 5 ^^y^t Si^oJ^ SSr^ *3a<3&(5) ̂ a srd) ̂ o&X)^d). ^^*Soo&D 

3**3 n*aa print ̂ c^o ?ra QgR press co print ̂ c^o-ag 3)eo ^(&. 

^ ^ 5 ^*s?$^e^ ssSr^oa a&RRsa^oa cra§ statutory^ 

Gazette notification ŝ sSô  sSthoa. ŝ̂ re3o& e s ^ ^ ^ ^ y^u-co 

eo^ss^gb esR^ga^as S^oo^b ^ ^ a & press ̂  ^ ^ s ^ d ^ 

:6oa)oB*ao. ̂ &y^og&Dr? postpone ^̂ , 15 Ŝ spo ̂ (^y^ ̂t5b\̂ a 

^a eaS^d). {gsr* ̂ g f cp^^5^ ^?S^c?a§a ^^S^^e9. *33o7ves* 

^^o^s^c^ ^er^^^fco g3n*^;§g;$3g ^a56^^o^53^So ^oxn? C " ^ 

?<Eg*^ 3^43lj sr^o^o^a sr^ ^ ^ o ^ ^ . t3$r Gazette eo 

regular^ ^ ^ ^ o ^ s $ ^ 33o%<) M o ^ s ^ ^ %j-^ ^er ^^a^i§ 

^esIS ^a&^e^o^^ &*&^s&c^ ̂ $amendment^ ^ ^ ^ & o ^ ^ . ^ —° o 

^ ^ material^. s*a cpR^ ^ ^ f ^ ^ ^ d s ^ ^ a a ^ 



?he Madras Rent an^ R̂ vent̂ e Sales 2rJ D^cem^er, 7yJ<$ fOJ 
<and th.e Madras Rewrite Recovery 
(Amihra Pradesh Extensjon anJ 
Amen&?^nt) BiM, /P3& 

^)^^D <̂a r<^ issue. <a<da§. 53^5, A,̂  ^^0 3r&&s isoao^oo^ 

^ 3^o tp^egboa. cy^S) ̂ ^^ t^d^^^d)? ooda^* ŝ a QoA^d^ 

^oe^oa. Villagers ̂  *n9d&*oo*Eb ê?- Gazetted "̂ oî s ^^^, 

sa^ss^ Part B. 3 A, 4 A^ 5, 6 ̂ a ao(aoR;$ea ̂ aa^a 5^. ^^ 

^^^fo3 *3son-S3* ^ o ^ ^ o ^ ^ ^ ^ a ^ ^*§F f^df^ ^jaaxr^o. 

3!^^^gcp^ t̂r* ̂g<g*eo organise 3as?^3B. ĝ a 5^syo^ ^^^^ 
Sj-g* s3ey- ^ ^ S)^o33 23^03- R*^og^d&grr8§ *3coa -̂e ^ g f 

notiRoation Ra^s^a, srah?^ ss^a^^as escc^^o^a ^^g^^^ao 

^^eo ôio?6 Qoe3 aoo(Sb s^^cfao ^o-^^d). sgou*^^ 5) 4 gyms? ^ ^ 

r*^^ a ^ f ^if ̂  gj-^ Id^^a^a ^o ga^a ^a. ^o<^3& 

^aa withdraw ^ a r ^ a a sr̂ a §̂ 03̂ o?ŷ a. ^sr ^^*eo ĝ RF** 

^ 3*as7*o / r ^ o ^ ^ ^ g : ye ^&o^d withdraw 3a 
gboaassMa. 

I b g leave of the House to withdraw m y amendment. 

The amendment was, by leave of the House,withdrawn 

<SW %?w/a/% Cop^/^r/^A^^y^ : I beg to move ; 

"In sub-section (a) of Section t4 (a) proposed, delete 
the words 'as in accordance with religious usage'." 

M-. CAafwiaM : Amendment moved. 

r*a^^ ^ o ^ aowapg^aa 3d^ ^a ^_5aoa. r^a^^d 

RegrRco ornament §^o^ B ^ g&osr^. ^, asra^ a:dx)§^Hcra-

shsbx̂  cool) ^ encroachment #s%-g J^^sy*^ ^ eao^a ^ a 

^^^SjB^ ^a sxD&x)§̂ a-a§ boo^^o^ s§c&af33S ^?^ds&a g^: 

s5r*&oa*a. 



V%W .2nJPecem%6f, ^9J^ T ^ Madras jRenf and Ret-en̂ e 5 a ^ 
and the Madras Revenue Recovery 

(And^ra Pradesh Extension %%% 
Amendment) BtH^ JW#. 

insolvaney petition ^)c&Doa. ^o^ao^* o& (Xr^d3oo ̂ s^ 
$)eo^o&rao ^ o ^ 3 ^ cred.top S^^o^^^?? ^ ^ ^ 5 ^ j ^ sr55 

dif&cu!ties ̂ 0 ^ 0 ^ . aa ̂ ^ ^ 0 ^ ^o^^cro. W e have to take 
the other property and not the whote thing. ^&s<xD 3aop*§. 

sr<s?v ^o<noaa. Estate Land Act ̂  ^ ^ ^ e ^ ;&oa. ^00^ 

^ 7 - ^ ^ , wedding rings ^5o RRaaS^gRa. ^od^g n*^o^ 

State ss loss ̂  ^g^s^d^ ^^g* ^ o A ^ e o ^ ^ a^gaaa y^^ 

Mr, CA^frw^ : The question is : 

"In sub-secticn (a) of Section 14 (a) proposed deiete 
the words 'as in accordance with religious usage'/' 

The amendment was negatived. 

6W %zw/%/% C ^ ^ / ^ ^ w / ? ^ ^ ^ ; I beg to move: 

"Add the foHowing at the end of sub-section (a) of 
Section 14 (a) proposed 'and ornament of the children 
beiow 12 years of age'." 

Afr. CA#W77M?M : Amendment moved. 

^ a*a<ro ^ ^ o ^ d ^ g : la ̂ ^ e r &^o F ^ g ^ 

asSsTgRRB e-̂ ^̂ sSoo ^^&. ^ a ^tr *3ogap*5§7r5S r?a, Krgo 7?3 

^^&o77-^. <3o<R3o:$0*& -̂80 ^5?Sh&a ^ ( R ) , 5T5S &066 ^<^. 

eo<s$^^ a<9o;5o?(a ̂ d5§ ^^d&(&. ̂ d)e ?$ô a 39000a* M<y*aoB*o. 

12 ^OHC ^ ^ ) ^ 3)Ry ^^^ a^o(5bo5 ^?oo^$D ^ioo^g &r-g<R ̂ X) 

i$r oooc^^, ^ o g ^ ^ o ^000 ^sr^/a. sr53 S*ŝ o ̂ Moo^oX) ^ ^ 

5*3 a3j*eo ts^^o ̂ er*^a e ^ ^ o ^ O . *a%s*5 *2of̂  ^ ^ 

y?ooo^oo &^ 12 !3%^ ̂ e *3of̂  ^*^ n-ag ^&r*y3oo^ ̂ (3o. 

Destraint^ ̂ ps3bra)^ property ^oa^o!) g*̂ o g ^ ^a gap 

^o^3 ^^^-co oooo^^ ^^^$?oo3. tggea 12 ̂  ^o^S 1 ^ 3**)gS 

j)$r ^ ^ o & ? ^ 0 ^ 0 ^ ^ oar* XSgRsa n?gd^ors* ̂ ^03. 



The Madras Rent and Revenue Saies 2nd December, ZP33 / M 
and the Madras Revenue Recovery 
(Andhra Pradesh Extension and 
Amendment) B^t, 7P3(?. 

Afr. CA^frw^M : The question is : 

"Add the following at the end of Sub-section (a) of 
Section 14 (a) proposed and ornaments of the Children 
below 12 years of age". 

The amendment was negatived. 

*SW %zw/a/<2 G^^/^^r/jA^^yy^ : Sir, I beg to move. 

For sub-section (b) of section 14 (A) proposed substi
tute the following : 

"His ploughs implements of husbandry, one pair 
plough cattle and one milking cattle and cattle shed to 
provide the above cattle such manner seedgrain and 
grain of one week provision stocked by the defaulter 
or on his behalf by his cultivator as may be necessary 
for due cultivation of his lands in the ensuing year". 

Afr. C/MH/7M%M : Amendment moved. 

€3̂ $? ^J^ ^x-dg'aDa* &o^j^d:lr? $?r^ ŝ rSysy&3 r^3 &o#^). ^rs^eo 

^ e ^ ^ d & ^ & 3 3 ŝ ^ 83^ ^%3, B^^3 ^ 3 i ^ ^ sS&^crco &o^y"oa). For 

example cattle shed is an immovable property not a 
movable property and cannot be attached except under 
another procedure. 3a srer* er̂ Trr cr̂ xa ̂ <3&a3oa.5*8? 14—& 

ga^3;§aa 3*3(3* *̂3o?7 ^^^!T33 69S3s*%"s&)o!̂  5$^y^& ^ebsro. 

&o^c^3 ^oo^^d) ̂ ^ d ) -ao(R&* ̂ 7? ^ ^ i 3 M 3^d^*^^ 

^7<o^) ^ c $ ^ Q ^ ooc^3 gy-^ <3Xo;§) ̂ d&5:e^&oa. ood3 ^ o ^ ^ * § 



706 2nd December, 7P3d The Madras Rent and Revenue Sa!M 

and the Madras Revenue Recovery 
(Andhra Pradesh Extension and 
Amendment) BtH, 7PJ^. 

&^oo^ ^d) "g^r^^^S i)sa Rccfas. ^) ̂ y^ 1)o$:^(r^7rCo sre 

(€j &. ^o^dc&g : goRx^* ^r^e, *3o^ ̂ ^^^^ ^.^o^ 

^)5o^ ^r-^ t^Rog'sSoa d^^a. 

6rf ̂  ^7?^f^ Rao : It is not on the list. 

^o^g^>o^ ^)oc3Sb^. ^oa^?vco o*aa &j^F"<iera3 ^ ^ o ^ ^ ^ o ^ 

'̂ j ̂  ^o5^ocy'B& : y g go&*3 S3^o^ S^syO. 

^ ^ ^ d J g i ) , 6 J d ^ ^ g o 3os)0(gt)^^? <9R^O)3'<5* ^ ^ 5 S S 

^ 1, *3oy&m^^) : ^ w ^ J ^ a"ia ^ ^ S ^ ̂ ^ & o ^ ^$r t 

a^dSroo 33&*an*o. 

^f P̂ vf/a/̂ r C^p^ArfjA^^yy^ : I beg leave of the 
House to withdraw m y amendment. 

(The amendment was by leave of the House withdrawn) 

3W %zvf/#/% Gcp%/%%rfFAH%yy% : I move : 
" Add the following as a new clause 6 and renumber 

the remaining clauses: 



The Md&ds Rent and Revere Sct!e5 J?nJ December, 7^J^ 70^ 
and the Madras Revenue Recovery 
(Amihra Pradesh Extension and 
Anendment) BiH, 7PJ^. 

" Rules so made under sub-clause (iv) (v) of clause 5 
and the next (old six and new seven) clause shall be placed 
on the Table of the House and the House may amend or 
repeal withm Rfteen days of their placement. " 

yxSRRa^oda 1)&*§ S^^Ej-cr *5co^bc5. QOsf^^^ s$̂ aogj?o ^^b^J 

SrfA^. %M%#;%.7?<30.' i he amendment is not regular 
and properly drafted. O n behalf cf the Government, I 
shall move a legally drafted amendment. I move: 

"For sub-clause (v) of clause 5 of the Bill, substitute 
the following, namely— 

(v) after section 60, the following section shall be 
inserted, namely— 

60-A: Power to make rules— (I) The State Govern
ment may, by notification in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette, 
make rules to carry out the purposes of this Act. 

(2) All rules made under this section shall, as soon 
as may be after they are made, be laid on the Table of the 
Legislative Assembly, and shall be subject to such modiS-
cations, whether by way of repeal or amendment, as the 
Assembly may make within fourteen days thereafter during 
the session in which they are so laid/' 

Afr. $9<?%&<?;': 'Amendment moved. 

(The amendment was, by leave of the House, with
drawn,) 

)§ *§ ISoS'ac*^: ^ & a*g aRd&o 33*^0. 9^-# i ^ & n * 

^ " & , ĝ g*̂  ̂ $5J 3*3,), g)o^O^ ^ 8 3 ^ ^ losin &:&i^S), s*433 3*g 



MR 2nd December, 7933 The Madras Rent and Revenue Sates 
and the Madias Revenue Recovery 
(Andhra fradesh Extension and 
Amendment) BiH, VP3& 

(̂  1. *3o^<^^^) : <s3 !)<3<R. 

^ ^ D ^ o ^ ^ o ^ ^ d & g : ^5" a^aaF. 

r̂f ̂  M ^ ^ ^ ^ 7?^o : The hon Member said about 
one week's food grains. W e have no objection even for 
15 days. 

Nr. $9<?#A-'Y : The question is : 

"For sub-clause (̂ ) of clause 5 of the Bill, substitute 
the following, namely -

'(v) after section 60, the following section shall be 
inserted, namely— 

'60-A : Power to make rules- (!) The State Govern
ment may, by notification in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette, 
make rules to carry out the purposes of this Act. 

(2) All rules made under this section shall, as soon as 
may be after they are made, be laid on the Table of the 
Legislative Assembly, and shall be subject to such modi6-
cations, whether by way of repeal or amendment, as the 
Assembly may make within fourteen days thereafter dunng 
the session in whLh they are so laid'/' 

The amendment was adopted. 

Afr. C/?#?w?<3?:: The question is : 

That clause 3 as amended do stand part of the Bill. 

The motion was adopted. 

Clause 5 as amended was added to the Bill. 

CVaMse 6 

$r; M . Magf R?&[y : Sir, I beg to move. 

In line 8 of clause 6 delete the words "ormodiaca* 
tions" 

Mr. CA%H7M%M : Amendment moved. 

SW Af. Wagf R<?&(y : 'Modifications' oa ^ c ^ a^a-



The Mddrds Rent and Revenue Sales 2rd December, 7PJg /09 
and the Madras Revenue Recovery 
(Andhra Pradesh Extens^n and 
Amendment) BtH, 793d. 

i3c&g^g). ^o^go ^modiScations' s& s:̂ 5D ̂ adoptations' 

& TS^oS) l3go gĝ eaĝ  ^ ^ g p ^ ^ & . 

^ f ^. %nA:<zf% ̂ o : This is only to remove a diffi

culty. This is not a regular Rule. 33y& oxr *Bo^ Acts s*sos& 

& ^ o ye)g ĝ-ty difBcuhy g ^ exercise ̂ c^a-M gref^ &g 

^prfg&^ooa. ^a transitory clause. gar&a go^^cr^gs gr^^&o 

^o^oa. Interim period <&* ̂ ^ ^ ^ r^^ &o&Doa. ga ^gan 

^ c&o. ?ya*3& : 'Adoptations' e^gra ^ o t protec

tion ̂  sy*n- ga&^&oa. 

(#) "3. *3oS*&)CP̂ ): 'Adoptation' ^D?r 'modifications' 

^^!? Hr*§^6b^) "Sa^ ̂  gb^)-^) ̂ 3 goâ -L-l̂  ^d*o 5s^srd). ^ ooo^\oa 

;§g^o<3>geg cxoa ̂ o ^ ^o ̂ gg^"3oga. 

Afr. CTmfrMMM : The question is : 

"In line 8 of clause 6 delete the 'words or modifi
cations'/' 

The amendment was negatived. 

5 W M . <Magi jReJJy : Sir, I beg to move. 

(1) "In the proviso to sub-clause 1 of clause 6 for the 
words ' three years' substitute the words ' two years' ". 

(2) "In the proviso 10 sub-clause 1 of clause 6 for the 
words 'three years' substitute the words 'one year'/' 

Mr. C%%H7M#M : Amendment moved. 

r§; d&o. 3"R*Sa : SoRbS* " 3 gog^yrco " tsD 6gj,a. ^ 

JUs-S^g^. *3j*a&*ga;$^gS cur *' 3 goggyreo *' ^ g ^ ̂ D e 3 ^ ̂ o ^ 

§^<$eag ^gg^o gdSo o-̂ g) 13o^ gog^yroSSrra. a,̂  g o g ^ u - M 

y?S) ̂ aotyoD !3g3 §^d)&ty^g3. 

§^s*0? s;o^gc g ^ ^l)f aiBsr &o"&, ̂ 1§ ̂ gy^od^g^. T h e 



770 2nd Decembei, 7P3^ The Madias Rent and Ret̂ enMe Sate^ 
and the Madras Revenue Recovery 
(Andhra Pradesh Extension and 
Amendment) BtH, 7P3d. 

House adopted all the integration Acts and the Adoptation 
Acts - 69̂ 3 I^ShjR 30^3335 *2)r^. 

cr*̂  3"oo ^ 3 ^S$)&o5 RXBSf, o^6^^o ^5^?y^ ^^Pco ^o"&, ^ S ^ 

^p^r^^r-^§ ^o5^ ^s-5 3^oo aoabar. axp^gor^ '*3 ^os6^trjo *" 

a&3 l^^r°&^. 

Afr. CA^/r/M^ : I shaH put amendments 16 & 17 to 
vote. The question is : 

(t) " In the proviso to sub-clause 1 of clause 6 for 
the words ' three years' substitute the worJs ' two years'. 

(2) " In the proviso to sub-clause 1 of clause 6 for 
the words ' three years' substitute the words ' one year'." 

The amendments were negatived. 

Mf. (%3frfy?<3H: The question is : 

" That clause 6 do stand part of the Bill. " 

The motion was adopted. 

Clause 6 was added to the Bill. 

C7%MK? 7 

Mr. C/2(H/7?i#H : The question is : 

"That Clause 7 do stand part of the Bill/' 

The amendment was adopted. 

Clause 7 was added to the Bill. 



The Madras Rent and Revenue Sates 2nd December, J9.% /// 
and the Madras Revenue Recovery 
(Andhra Pradesh Extension and 
Amendment) BtH, 7P35 

Mf. CAaMwa/i . The question is: 
"'That Clause 8 do stand part of the BiH " 

The amendment was adopted. 
Clause 8 was added to the BiH. 

A/f. CAjff/Ka/?: The question is: 

"That Clause 1 do stand part of the BiH." 

The amendment was adopted. 

Cause 1 was added to the BiH. 

Afr CAaMvua??: The question is: 

"That the Preamble do s and part of the BiH." 

The amendment was adopted. 

The Preamble was added to the Bill. 

<SW ̂ f. %/?%;af<2 jR#o . I move : 

"That the Madras Rent and Revenue Sales ^nd th 
Madras Rev^ nue Recovery (Andhra Pradesh Extension and 
Amendment) BiH, 1958 b; read a third time and passed'.' 

(f%MS2) 

Nr. C M r m a n : The question is: 

"That the Madras Rent and Revenue Sales and the 
Madras Revenue Recovery (Andhra Pradesh Extension and 
Amendment) BiH, 1958 be read a third time and passed." 

The amendment was adopted. 

The House then adjourned till Nine of the Clock 
on Wednesday, the 3rd December 1958. 




